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Ophiel writes this, in his lesson five, of his; Astral Projection Course: “Therefore, give some attention to this idea of Light.
In the Little System work, you ‘see’ the counterpart station objects by the Inner Light or Astral Light, as it is called.” End
quote.

 

#6, is the ‘counterpart’ to/of/for, whatever is ‘before’ it?

#5, is the ‘counterpart’ to/of/for #6!

#4, is the ‘counterpart’ to/of/for #5!

#2, is the ‘counterpart’ to/of/for #4!

#1, is the ‘counterpart’ to/of/for #2!

#0, is the ‘counterpart’ to/of/for #1!

#3, is a ‘construct’! and does not ‘count’!

 

Counterparts are ‘copies’ and are therefore = always lower!?! The ‘counterpart station’ that you, the ‘projector/operator’ and
#3, ego body, are ‘observing’, is the ‘copy’ of the ‘station’, from the Astral Station = above, over, higher, before and in-
front!?! 

 

Here it is, from Ophiel, from his first book: Astral Projection, his chapter: Little System:

 

“As I said before you have always lived in and used these other bodies all your life. Actually, you know, unconsciously, how
to use the other bodies so this is not what you learn to do. What you do learn to do is to transfer your conscious-ness to these
other bodies and RETAIN MEMORY of the transfer.” End quote.

 

Then, farther on, we read this part; “When you WORK on or SEE any part of yourself, you are working or seeing thru the
body ‘above’ that body. So, in this case you are transferring down and not up.” End quote. 

 

In order to ‘RETAIN MEMORY’; the ‘emphasis’ is on; Psychological Tactile-Feeling, Defining, Three-Dimensional-ism!?! 

 

In the Little System work, you ‘see’ the counterpart station objects by the Inner Light or Astral Light, as it is called = Seeing
= in/on the #2, Etheric Plane is ‘done’ by/with/thru = Reflection!

 

In the Cosmic Egg work, you ‘see’ the counterpart station objects by the Inner Light or Astral Light, as it is called = Seeing
= in/on the #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane is ‘done’ by/with/thru = Tactile-Feeling!

 

In the Physical work, you ‘see’ the counterpart station objects by the Inner Light or Astral Light, as it is called = Seeing =
in/on the #0, Outer, Outer Physically Physical Plane is ‘done’ by/with thru = USE, USED, USING! 



 

The present writer’s grandparents, on their mother’s side, were both ‘deaf and dumb’, but they still ‘used’ the/their #0, Outer,
outer physically physical plane? Also, the present writer’s aunt, on their father’s side, went ‘blind’, but they still  ‘ used’
the/their #0, Outer, outer physically physical plane?

 

REFLECTION! = Is ‘how’ = CONSCIOUS-NESS = SEES!?! = IN/ON THE/YOUR #2, PLANE!

TACTILE-FEELING! = Is ‘how’ = CONSCIOUS-NESS = SEES!?! = IN/ON THE/YOUR #1, PLANE!

USE, USED, USING! = Is ‘how’ = CONSCIOUS-NESS = SEES!?! = IN/ON THE/YOUR #0, PLANE!

 

Each one is the ‘counterpart’ to the Plane = above, over, higher, before and in-front!?! 

Each counterpart is a ‘copy’ in/on the Plane = below, under, lower, after and behind!?! 

 

Unless and until, you = conscious-ness = sense/tactilely-feel = these things = in the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades body/self,
then it will/shall ‘take time’, to learn ‘how’ to ‘transfer’ your ‘conscious-ness’ and ‘remember it!?!’

 

As I said before you have always lived in and used these other bodies all your life. Actually, you know, unconsciously, how
to use the other bodies so this is not what you learn to do. What you do learn to do is to transfer your conscious-ness to these
other bodies and RETAIN MEMORY of the transfer. = 

In the basic cosmic egg exercise, you, the practitioner, transfer your conscious-ness = to = the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades
= tactile-feeling-body!?! You, #0, outer, outer physically physical body ‘relax’, and enter Ophiel’s = NEITHER STATE =
condition of not asleep and not awake!?! (Dream Method). 

 

Once you = conscious-ness = are ‘there’ = in the/your dark-ness, black-ness, blind-ness = you = conscious-ness = tactilely-
feel = the/your five basic elemental forces symbols = within you, about you and surrounding you = #1 and #0!?! This is the
basic cosmic egg exercise!?! 

 

Egg = whole body!

Sphere = head!

Inverted Pyramid = torso!

Bowl = hips/pelvis/crotch!

Cube = thighs/legs/feet! 

 

You, the operator,  tactilely-feel,  define,  three-dimensional-ise,  symbol-ise the five basic tattva,  and they (basic tattva) =
BECOME = FEEL = AS ‘REAL’!?! = AS YOU!! = #0, Outer, outer physically physical YOU!?! = WHO ARE ‘DOING’
THE ‘EXERCISE’!?! Ophiel then writes:

 

The object of the Little System is to prepare you for the sensations and movements you will meet, which are, of course,
entirely different from Physical Plane movements. = The object of the Basic Cosmic Egg Exercise, is to prepare you for the
sensations and  tactile-feelings you  will  meet,  which are,  of  course,  entirely  different  from Physical Plane movements.
Physical Plane ‘movements’ are = use, used, using!?! Which is ‘not!’, the ‘same as’ = tactilely-feeling!?!



 

Visualising a ‘new car’ is ‘not!’, the ‘same as’ using a ‘new car’ = NO MATTER HOW YOU EXPLAIN IT = IT IS ‘NOT!’
THE SAME THING!?! And! If you think/feel that it  is!?! Small ‘wonder?’, that your ‘occult’ doesn’t ‘work/operate’ for
you!?! 

 

Tactilely-Feeling a ‘new car’ is ‘not!’, the ‘same as’ using a ‘new car’ = NO MATTER HOW YOU EXPLAIN IT = IT IS
‘NOT!’ THE SAME THING!?! And! If you think/feel that it is!?! Small ‘wonder?’, that your ‘occult’ doesn’t ‘work/operate’
for you!?!

 

Here is an ‘occult truth’(?), that is ‘wasted’ on many, but hopefully, not on you, the reader(?), here is what Ophiel, a little
farther on, writes on the same page: 

 

“ONE DAY THE TWO BODIES WILL FUSE INTO ONE BODY AND YOU WILL OPEN ANOTHER KIND OF AN
EYE AND YOU WILL FIND THAT YOU ARE REALLY THERE IN THE ETHERIC BODY FOR REAL AT THE
SAME TIME YOU WILL BE CONSCIOUS OF THE PHYSICAL BODY TOO AND YOU WILL KNOW THAT YOU
ARE DUAL AND CAN AND DO FUNCTION IN BOTH BODIES AT ONCE.” End Quote. 

 

Please study carefully, this ‘occult truth’, as this can make all the ‘difference’ to your ‘work’!?!

 

YOUR #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES BODY = HAS ‘ALREADY’ FUSED INTO THE ONE BODY!?! = THE/YOUR
#0, OUTER, OUTER PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL BODY!?! AND THAT IS ‘WHY’!?! YOU, THE READER, SHOULD
TEST, TRY AND  USE, THE/YOUR BASIC COSMIC EGG EXERCISE = IN ORDER FOR YOU = #0 &+ #3 =  TO
REALISE THIS FACT!?! 

 

When you start/begin the/your basic cosmic egg exercise, you are beginning to develop/enhance you ‘latent’ psychological
tactile-feeling-body!?! After a while of ‘practice’, and your ‘latent ability’, there is/will ‘come’, a very ‘definite’ sensation
of, the/your #0, outer, outer physically physical body ‘as a projection of!?!’ the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades body!?! Don’t
look for it!?! Let it ‘come’ to you = Conscious-ness!?! 

 

Ophiel next writes: 

 

“Now I believe I will give you a little more information about the Etheric Plane here and its importance. As you know, the
Etheric Plane is the plane next to us and the plane that we are most closely associated with. This, of course, is the plane that
you are going to use the Little System on and as you use the Little System and progress in it, why you may find yourself
someday suddenly  becoming  awake, right  in  the  middle  of  one of  your trips  and you will  be  in  your  Etheric  Body-
consciousness. And you are going to be surprised and pleased, but the object of this whole Little System is to train you to get
used to the funny feeling that you are going to have when you enter an Inner Plane and realise it for the first time.” End
quote.

 

In the above quoted paragraph, from Ophiel, you would think that most readers would have ‘grasped’, that Ophiel’s system,
is a #2, Etheric Plane System, and that the Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic Chair exercises, are a #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades
System = Both systems are ‘projection’ systems, but each one ‘deals with’ each plane, and each one ‘complements’ each
plane, that it ‘partners with?’. 



 

No matter how many times the present writer ‘presents it’, no matter how many times the present writer ‘points it out’, there
is/are  many, many, many  ‘occultists’,  who ‘deny?’,  ‘refute?’  and ‘dispute?’,  that  ‘projecting’  to  the/their  #1,  malkuth
earth/hades plane is ‘not possible?’  = BECAUSE IT IS ‘NOT THERE!?!’  = well,  well,  well!  If! If! The #1, malkuth
earth/hades plane is ‘NOT THERE!?!’, for them!! Then, for them, it is ‘NOT THERE!?!’, END OF DISCUSSION!?! (Move
along  please!  There’s  nothing  to  see  here!?!)  Its  like  speaking  to  those  who  say;  that  there  is  ‘NO  ETHERIC
PROJECTING!?!’, THAT IT IS ‘ALL’ JUST ‘DREAMS!?!’ And yet? That is not what Ophiel writes, in his vignette: An
Exercise in Pre-liminary Projection: 

 

“I am going to ask and wonder if there is not some kind of ‘sub-plane,’ a ‘sub-Etheric Plane,’ which is very close to the
physical, but which is neither physical nor Etheric. It has been suggested that the planes between the “Real” Earth and the
“Real” Etheric could be the Elemental Planes of the Elements. And it is possible to project to these planes, a fact which I had
never seriously considered before this time. I suppose it could be considered one of my failings that I don’t cognise a thing
until I fit it in somewhere, somewhere into my workings, and when once a  working place appears, then I recognise/re-re-
recognise  the  whole  and  reorganise  the  set-up  all  over  again.  Such is  what  happened here  when I  held up the ‘non-
orientation’ of myself long enough to discover/rediscover that this was taking place on another kind of plane than formerly I
had functioned on. End quote.

 

Study the yellow highlights above, from Ophiel’s quote, this is the basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercise. It is vitally
important, that you, the reader, put it to the ‘test’ and ‘try’ it, then ‘use’ it = Do you, can you = #0 &+ #3 = develop/enhance
= your psychological #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades =  tactile-feeling =  SO THAT YOU #0 &+ #3 =  CAN ‘BELIEVE!?!’ =
the/your #2, VISUALISATIONS!?! = SO THAT YOU = #0 &+ #3 = CAN ‘USE’, ‘USED’, ‘USING’ THEM!?!

 

IN THE YELLOW HIGHLIGHTS ABOVE, OPHIEL HAS COME TO THE ‘REALISATION’, THAT THERE ‘IS!?!’
A/AN ‘OTHER’ ACTUAL, FACTUAL, LITERAL PLANE TO WHICH, HE WAS NOT FULLY COGNISANT OF AND
WHICH ‘HAD BEEN SUGGESTED’ = COULD BE = THE ELEMENTAL PLANES = OF THE ELEMENTS. (See/read
Dion Fortune; Chapter X, Malkuth Earth; Mystical Qabalah.) If you = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades =  Do not tactilely-feel =
That the #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades ‘Exists’? = Then you = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades = will/shall/does = actually, factually,
literally = DELIVER THAT TO THE/YOUR #0, Outer, outer physically physical = life/living/life style!?! IRRESPECTIVE
OF THE ‘CONSEQUENCES’ TO/FOR YOU = #0 &+ #3!?! (See/read Ophiel’s book: Contacting the Demiurge, and read
about Ophiel’s ‘drunk’, rolling in the ‘gutter’, and his ‘suffering from lack/poverty’ because of ordering the Demiurge, to do
just that!?!)

 

Now I believe I will give you a little more information about the Etheric Plane here and its importance. As you know, the
Etheric Plane is the plane next to us and the plane that we are most closely associated with. This, of course, is the plane that
you are going to use the Little System on and as you use the Little System and progress in it, why you may find yourself
someday suddenly  becoming  awake, right  in  the  middle  of  one of  your trips  and you will  be  in  your  Etheric  Body-
consciousness. And you are going to be surprised and pleased, but the object of this whole Little System is to train you to get
used to the funny feeling that you are going to have when you enter an Inner Plane and realise it for the first time  = The
‘Plane’ next to us = #0 &+ #3 = IS! = THE #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES = PSYCHOLOGICAL TACTILE-FEELING-
PLANE!?! Knowing, accepting, understanding of this plane = will/shall/does = speed up? = hasten? = facilitate? = your #2,
Etheric projection/projecting!?! 

 

Also, there is nothing! stopping you, the reader, from using all three planes ‘together’ at the one/same time!?! 

 

You ‘do/practice’ your ‘route/stations’ #0!



You ‘tactilely-feel’ your ‘route/stations’ #1!

You ‘visualise’ your ‘route/stations’ #2!

You ‘observe’ your ‘route/stations’ #3!

 

The ‘connection/pull’ of the/your #1, on the your #0, will be/shall be = very compelling!?!

The ‘connection/pull’ of the/your #1, on the your #2, will be/shall be = very compelling!?!

The ‘connection/pull’ of the/your #1, on the your #3, will be/shall be = very compelling!?!

 

For all this, is delivered unto me #1, and to, whomsoever I #1, chooses to give it back to!?! It is when your #3, takes all the
‘credit?’, all the ‘plaudits?’, all the ‘benefits?’, of/from the #1, and thinks = this is me (#3), this is me (#3) = I, (#3), am
‘doing’ all this!?!  = THIS IS THE ‘CRASH & BURN’ SYNDROME = that ancient folk lore and ancient mythology write
about and which, in the old crazy book (Bible), refer to, as the ‘sin’ of being ‘PROUD’!?! 

 

Proud (adjective),  is where the  word ‘pride = noun’ comes from; in Old English,  the  word; Proud/Prud/Prute  = means
excellent;  splendid; arrogant; haughty; which is from the Late Latin; prode = advantageous/profitable; which is a back-
formation of the Latin ‘prodesse = be useful’; from ‘pro = before, for, instead of’; From the Proto-Indo-European Root word;
per = forward, in front of, before, first, chief + esse = to be (From the PIE Root word; es = to be.) 

 

So, it is the #1, malkuth earth/hades tactile-feeling = who is forward, in front, before, first, chief = to be!?! It is the #3, Ego
body, who ‘takes the credit’ unto themselves!?! And when this ‘situation’ gets out of ‘hand = tactile-feeling!?!’ = we/you =
get/have = crash & burn!?! To ‘combat this’, the worthy ancients, made ‘mankind’, a kind of ‘grovelling worm!?!’ who must
be  ‘servile’  to  the  ‘Will/Desire/Want/Need/Brooding’  of  =  GOD!?!  Later,  that  became  their  ‘sanctimonious/religious’
moralistic ‘shite!?!’ (Which has never worked(?), from day one!?!) Ophiel, then writes: 

 

“There’s nothing dangerous about the Little System. It was designed to be absolutely safe and in addition to that, there just
aren’t any real aggressive energies of any kind on the Little System so you won’t even be bothered by those: Actually the
worst thing that can happen is that for you to become visible to somebody else when you are making one of your journeys
and they will think that are seeing a ghost and they will start screaming bloody murder. So again, I say that is about the
worse that can happen, but of course, if that does happen you know you are making some progress.” End quote.

 

There is nothing dangerous about the Basic Cosmic Egg Exercise. It is presented to be absolutely safe, and in addition to
that,  there  just  aren’t  any  real  aggressive  energies  of  any  kind  in  the  Basic  Cosmic  Egg  exercise,  as  it  simply  for
developing/enhancing your personal/individual ‘ability’, to tactilely-feel, define, three-dimensional-ise, symbol-ise = YOUR
#2 VISUALISATIONS!?!

 

There is nothing dangerous about the Basic Cosmic Egg Exercise. It is presented to be absolutely safe, and in addition to
that,  there  just  aren’t  any  real  aggressive  energies  of  any  kind  in  the  Basic  Cosmic  Egg  exercise,  as  it  simply  for
developing/enhancing your personal/individual ‘ability’, to tactilely-feel, define, three-dimensional-ise, symbol-ise = YOUR
#0 WANTS!?! NEEDS!?! DESIRES!?! BROODINGS!?! 

 

#2 TO #1!

#0 TO #1!



#1 TO #2!

#1 TO #0

 

The/your psychological tactile-feeling = belief, believe, believed, believing!?! = IS THE ‘GATE-WAY’!?! = And this, is the
‘perfect place’, where to start!?! 

 

Thank you. 


