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The previous monologue/post/message, was to give those individuals, who are not yet ‘projectors’, the ‘idea’, that when/if
they ‘project’, that they are in ‘no-way’ = connected = in the ‘ordinary sense’ of the/their #0, outer, outer physically physical
world = conscious-ness = ideas!?! In/on the/their #0, outer, outer physically physical plane = YOU = CONSCIOUS-NESS =
CAN ONLY! ONLY! = USE, USED, USING!?! 

 

YOU  =  CONSCIOUS-NESS  =  CANNOT/DO  NOT  =  CHANGE/ALTER =  THE/YOUR  #0,  OUTER,  OUTER
PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL PLANE!?! (Please put this to the ‘test’!?!) ANY ‘CHANGE!?!’ = HAS TO COME FROM!?! =
THE/YOUR #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES = PSYCHOLOGICAL TACTILE-FEELING-PLANE!

 

BUT…  THIS  KNOWING/KNOWLEDGE  =  WILL  NOT/CANNOT/DOES  NOT!?!  =  STOP THINGS FROM
HAPPENING!?! = TO YOU!?! #0!?! BUT… IT DOES/SHOULD(?), HELP/ASSIST YOU GREATLY, WHEN EVER, IF
EVER, YOU GET TO MAKE ‘IT’ = NOTICE YOU = #0 = CONSCIOUS-NESS!?! 

 

Here is how Ophiel writes it, from his vignette: Getting Material Things: 

 

“To start  this  essay broadly  and  then  to  narrow it  down is  my intention.  Firstly,  just  how far-much  can Inner  Plane
‘workings’ influence the outer Physical Plane? The answer is, in general, some? To a precise point, no! By that, I mean it is
possible by using Inner Plane Power to effect changes on the outer Material Plane, but not directly, and only within certain
very special limits, and not often instantaneously. I know this is rather disappointing news for those who are in physical need
and want to turn to the inner Planes for assistance on this physical plane and who need help at once. All things are relative to
each other in time and space (Earth time and Earth space.) and you must start sometime, go on from the starting point, and
grow into the use of Occult Knowledge, leading to Power. But, please remember physical action is needed to supplement
occult WORKINGS. We all would love to have a direct control over dear old Matter, and I know of one instance of DIRECT
INFLUENCE ON MATTER, but I’m afraid, one not very usable or practical.” End quote.

 

The ‘start/beginning’  must be with you = #0, Outer, outer physically physical you &+ #3, Ego body, present incarnation,
personality you!?! You =  Conscious-ness = must reach out and psychologically  tactilely-feel = your ‘other’ you/self, #1,
malkuth earth/hades ‘body’, and you BOTH = #1 and #0 = MUST-AGREE! For the present writer, when ‘enter’ the dark-
ness, black-ness, blind-ness; their ‘conscious-ness’ is located = above and behind, slightly over to the left side = of the back-
of-their #1, malkuth earth/hades, head! (See/read previous posts/messages/monologues about the basic cosmic egg exercise.) 

 

When the present writer falls back, from the/their #2, etheric plane, they ‘consciously’ (knowingly/deliberately) fall back
into the/their ‘black-ness’, and then ‘consciously’  surface into conscious-ness,  in/on the/their  #0, outer, outer physically
physical plane/body! Here it is, from Ophiel, from his first book: Astral Projection:

 

“REGARDING THE COLOUR ON THE COVER: The colours on the cover of this book are the colours you will “see” just
before you “break thru” into the Astral Plane with your newly developed clairvoyant Inner sight gained thru the work given
in this book. 

When you “see” these colours you will know you are making progress. The first thing to appear is the solid back. 

Then the colours begin to appear thru the black as is shown where the colours are lined in-between with black. The black
then thins out and away and the colours become more brilliant and finally burst out into the blinding pure white Astral



Light.” End quote.

 

Also, it might be, that there ‘appears’ a ‘soft glow’, as you close your eyes, in a darkened room, as you prepare to fall asleep.
But, the ‘back-drop?’ to/of/for the/this ‘light’, at this ‘level’, is the invisible = black-on-black = black-astral-light!?! = The
first thing to appear is the solid back!?! Closing the/your #0, outer, outer physically physical eyes = is not! = the black-ness,
dark-ness,  blind-ness, that the worthy ancients talked about and/or wrote about!?! Nor is the dark-ness, black-ness,  blind-
ness, #0, outer, outer physically physical!?! It is a ‘psychological’ black-ness, dark-ness,  blind-ness =  AND YOU! = the
operator/occultist = MUST ‘ENTER IT’ = KNOWINGLY = DELIBERATELY!?! 

 

If you ‘happen’ to ‘enter’ = the/your #2, etheric plane ‘first’ = then some time ‘later?’ = you will/shall = have to ‘come
back?’ to it!?! Ophiel ‘discovered?’ this, in his vignette: An exercise in preliminary projection.

 

The  present  writer  believes,  that  much  of  the  ‘rituals’  of  ancient  times,  were/are  for,  the  #1,  malkuth  earth/hades
psychological tactile-feeling-body first and then, once the ‘hero/heroine’ had ‘achieved’ their ‘victory’, over  the dark-ness =
the ‘higher’ Gods = treated them/welcomed them, (the ‘projectors’) = AS ‘EQUALS!?!’ AMONGST THEM!?! = SITTING
AT THE ‘TOP’ TABLE!?! FEASTING!?! (Being ‘successful?’) In what ‘IT’ is? That they ‘do?’. Ophiel continues, in his
vignette, with this:

 

“To return to the conception of getting ‘material things’ through mental magic: Yes, it can be done, but the process is not
like that of waving a ‘magic wand.’ There are people who are naturally successful without inner plane help, but if you were
to examine their lives, you would find that there existed a definite pattern, both a physical pattern and a mental pattern, that
did it. And this same type of thing is what you must embody into your life, too. In other words, - change you’re thinking! -
AND, - how many people really change their thinking? WELL! You can but try! Even changing your thinking for short
periods can have some effect for beneficial changes.” End quote.

 

To return to the conception of getting ‘material things’ through mental magic: Yes, it can be done, but the process is not like
that of waving a ‘magic wand.’  There are people who are naturally successful without inner plane help, but if you were to
examine their lives, you would find that there existed a definite pattern, both a physical pattern and a mental pattern, that did
it. And this same type of thing is what you must embody into your life, too. 

In other words, - change you’re thinking = Psychological TACTILE-FEELING! - AND, - how many people really change
their Psychological TACTILE-FEELING!? WELL! You can but try! Even changing your thinking Psychological TACTILE-
FEELING! for short periods can have GREAT effect, for beneficial changes!

 

There are people who are naturally successful without inner plane help, but if you were to examine their lives, you would
find  that  there  existed  a  definite  pattern,  both  a  physical  pattern  and  a  mental  pattern,  that did it =  THEY/THESE
SUCCESSFUL PEOPLE/PERSONS =  AGREED-WITH!?!  =  THE/THEIR #1,  MALKUTH  EARTH/HADES  =
PSYCHOLOGICAL TACTILE-FEELING (Consciously/Un-Consciously =  MAKES NO DIFFERENCE WHATSOEVER
TO THE ‘OUTCOME!?!’)

 

BUT…  THE ‘OCCULT!?!’  IS!!! =  EVEN THOUGH YOU = #0 &+ #3 =  AGREE-WITH =  YOU #1!?! =  IT IS NOT
UNTIL!?! = YOU #1!! = AGREE-WITH = YOU #0!?! = THAT YOU = #0 = ARE GOING TO GET/HAVE = RECEIVE
FROM YOU = #1!?!

 

There are people who are naturally successful without inner plane help, but if you were to examine their lives, you would



find that there existed a definite pattern, both a physical DOING pattern and a Psychological TACTILE-FEELING pattern,
that DOES it!?! = Please put this to the ‘test!’, ‘try it!’, ‘use it!’!?! 

 

The/your  basic  cosmic  egg  and/or  basic  chair  exercises  =  ARE FOR DEVELOPMENT/ENHANCEMENT OF/FOR,
THE/YOUR PSYCHOLOGICAL-TACTILE-FEELING-DEFINING-THREE-DIMENSIONAL-ISING,  SYMBOL-
ISING!?!  BUT…  NOT FOR THE/YOUR =  APPLICATION OF!?!  THOSE/THESE DEVELOPMENTS,
ENHANCEMENTS!?!  (As  soon  as  you,  the  reader/occultist  understand(?),  the  ‘difference’  between
learning/developing/enhancing  =  and  the  application of!  Then,  the  ‘better’  it  will/shall  be,  for  you,  the
reader/occultist/operator!!?!)

 

Visualise = your object, circumstance, thing and/or it!

Tactilely-Feel = your object, circumstance, thing and/or it!

Use = your object, circumstance, thing and/or it! 

 

Standing ‘between’ the/your #2, etheric visualisation plane ‘IS’, the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades = tactile-feeling = plane,
before you, #0, outer, outer physically physical you = can get to ‘use’ = your object, circumstance, thing and/or it! Here is
who Ophiel writes it next, from his vignette: 

 

“Now, how much must you change your thinking and what kind of change exactly is required? Your ‘change in thinking,’
has to be of the nature of a ‘complete reversal’ of the ‘worldly’ and accepted manner of ‘world’ thinking. What does this
change really mean? First, - you must stop regarding the physical plane as ‘real’ in the sense that ‘solid’ means ‘real’. You
must start to think of the ‘solid’ plane as an ‘illusion,’ something ‘counter’ to the world’s accepted image/idea of it all.
Second, - you must begin to ‘think and act’ just the ‘opposite’ of the way the world thinks and acts.” End quote.

You must start to think of the ‘solid’ plane as an ‘illusion,’ something ‘counter’ to the world’s accepted image/idea of it all  =
one of the ‘occult ways’ to do/achieve this = observing #0, as an illusion = is to know/understand = that the/your #0, outer
physical world = IS A PROJECTION OF = the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades plane!  

 

Second, - you must begin to ‘think and act’ just the ‘opposite’ of the way the world thinks and acts = push-up to sit down?
Push-down  to  stand-up!  =  IT!?!  =  Object,  Circumstance,  Thing  =  COMES TO YOU =  #1!?!   =  IT!?!  =  Object,
Circumstance, Thing = IS YOURS = #1 =ALREADY!?! 

 

BUT…  CAN YOU =  #0  &+  #3  &+  #1  =  CONVINCE!?!  PERSUADE!?!  THE/YOUR #1  PLANE!?!  =
HADES/PLUTO/PRINCE-OF-DARK-NESS-BLACK-ASTRAL-LIGHT!?!  =  TO BELIEVE YOU!?!  CAN YOU =
CONSCIOUS-NESS = MAKE THE #1 PLANE = BELIEVE-YOU!?! Ophiel next writes: 

 

“These changes require that you also strengthen your ‘inner convictions’ to match the changes and this is certainly no easy
thing to ‘Do.’ And I can offer you no real personal help to make it easier. No one but YOU can strengthen your Inner Self.
This strengthening is a process of growing and growing in spite of all setbacks and results of cycles, of ‘hopes deferred’ and
all the screwball tactics that make up ‘living life’, this physical life. I certainly don’t mean to sound gloomy, by no means.”
End quote.

 

These changes require that you also strengthen your ‘inner convictions’ to match the changes and this is certainly no easy
thing to ‘Do.’ And I can offer you no real personal help to make it easier  = the present writer has no problem, in helping



anyone, with this, through the presentation of the/these ‘monologues’, which are not ‘viewpoints’ or ‘speculations’, the
development/enhancement of the/your #1, psychological tactile-feeling as the ‘bridge-between’ the #0 and #2 bodies, is, as
‘tangible’  and ‘palpable’  as you,  the  master  magician/occultist  can get!?!  Also,  the  presentation  of  the  Letter  of  Saint
Augustine of Hippo = agree-with-thine-adversary/opposer! Should make things a lot easier, when once you, the operator,
have ‘developed’ the egg/chair exercises!?!

 

No one but YOU can strengthen your Inner Self. This strengthening is a process of growing and growing in spite of all
setbacks and results of cycles, of ‘hopes deferred’ and all the screwball tactics that make up ‘living life’, this physical life  =
When/if(?), you choose to do/practice the egg/chair exercises =  IT IS THE/YOUR =  INNER-SELF!?!  WHO ‘ARE!?!’ =
DOING!!!  =  THE/THESE EXERCISES!?!  =  IN/ON ITS OWN #1,  PLANE!?!  =  IN EFFECT!?!  =  YOU THE
OPERATOR/OCCULTIST(?) = ARE ALREADY = PROJECTING!?! = IN/ON THE/YOUR #1, PLANE!?! (Put it to the
‘test!!?!’, ‘try it!?!’, ‘develop it!?!’ = USE IT!?!) Ophiel continues: 

 

“Actually, to understand the construction of ‘ALL’ and to master your own ‘Life LIVING’ is the greatest achievement in the
entire universe, and should thrill you to the core of your being. And this achievement is done through KNOWLEDGE;
KNOWLEDGE of your - Self, - KNOWLEDGE - of the ‘Machinery of the Universe,’ - And, - your acquired Knowledge of
how to ‘RUN THE MACHINERY OF THE UNIVERSE’ in regard to your own personal self.” End quote.

 

Actually, to understand the construction of ‘ALL’ and to master your own ‘Life LIVING’ is the greatest achievement in the
entire universe, and should thrill you to the core of your being. And this achievement is done through KNOWLEDGE;
KNOWLEDGE of your - Self, - KNOWLEDGE - of the ‘Machinery of the Universe,’ - And, - your acquired Knowledge of
how to ‘RUN THE MACHINERY OF THE UNIVERSE’ in regard to your own personal self  = THE FIRST PLACE TO
‘START/BEGIN’ THIS MASTERY OF THE MACHINERY OF THE/YOUR ‘UNIVERSE’ = IS!! = TO UNDERSTAND
THE/YOUR  ‘OWN’  PSYCHOLOGICAL  TACTILE-FEELING-FEELING-BODY!?!   Knowing  ‘how?’  this  ‘works?’,
should ‘thrill you?’, to the ‘core #1 body’ being! 

 

Ophiel writes next:

 

“In these few pages I cannot give ‘ALL KNOWLEDGE.’ I aim to give out something in each writing and in time, to get a
great deal of it out. (And I am not doing this to extend the bulk of my writing, but because the scope of this material is very
large.) Please study the following basic-basic and assimilate this knowledge into your ‘BEING’. A great deal of ‘TRUTH’ is
here given. The next Inner Plane is full of Light. This Light is the ‘SUBSTANCE’ of the Secondary God. I call this ‘LIGHT
SUBSTANCE’ the ‘Astral Light’ (Star Light) (My pet name.)” End quote.

 

We slightly amend the above, for ‘context = #1, malkuth earth/hades plane’, to read thusly: 

Please study the following basic-basic and assimilate this knowledge into your ‘BEING’. A great deal of ‘TRUTH’ is here
given. The next Inner Plane #1, malkuth earth/hades plane is full of Black-Astral-Light. This Light is the ‘SUBSTANCE’ of
the  Secondary  God  =  THE DEMIURGE at  the/your  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane:  this  ‘LIGHT SUBSTANCE’  is
called/named; The ‘Astral Light’ (Star Light), on the planes above, over, higher, before and in-front-of, the/your #1, Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane!?! = But… it is ‘still!?!’, all the same/one LIGHT!?! 

 

Next, we read this: 

 

“EVERYTHING in our physical existence is connected to, related to, concerned with, the Astral Light. For the rest of this



Vignette  I  will  list  the  names, other  names,  by which  the  Astral  Light  has been ‘DISCOVERED’ and  ‘NAMED’ by
occultists and metaphysicians through and over the centuries. As each came upon this ‘Light Substance’ in turn, used it, and
then named it, the name he gave depending somewhat upon the ‘QUALITY’ of the ‘Light’ used. The following are names
for the Great Agent: Prana, Holy Ghost, Elemental Forces,  Cosmic Magnetism, Magnetic Fluid (Mesmer,) Keys of the
Kingdom,  Living  Water,  Vril,  Hidden  Agent,  Logos  (Gnostic,)  Chameleon,  Flor  Salis  Albi  (Flower  of  White  Salt,)
Philosopher’s Stone, Elixir of Life, Demiurge (Greek,) Half-God, Animal Magnetism (Mrs Eddy = Christian Science) Para
Brahman, Absolute Substance.” End quote. 

 

BUT… WHAT IS ‘MISSING!?!’ FROM THE ABOVE LIST OF NAMES IS/ARE = SAMAEL – THE  BLIND GOD!
YALDABAOTH – THE  CHILDISH GOD! SAKLAS – THE  FOOLISH GOD!  THE PRINCE OF DARK-NESS! THE
PRINCE  OF  THIS  WORLD!  THE  BLACK-ASTRAL-LIGHT!  THE  PSYCHOLOGICAL  DARK-NESS!  THE
TOUCHING/FEELING GOD! Etc, etc, et al. Ophiel finishes off his vignette: Getting Material Things, with this:

 

“The ‘Core Knowledge’ of this Vignette is that you, ‘Learn’ about the, ‘Existence’ of the Astral Light and then from then on,
you, take the ‘Existence’ of this Great Agent into all your calculations. Generally speaking, you can learn how to manipulate
the Agent so that it will not harm you and can benefit you. Learn and Work. As I have said before and will say again and
again, this life is a very ‘queer’ thing? It is said that we ‘came’ from a free ‘space’ and here we are ‘confined.’ Some kind of
lesson is to be ‘Learned’ a way of ‘escape’ is to be found? The above is a start.” End quote.

 

The ‘Core Knowledge’ of this Vignette is that you, ‘Learn’ about the, ‘Existence’ of the Astral Light and then from then on,
you,  take the  ‘Existence’  of  this  Great  Agent  into  all  your  calculations =  this  is  where,  when  you  have  had  enough
development/enhancement  with  the/your  basic  cosmic  egg/chair  exercises,  then  ‘taking  into  account’,  is  almost
‘automatic/reflexive’,  when  this  ‘point/place’  has  been  ‘reached’  and  things  like  Ophiel’s  examples,  from  his  book:
Clairvoyance, his chapter: The Two Minds, comes into play? 

 

This watermelon (is the ripest)

This much! (milk-pouring exercise) 

This hard (pressure on the gas-peddle) 

 

These  things/these  kinds/types  of  things,  ‘come/rise  up  into  conscious-ness’  =  as  psychological  tactile-feelings!?!  =
intuitions/inspirations/attractions/drawn to/drawn away from!?!  Generally speaking, you can learn how to manipulate the
Agent, so that it will not harm you and can benefit you!?!

 

Learn and Work. As I have said before and will say again and again, this life is a very ‘queer’ thing? It is said that we ‘came’
from a free ‘space’ and here we are ‘confined.’ Some kind of lesson is to be ‘Learned’ a way of ‘escape’ is to be found? The
above is a start = Embrace your psychological tactile-feeling ability/powers, and develop/enhance them, through/by/with =
the/your basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercises!!

 

As  soon  as  you,  the  operator  start/begin  your  egg/chair  exercises  =  YOU ARE ALREADY =  PROJECTING!?!  =
TRANSFERRING!?!  = YOUR ‘CONSCIOUS-NESS!?!’  =  INTO/ONTO A/AN ‘OTHER’  PLANE/PLACE!?!  As  your
development/enhancement grows/increases, so too will/shall your =  LATENT PSYCHIC POWERS!?! = Your sense/feel
of/for psychologically tactilely-feeling = WILL BE/SHALL BE = IS!?! = A SHARED!?! = EXPERIENCE!?!

 



Thank you.     


