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We shall simply take Ophiel’s presentation of the; Emerald Tablet, and ‘work it’ from there. Here it is, from Ophiel’s book;
Clairvoyance, his chapter: The Astral Light. 

 

“Message on the Emerald:

 

True, without falsehood, certain and most true, that which is above is as that which is below, and that which is below is as
that which is above, for the performance of the miracles of the One Thing. And as all things are from One, by the mediation
of One, so all things have their birth from this One Thing by adaptation. The Sun is its father, the Moon its mother, The
Wind carries it in its belly, its nurse is the Earth. This is the, Father of all perfection, or consummation of the whole world.
Its power is integrating, if it be turned into earth. Thou shall separate the earth from the fire, the subtle from the gross,
suavely, and with great ingenuity. 

It ascends from earth to heaven and descends again to earth, and receives the power of the superiors and all the inferiors. So,
thou hast the glory of the whole world; therefore, let all obscurity flee before thee. This is the strong force of all forces,
overcoming every subtle and penetrating every solid thing. So, the world was created. Hence were all wonderful adaptations,
of which this is the manner. Therefore, am I called Hermes Trismegistus, having the three parts of the philosophy of the
whole world. What I have to tell is complete concerning the Operation of the Sun.” End quote. 

 

and with great ingenuity = Ingenuity/Ingenuous (adjective), from the Latin; ingenuus =  born(?), in a ‘place’. From; in =
Proto-Indo-European Root word; en = in + gen(e)-wo = suffixed form of the root word; gene = to give birth; to beget; to
produce!?! 

 

The previous monologue and this one, it  must be remembered/recalled, is;  ALL ABOUT THE/YOUR #1, MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES PLANE = PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING! 

 

Also, it must be remembered/recalled, that the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane = IS! = THE PLANE ABOVE; OVER;
BEFORE; HIGHER AND IN FRONT!?! OF THE/YOUR #0, OUTER, OUTER PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL PLANE =
WHICH IS! = BELOW; UNDER; AFTER; LOWER AND BEHIND!?!

 

It ascends from earth to heaven and descends again to earth, and receives the power of the superiors and all the inferiors:

 

IT = THE/YOUR – PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING.

Ascends = assume/assumed/assumption.

From earth = #1, malkuth earth/hades.

Heaven = not a place/plane = but a – finer, state/condition = above! #1!

Descends = polarise; polarity; polarisation = all facing the ‘same/one’ way!

Earth = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!

Power = to be able!

Superior = Upper! (Proto-Indo-European Root word; Uper = means ‘OVER’!?!)



Inferior = Infra – word-forming element; meaning – below; beneath; under; lower. (PIE Root; ndher = under.)

 

The present writer trusts, that even the most recent of beginners, to the ‘occult’ can see/read, that; Superior and Inferior =
both  refer  to  a  ‘GEOGRAPHICAL/SPATIAL’  inference,  and  not!  to  a/any,  kind/type  of  individual  ‘authoritative?’
person/individual!?! 

 

So, thou = conscious;

Hast the glory = #2, etheric light;

Of the whole world = #1 &+ #0;

Therefore, let all obscurity = ob = over + scurus = covered; PIE Root; skeu – to cover/conceal = hide;

Flee before thee = flee – PIE Root word; pleu – TO FLOW!?!  

 

This is the strong force of all forces, overcoming every subtle and penetrating every solid thing. So, the world was created.

 

The ‘strong force of all forces’, is the elemental element, of the element of, the element, elemental earth = psychic-tactile-
feel-ing!?! = overcoming – for all this, is delivered unto me #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades!?!

 

So, the world was created. Hence were all wonderful ADAPTATIONS, of which this is the manner = way of!?! 

 

Notice, ‘adaptations’ was/is, used again!?!

 

Therefore, am I called Hermes Trismegistus, having the three parts of the philosophy of the whole world. What I have to tell,
is complete, concerning the Operation of the Sun.

 

Therefore, I am, called; Hermes Trismegistus, having the three-parts (Air; Fire & Water) = for the whole world!?! (For the
‘making of’ the ‘whole-world’!?! #1 &+ #0!!!) concerning the ‘Operation = Working’, of the Sun = Inner Astral Light!?!
(#2, Etheric and above.) 

 

The present writer doesn’t know (nor cares to!!), if anyone is able to ‘see/operate’ the above, to the/their advantage or not, at
this time in the/their ‘occult’ lives/living, but… even a ‘cursory’ knowing/understanding, is/will be/shall be ‘enough’, to
assist/enhance, the individual’s efforts, in the/their #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades and/plus #2, Etheric work/working and also, in
the/their Basic Cosmic Egg and or Basic Chair exercises!

 

Here is what Ophiel writes, in his book; Talismanic Magic, his chapter; The Planes, of the Elements:

 

“The “God” of the Earth Plane is Pluto. Pluto is that creature, you see in illustrations with horns and bat’s wings and a tail
that has what looks like a spearhead on it and has animal hooves sometimes; there are no clear, distinct pictures of it. The
old-time artists used their fancy to impress people but, nevertheless that creature is Pluto. And Pluto is not the devil. There
isn’t any devil, there isn’t any Satan. I repeat, that creature is definitely not the devil.  Now the Plane above this one, of



course, is the Etheric Plane, followed by the Astral Plane . In the matter of Greek mythology, the distinction between these
Planes is not quite as sharp as the distinction I have just given it which is more or less a Hindu idea.” End quote. (Underlines
are the present writers.) 

 

So, the ‘plane above’ #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades = is! = the/your #2, Etheric Plane!

So, the ‘plane above’ #0, Outer Physical Earth = is! = the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades! 

 

How can you = the occultist(?), read this stuff(?), and not?!?!, benefit(?), from it????? 

 

AS SOON  AS!?!  =  YOU!  =  CONSCIOUS(?),  UNDERSTAND(?),  THAT  THE/THIS  =  YOUR =  #1,  MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES  RULES!!  THE/YOUR  #0,  OUTER,  OUTER  PHYSICALLY  PHYSICAL  WORLD!?!
THROUGH/BY/WITH  =  ITS!?!  =  LAWS;  RULES  &  GOVERNANCES!?!  =  THEN  YOU!  =  THE
READER/OCCULTIST(?), ARE IN A POSITION/PLACE TO TEST; TRY & USE = IT!?! 

 

Stop!  Trying  to  ‘change/alter’  the/your  #0,  outer,  outer  physically  physical  world  about  you  now!?!  And  try(!),
changing/altering, the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades world!?! BY/WITH!! = THE/YOUR PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING
BODY!?!  You now ‘have?’, a ‘three-pronged’ approach/attack!?! = 

 

From above #2, Etheric Plane Visualisations = tactilely-felt = Earth-of-Water!?!

From within #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades = tactilely-felt = Earth-of-Earth!?! 

From below = #0, Outer, Outer Physically Physical = tactilely-use; used; using = Earth-of-Earth-of-Earth!?! 

 

As above = So below! So below = As Above!

 

(See/read Ophiel’s vignette: Work on All Planes.)

 

The present writer shall just ‘send’ this to the list, as others may be able to take ‘advantage’ of it, as well. 

 

Thank you. 


