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Ophiel continues with his vignette; How to Alter your Name to a Magical Name, with this
next part:

“The  first  thing  to  do  is  to  ‘RE-ARRANGE  YOUR  OWN  NAME  INTO  A  MORE
POWERFUL FORM’ in this way you lay the foundations for a centre from which to work
later to actively attract to you the material ‘THINGS’ you want and the ‘QUALITIES’ you
want.

The second thing to do is to learn how to ‘BUILD A LIVING IMAGE OF THE ‘THING’
YOU WANT’ on the ‘Inner Planes’ and by your new ‘POWERFUL PERSONAL NAME,
LINK THIS ‘IMAGE’ TO YOU.’” End quote

Context reads thusly:

The first thing to ‘do’ (#0 &+ #3),  is  to ‘re-arrange’ your ‘given name’,  which you #3 –
identify  with(?)  (Stare at/Observe?) INTO A MORE ‘POWERFUL =  BELIEVE-ABLE =
PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING  FORM’!?! = thus, laying out/down, a ‘foundation = set-
point’,  from which to ‘draw-to/towards’ YOU #1!?! Come Closer That I May Touch/Feel
You! = THAT I MAY BELIEVE YOU! (You = Object; Circumstance; Thing; IT!?!) (For ‘all
this’ is(!) delivered unto me ‘and to?’ = whomsoever I(?) choose(?) = to give ‘IT! = Object;
Circumstance; Thing!)  = Ole Crazy Book (Bible) Talk! Two of the ‘few’ techniques, left out,
in the ‘open’ (but… still secret!?), as no one can/could/did = understand(?) = the ‘occult?’,
behind the  ‘story’ = Isaak – The  BLIND Father; Esau & Jacob ‘twin’ sons or/nor  = The
‘conversation’ of the Cave/Dessert!?! - #2 and #1 – talking/explaining!?!

Next this, part from Ophiel;

“Step one, the changing of your present name into a ‘NAME OF POWER’ is a relatively
simple matter. By adding the suffix ‘EL’ to your present name you give it a ‘LINK’ with a
powerful ‘FORCE’. The word ‘EL’ as taught by the system of the Caballa means the Power
and  Force  of  ‘God  Almighty’.  This  ‘EL’  ending  added  to  your  name,  added
‘CONSCIOUSLY’ and recalled to mind every time you speak it ‘BRINGS GOD’S POWER
AND FORCE INTO YOUR NAME/LIFE’ The first step then, is adding the ending ‘EL’ to
your name.” End quote.

The present writer has already posted about the/this Canaanite/Akkadian ‘God = Ēl’, as it was
used,  as  ‘both’,  a  ‘generic  term’  =  Ēl  –  THE GOD!  And/Or;  Ēl  –  A GOD!  –  simply
depending  =  ON ‘HOW!?!’,  IN WHAT ‘WAY!?!’  =  IT  –  Ēl?  =  WAS BEING
USED/APPLIED!?!  (Compare  with;  HA =  THE!  –  HA-SATAN –  CHIEF/BOSS/BIG –
ORIGINAL/FIST!?!  –  ONE AND ONLY!?!  =  HA-SATAN!?!  There  were/are  ‘lots  and



lots??’ of other ‘little satans?’ = Hence the ‘distinction/application’?) But… In this ‘case’ as
in  the  ‘other’  cases?  The  ‘occult!!’,  lies  in  the  =  EPITHETS =  OF/FOR  THE/THIS
‘GODS/FORCE!?!’ = ACTIONS/DESCRIPTIONS/DOINGS!?! So, in this ‘case’, we have;

Ēl = God (a/the) Powerful!

Ēl = God (a/the) Mighty!

Ēl = God (a/the) Who is ‘FIRST’!

Ēl = God (a/the) Who is ‘ABOVE’!

Ēl = God (a/the) Who is ‘BEFORE’!

Ēl = God (a/the) Who is ‘AHEAD’

Ēl = God (a/the) Who is ‘OVER’! 

Ēl = God (a/the) Who is ‘IN-FRONT’!

All of the above, epithets - handles; nick-names; labels, etc, should read ‘familiar’ to you, the
reader, already!?!

This  ‘EL’  ending  added  to  your  name,  added  ‘CONSCIOUSLY’  and  PSYCHICALLY-
TACTILELY-FELT = to ‘mind = #1 &+ #0 &+ #3’ every time you verbalise it = ‘  BRINGS  
THE/THIS = GOD’S POWER AND FORCE INTO YOUR NAME/LIFE’.

Understanding of(!),  the  terms/descriptions/actions/doings  =  OF/FOR  THE  =
IDEA/EXPRESSION =  ACTION/DOING = OF/FOR THE WORD = Ēl = Meant that the
Priestly  =  educated/skilled/artisan  class  of  person  –  would/could/should!?!  =  GET
THE/THEIR = GREAT GOD!?! = TO WORK(?) TO OPERATE(?) = FOR THEM!?! = The
‘Priestly’ class!?! = AND MORE ‘IMPORTANTLY!?! = FOR THOSE WHO COULD PAY
THEM FOR IT!?! (Their (the priests(?)) ‘intervention’ in their = the ‘inquirers’ = behalf!?!

Yaldabaoth  –  Childish;  Saklas  –  Foolish!  SAMA-EL!?!  =  THE ‘BLIND!?!’  GOD!?!  =
epithets(?) – to/of/for = THE DEMIURGE!?! = AT! AT! = THE/YOUR = #1, MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES PLANE!?!

Ophiel next writes: 

“Now, this combination should sound well, it must sound euphonious. If it does not sound
well then you should choose a completely new name. I ‘DO NOT’ mean that you should
change your present public name, as this would involve too much trouble; it is enough if you
call yourself the new name in private and it would be well to keep it a secret . Then too, you
can if you wish have several different names if you so choose. Let us take an example, take a
name like ‘Green’, adding an ‘EL’ to ‘Green’ makes it ‘Greenel’ which doesn’t sound too
bad. Therefore, its ending can be added to this name easily and doing so links up the man
with the  powerful God Force  represented by ‘EL’.  After  adding ‘EL’ to  your name,  you



should repeat this new name to your-self many, many times each day, recalling as you do so
the  ‘MEANING’  of  the  ‘EL’  ending.  Notice  that  all  the  ‘ANGELS’  names  end  in  ‘EL’
Micha-EL, Rapha-EL, Gabri-EL and Auri-EL. This ‘EL’ is the ‘SOURCE’ from which they
draw their power and now that you know about this you can do the same thing in a smaller
way but enough for physical affairs.” End quote. (Underlines are the present writers.)

So, simply for your ‘occult’ education and understanding, the ‘concept/idea’ is that = Any
verbal/writes ‘description/explanation’  of/for  the = abilities; powers; force;  might = of/for
a/the/any  ‘EL’  God  =  IS IN THE ‘OCCULT’
KNOWLEDGE/KNOWING/UNDERSTANDING!?! = THAT THE PERSON/PERSONS =
DOING THE = EXPLAINING/EXPLANATION/DESCRIPTIONS OF = ARE DOING SO =
ABOUT THE PLANE/LEVEL = ABOVE; OVER; HIGHER; BEFORE & IN-FRONT = Ēl
= God (a/the) Who is ‘FIRST’!!

So! Following the above information(?), the ‘technique?’ needed/required = IS ‘NOT!’ = one
of  description,  but…  one  of  ‘application/doing?’,  which,  in  this/our/your  ‘case’  =  IS!  =
PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING!?!

So that!?!  =  when/if  you,  the  reader/operator/occultist  =  DO!?!  =  go  down the  ‘magical
name/naming route?’ = YOU DO SO!?! = WITH KNOWLEDGE/UNDERSTANDING!?! =
AND NOT!  NOT!  =  WITH SOME KIND/TYPE OF =  #3,  EGO  BODY  =
SUPERSTITIONS!?!  =  THUS –  PULLING THE ‘RUG?’  OUT FROM UNDER =  THE
YOUR #1 &+ #0 = BODIES!?!

Ēl  =  God (a/the)  Who is ‘FIRST’!  =  Is/means  =  THE NEXT PLANE ABOVE;  OVER;
AHEAD & IN-FRONT OF!?! =  WHATEVER PLANE/LEVEL = YOU!! =  CONSCIOUS-
NESS!?! = ARE IN/ON NOW!?! WHICH IS/WILL BE = THE PLANE/LEVEL = BELOW;
UNDER; AFTER & BEHIND!?!

Ophiel next writes:

“Step two; the building of a magical image of the thing you want on the ‘Inner Planes’ in your
imagination is an, ‘IMPORTANT’ and ‘POWERFUL’ operation. As far as I can find out this
knowledge has never been given out in this form before. I hope you will value it accordingly,
and ‘USE’ it wisely and without talking about it. Every letter/word/sound in any language has
a basic meaning that goes back so far that the beginning is lost. Suffice it for now to say that
all  letter/sounds  have  deep  meanings  of  all  kinds  and  also  ‘ALL  OF  THEM  HAVE
GENDER?’ The knowledge about these things is endless and would take a thousand pages to
start  to  explain  it.  It  is  enough  for  you  to  start  at  this  point,  ‘Where  you  know’  that
‘letter/sounds’ have gender, they are ‘MALE/FEMALE?’” End quote.

Context reads thusly;

Step two; the building of a psychic-tactile-feel-ing, of the ‘magical-named-image =  symbol



of’,  the  things  you  =  #0 &+ #3 =  want/desire  ‘from’,  the/your ‘Inner  Planes’  in  your  –
imagination = image-movements? is a/an,  IMPORTANT and POWERFUL, operation. This
knowledge/knowing  of,  the/your  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane/Level,  and  its
‘Connection?’, to/with the/your = Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing = has never been given out, in this
‘form’ before. It is to be ‘hoped?’, that it is ‘valued’ accordingly, and its ‘use’, is  applied,
without  the ‘failings’  of  the/your #3,  Ego Body,  Present  Incarnation,  Personality  Body =
Greed;  Dominance;  Selfish;  Spiteful;  Meanness;  etc,  etc.  Every  letter/word/sound  in  any
language  has  a  basic  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing  meaning =  that  goes  back so far,  that  the
beginning is lost. Suffice it for now to say, that all letter/sounds, have ‘deep meanings’ of all
kinds and also, ‘ALL OF THEM HAVE GENDER?’ = From the Proto-Indo-European Root
word; gene – give birth/beget. The knowledge about these things is endless and would take a
thousand pages to start to explain it. It is enough for you to start at this point, ‘Where you
know’  that  ‘letter/sounds’  have  gender,  they  are  ‘MALE/FEMALE?  =  Male/Female  =
Polarity/Assume – direction = IN/ON/FROM!?! = THE ‘PLANE/LEVEL’!?! = That you –
Conscious as a ‘Ness’ = are in/on = IN DUALITY WITH NOW!?!

Gender – sex (noun), 14th century = of uncertain origin; from the Latin; sexus = state of being
either  male  or  female.  Supposedly(?),  from;  seco  –  division/half;  From;  secare  =  to
divide/cut/separate. (See/read Ophiel’s book; Clairvoyance, his chapter: Semi-Physical Types
of Clairvoyance,  and his;  Talismans  –  strong-pole  & weak-pole  = direction =  and  apply
it/this/his = ‘pole’ explanation, to your Oracle ‘readings’.) 

Next; we read this;

“Knowing this,  you can build a ‘Living Image’ in your imagination of the ‘THING YOU
DESIRE TO HAVE’.  This image is  a ‘Personification’ of the ‘THING’ you desire. THIS
IMAGE CAN BE GIVEN A ‘LIFE’. With this image you can work in various ways to bring
the ‘THING’ desired  into  your life/radius/ownership.  NOW NOTE,  THIS KNOWLEDGE
CAN BE ONE OF THE MOST IMPORTANT THINGS IN YOUR LIFE.  THE CORRECT
‘USE’  OF IT CAN MAKE LIFE VERY EASY FOR YOU IN MANY WAYS. FOR GOD’S
SAKE  AND  YOUR  OWN  SAKE,  ‘USE’  THIS  KNOWLEDGE  CAREFULLY,  ‘USE’  IT
SANELY;  ‘USE’  IT WISELY. STUDY THE FOLLOWING TABLE VERY CAREFULLY!
You cannot study it too much!” End quote.

Context:

Knowing/understanding, that you, the reader/practitioner/occultist(?),  can now(?),  ‘Build A
Living Image’, in/on the/your = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane = THROUGH BY/WITH!?!
=  the/your  =  Psychological  =  PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING-OF!?!  The  Object;
Circumstance;  Thing  and/or  IT!?!  That  you  =  #0  &+  #3  =  desire  to  ‘have?’,  you  –
CONSCIOUS  –  AS A ‘NESS!?!’  =  CAN ‘NOW!?!’  GIVE!?!  =  THE/YOUR
‘IMAGE/DESIRE’  =  A PART/PIECE/EXTENSION/PROJECTION!?!  =  OF!?!  =



THE/YOUR!?! = LIFE FORCE!?! = AKASHA!?! = BASIC COSMIC EGG EXERCISE!?! –
Too much?  Too difficult?  Too hard?  Too complicated?  =  Well!!!  = Too bad!?!  Because
that/this = IS!?! = THE ‘WAY!?!’ = THAT ‘IT!’ = IS!?!

Ophiel writes, in his book; Talismanic Magic, that you – the operator – must draw down and
pass through you; Large Amounts of Prana (All five basic elemental  forces ‘combined’) in
order  to  be/become ‘successful?’  in  your  ‘efforts’,  but…!  Since  you  do/practice  the/your
basic  cosmic  egg  exercises,  every  day,  twice  a  day(??)  =  YOU –  the
reader/practitioner/occultist(?)  –  ARE ALREADY!?!  =  DOING IT/THIS =  PASSING-
THROUGH-YOU!?! AS!?! = PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING!?! Here is Ophiel’s table;

A                     Spiritual, wings generally, epicene, rather male than female, rather thin.

B                     Male, active, slight.

C                     Feminine. Full face. Not much expression.

D                     Feminine: Very beautiful and attractive. Rather full face and body.

E, I, Y             Feminine: Very white and rather delicate.

F                      Epicene, rather male than female: Fierce, active.

G, J                  Feminine. Grey, Beautiful, yet changeful. Rather full face and body.

H                     Male. Fierce, strong, rather fiery.

K                     Masculine. Big and strong.

L                      Feminine. Well proportioned.

M                     Epicene, rather female than male. Reflective, dream-like.

N                     Masculine. Square determined face. Rather dark.

O, U, V           Masculine. Steady and Strong. Rather heavy and clumsy.

P                      Feminine. Fierce, strong, resolute.

Q                     Masculine. Rather full face.

R                     Masculine. Proud, dominant.

S                      Epicene, rather male than female. Fierce, active.

T                      Epicene, rather male than female. Dark grey.

W                    This is a double V i.e., VV.

X                     Is near S.

Z                      Masculine. Thin. Intelligent.

You are going to construct in your imagination,  a ‘FIGURE to CORRESPOND’ with the



name of the ‘THING’ you are working for/with. The ‘Imaginary’ figure is to have a human
form, i.e., it will have a body like a person, a head, middle, legs and feet. For example, let us
say that your name begins with an, S. Looking at the table you find that S is fierce, active and
epicene  but  rather  male  than female  (‘Epicene’  means  that  it  is  nether  male  nor  female
appearing.) So, the head of the figure will be fierce, active (moving). Neither distinctly male
nor female but slightly more male than female, if S was in the middle of the word/name then
the middle of the figure/name/word would be fierce, active, etc. If S, were at the end of the
name then the feet would have these characteristics. (Fierce, active, moving)” End quote.

Context;

You are going to construct in/on the/your = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane - a FIGURE to
CORRESPOND  with  the  name  =  PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING  -  of  the  Object;
Circumstance; Thing and/or IT! That you - #0 &+ #3, are working for/with. The  psychic-
tactile-feel-ing figure, is to have a human form, i.e., it will have a body like a #0, person =
head; torso, hips/pelvis/crotch and thighs/legs/feet.

For example, let us say that your name begins with an, S. Looking at the table you find that
‘S’ is fierce, active and epicene but rather male than female (‘Epicene’ means that it is nether
male nor female appearing.) So, the head of the figure will be fierce, active (moving). Neither
distinctly male nor female but slightly more male than female, if ‘S’ was in the torso of the
word/name, then the torso of the figure/name/word, would be fierce, active, etc. If ‘S’, were
at the crotch of the word/name then the hips/pelvis/crotch, will/shall ‘have’ the characteristics
of/for  this  area  and the  thighs/legs/feet  would  have  their  characteristics  as  well.  (Fierce,
active, moving.)

So, in/on the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades psychological- psychic-tactile-feel-ing-plane level
=  you –  the  reader/practitioner/operator/occultist(?),  would have,  simply  as  a  ‘matter’  of
course/working;

Egg = whole body.

Sphere = head.

Inverted Pyramid = torso.

Bowl = hips/pelvis/crotch.

Cube = thighs/legs/feet.

The present writer, hopes that the above practices, reads familiar, to/for you, and that you
will/can ‘adapt/adopt’ it, to/for your Oracle, readings/workings. Example of/for the above:

Make up a ‘name’ for a/the/your ‘assistant/familiar?’, in/on the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades
plane;  give/present!?!  =  a  ‘clear/concise’  task(!)  –  to/for  your  ‘assistant/familiar?’,  in/on
the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades plane ‘body’ – TO READ/EXPLAIN!?! = THE ORACLE



‘READ-ING/SPREAD!?!’ = TO YOU = #0 &+ #3!?! AND!! = IN DIRECT PROPORTION
TO!?! = THE/YOUR #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades = psychological-  psychic-tactile-feel-ing =
WILL BE/SHALL BE!?! = THE/YOUR – ANSWER!?! – Which you can, ‘then’, pass on to
the/your ‘enquirer/asker!?!’ = BUT…! (Ah, yes!! – you ‘knew!’ it was coming!?!) BUT….!
YOU = #3,  EGO BODY –  CANNOT/MUST NOT!?! =  JUDGE;  JUDGE-ING;  JUDGE-
MEANT!?!

Thank you.


