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Ophiel, continues in his vignette; How to change your name into a Magical Name, with this: 

 

“Step two; the building of a magical image of the thing you want on the ‘Inner Planes’ in your
imagination is an, ‘IMPORTANT’ and ‘POWERFUL’ operation. As far as I can find out this
knowledge has never been given out in this form before. I hope you will value it accordingly,
and ‘USE’ it wisely and without talking about it. Every letter/word/sound in any language has
a basic meaning that goes back so far that the beginning is lost. Suffice it for now to say that
all  letter/sounds  have  deep  meanings  of  all  kinds  and  also  ‘ALL  OF  THEM  HAVE
GENDER?’ The knowledge about these things is endless and would take a thousand pages to
start  to  explain  it.  It  is  enough  for  you  to  start  at  this  point,  ‘Where  you  know’  that
‘letter/sounds’ have gender, they are ‘MALE/FEMALE?’” End quote.

 

For ‘context’:

 

Step  two;  the  building  of  a  ‘magical  image’  (An  ‘image’  of  tactilely-felt-defined-three-
dimensional-ised-symbol-ised-believeable-image!?!) of the thing-meeting = you want on the
‘Inner Planes’ in your imagination is an, ‘IMPORTANT’ and ‘POWERFUL’ operation. As
far as I can find out this knowledge has never been given out in this form before. I hope you
will value it  accordingly,  and ‘USE’ it  wisely and without talking about it  = The present
writer is not aware of anyone else/other in the wider general ‘occult’ field, to date, who has
‘presented’  about  the  dark-ness;  black-ness;  blind-ness  of  the  Demiurge  =  BLACK-on-
BLACK!  BLACK-ASTRAL-LIGHT! #1,  Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane/Level  =  AT! = The
‘bottom’ of the = Tree-of-Life and Death. Nor have they (the present writer), ever wondered
‘why?’, no one has?? 

 

The only one who has come even ‘close/near’ to ‘presenting’ the #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades
Plane; was/is Ophiel!?! You can read this for your selves, in his writings. But, unfortunately,
he came ‘late’ into it, and was much more fascinated by/with, the ‘Luminous Light’ of the
Demiurge.  Whereas,  the present writer,  as explained in previous  monologues,  came early
(age ten), and only when in their late teens, did they ‘emerge’, but… not, unscathed!?! =  I
hope you will value it accordingly, and ‘TEST’, ‘TRY’ ‘USE’, it wisely, and without talking
about it!?! 

 

Ophiel continues;



 

“Knowing this,  you can build a ‘Living Image’ in your imagination of the ‘THING YOU
DESIRE TO HAVE’.  This image is  a ‘Personification’ of the ‘THING’ you desire. THIS
IMAGE CAN BE GIVEN A ‘LIFE’. With this image you can work in various ways to bring
the ‘THING’ desired  into  your life/radius/ownership.  NOW NOTE,  THIS KNOWLEDGE
CAN BE ONE OF THE MOST IMPORTANT THINGS IN YOUR LIFE.  THE CORRECT
‘USE’  OF IT CAN MAKE LIFE VERY EASY FOR YOU IN MANY WAYS. FOR GOD’S
SAKE  AND  YOUR  OWN  SAKE,  ‘USE’  THIS  KNOWLEDGE  CAREFULLY,  ‘USE’  IT
SANELY;  ‘USE’  IT WISELY. STUDY THE FOLLOWING TABLE VERY CAREFULLY!
You cannot study it too much!” End quote. 

 

For ‘context’:

 

Knowing  about  the/your;  Psychological  TACTILE-FEELING-BODY you  can
build/create/make  a  ‘Living  Image’  in  your  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane,  imagination
plane, the, ‘THING = MEETING’ YOU DESIRE TO HAVE’. the ‘building of’, your desire,
is  ‘done’  by/with  you,  the  operator/occultist  =  stretching;  reaching;  grabbing;  griping;
grasping; holding; touching;  psychically-tactilely-feeling;  defining;  three-dimensional-ising;
symbol-ising = the/your = object; circumstance; thing and/or it!?!  

 

It  is  ‘important’,  that  you,  the  reader/occultist(?),  should  understand/recall,  the
etymology/meaning, of the word ‘thing’!?! 

 

Thing (noun), from Proto-Germanic; thinga = assembly; appointed time; meeting. From the
Proto-Indo-European  Root  word:  tenk;  from  the  root  of;  ten  =  stretch  (to  ‘reach  for’
psychologically!?!).

 

This image is a ‘Personification’ of the ‘THING’ you desire. THIS IMAGE CAN BE GIVEN
A ‘LIFE’. With this image you can work in various ways to bring the ‘THING’ desired, into
your life/radius/ownership. giving ‘life’ (your life!?!), to the/your ‘image?’, is done/achieved,
in/on the/your #1,  malkuth earth/hades plane = dark-ness; black-ness;  blind-ness = is! (of
course!?!) done/achieved through/by/with = the/your =  powers of -  psychic-tactile-feeling-
believing!?! now note,  this knowledge can be one of the most important things in your life.
the correct ‘use’ of it can make life very easy for you in many ways. for god’s sake and your
own sake, ‘use’ this knowledge carefully, ‘test it’, ‘try it’, ‘use it’ sanely; ‘use’ it wisely. study
the following table very carefully! You cannot study it too much!  = WHAT MORE COULD
BE/CAN BE? SAID!?!



 

For those members who have chosen to test, try, use, the/their basic cosmic egg and/or basic
chair  exercises  to  increase,  enhance  and  develop,  the/their  latent  psychic,  psychological
psychic-tactile-feeling;  defining;  three-dimensional;  symbol-ical,  latent  powers,  the  above
information  from Ophiel,  should  be  relatively  easy  and  rewarding.  Here  is  what  Ophiel
writes, after his ‘Spiritual Alphabet?’. 

 

“You are going to construct in your imagination, a ‘FIGURE to CORRESPOND’ with the
name of the ‘THING’ you are working for/with. The ‘Imaginary’ figure is to have a human
form, i.e., it will have a body like a person, a head, middle, legs and feet. For example, let us
say that your name begins with an, S. Looking at the table you find that S is fierce, active and
epicene  but  rather  male  than female  (‘Epicene’  means  that  it  is  nether  male  nor  female
appearing.) So, the head of the figure will be fierce, active (moving). Neither distinctly male
nor female but slightly more male than female, if S was in the middle of the word/name then
the middle of the figure/name/word would be fierce, active, etc. If S were at the end of the
name, then the feet would have these characteristics. (Fierce, active, moving).” End quote.

 

Context: 

 

You are going to construct in your imagination, a ‘FIGURE to CORRESPOND’ with = ‘THE
PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEELING’ = AS THE ‘NAME’ OF THE ‘THING’! You are working
for/with = MEETING!?!

 

Remember  =  Thing  (noun),  from  Proto-Germanic;  thinga  =  assembly;  appointed time;
meeting! It is to be ‘hoped’, that the above etymology, of/for the word ‘thing’, now,  takes
on/has, a ‘new’ psychic ‘meaning’, for you, the reader/occultist(?). Ophiel continues: 

 

The ‘Imaginary’ figure is to have a human form, i.e., it will have a body like a person, a head,
middle, legs and feet = just like the, tactile-feeling-figure = of the/your = basic cosmic egg =
which is;

 

Egg = whole body.

Sphere = head.

Inverted Pyramid = torso.

Bowl = hips/pelvis/crotch. 



Cube = thighs/legs/feet. 

 

This, the above ‘body/structure’ of, the basic five elemental tattva symbols, is where the/your,
daily practice of the/your basic cosmic egg - ‘pays dividends?’, as, because, now = you! = the
reader/occultist(?)  =  NOW HAVE FIRST HAND/FIRST
PERSON/PERSONAL/INDIVIDUAL =  EXPERIENCE/GNOSIS =
KNOWLEDGE/KNOWING!?! =WHICH YOU = CONSCIOUS-NESS = CAN TEST! TRY!
USE! = AND ‘APPLY’!?! 

 

For example, let us say that your name begins with an, S. Looking at the table you find that S
is fierce, active and epicene but rather male than female (‘Epicene’ means that it is nether
male nor female appearing.) So, the head of the figure will be  psychically-tactilely-felt as;
fierce, active (moving).  Neither distinctly male nor female but  psychically-tactilely-felt as;
slightly more male than female, if S was in the middle of the word/name then the middle of
the figure/name/word would be  psychically-tactilely-felt as; fierce, active, etc. If S were at
the end of the name then the feet would have these characteristics = psychically-tactilely-felt
as; (Fierce, active, moving).

Ophiel continues with this next part: “Start your work by making up a mental image for your
present name and examine it closely, if your name is too short and/or the image does not suit
you, make up another name that you do like and can make a good image of. Or, you can
make up the image first that you do like and ‘THEN MAKE UP A NAME FROM THE
IMAGE’ So, the first thing to do is to build up an image of our present name with the ‘EL’
added, when you find a name and image that you feel satisfied with, keep them and keep
them ‘ALIVE’ in your mind at all times. ‘THIS IS YOUR BASIC CONTACT WITH THE
INNER PLANES’ Speak the name out loud many times! Talk to this image and ‘TELL IT’,
what you ‘Want!’ As you learn more, you can add or take away letters, as your concept of
yourself changes or as your life desires change.” End quote. 

 

For context, read thusly;   

 

Start your work by making up a, psychically-tactile-feeling-image, of/for, your present name
and examine it closely, if your name is too short and/or the psychically-tactile-feeling-image,
does not suit you, make up another name that you do like and can make a psychically-tactile-
feeling-image, of. Or, you can make up the  psychic-tactile-feeling-image first, that you do
like  and  ‘THEN  MAKE  UP  A  NAME,  FROM,  THE  PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEELING-
IMAGE’. So, the first thing to do is to ‘build up’ a  psychic-tactile-feeling-image of, your
present name with the ‘EL’ added; when you find a name and psychic-tactile-feeling-image,



that you feel satisfied with, keep them and keep them ‘ALIVE’ in your Psychic-Mind = #1! at
all  times,  by/with/through  =  psychic-tactilely-feeling;  defining;  three-dimensional-ising;
symbol-ising and #1,  Malkuth Earth/Hades  handling/touching your ‘IT’;  ‘THIS IS YOUR
CONSCIOUS-NESS  -  BASIC  CONTACT  WITH  THE  INNER  PLANES  =
ENDING/STARTING WITH!?! = The/Your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!?! Psychically-
Tactilely-Feel = the name!?! As this/your psychic-tactile-feeling = IS YOU = CONSCIOUS-
NESS = Calling/Speaking  Out  Loud!?!  EVERY TIME YOU ‘DO’  THIS!  This  is  you  =
Conscious-ness = Tactile-Feeling-Talking-Speaking-Dialoguing-Communicating-Conversing
= to/with this/your ‘image’ and you are ‘TELLING IT’ = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane =
YOU! What ‘IT!?!’ = IS!! That you = #0 &+ #3 = ‘Want!’ As you learn more, you can add or
take away tactile-feelings-letters, as your concept of yourself changes or as your life desires
changes.

 

Then we read this part, from Ophiel;

 

“Now  let  us  suppose  that  you  want  some  certain  ‘THING’  if  this  ‘THING’  is  in  your
‘SPHERE OF AVAILABILITY’.  (See my book, The Art and Practice of Getting Material
Things  Through  Creative  Visualisation.)  You  can  get  it  much  faster  by  creating  the
name/image/figure of it on the ‘Astral Plane’ and also by ‘USING’ this image in addition to
the other ‘VISUALISATION’ work you do on it.   Look at the picture of the thing you desire
first and then switch to this imagination image of its name and then speak the ‘SOUNDS’ of
the name. Another thing you can do with this imagination image of the name of the ‘THING’
you want is to blend it with your own name/image. Do this on paper first, of course. Put down
the name of what you want, then the figure of your name and then blend them together. Make
up another  image of what  this  blended figure  would look like  and ‘USE’  that  as you do
further work in getting what you want into your possession. See what word this new blended
image makes and ‘SOUND THAT NAME TOO’.  (This  work is  called ‘ INVOKING’ (in-
voice).” End quote. 

 

Context reads thusly; 

 

Now  let  us  suppose  that  you  want  some  certain  ‘THING’  if  this  ‘THING’  is  in  your
‘SPHERE OF AVAILABILITY’.  (See my book, The Art and Practice of Getting Material
Things Through Creative Visualisation.) You can get it much faster by creating the, psychic-
tactile-feeling-name/image/figure of it,  in/on the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane’ and
also  by/with  ‘USING’  this  psychic-tactile-feeling-image  in  addition  to  the  other
‘VISUALISATION’  work you do on it.  Psychically-Tactilely-Feel the ‘thing’  you desire



first  and  then  switch  to  the/its,  defined-three-dimensional-symbol-image  of  its  psychic-
tactile-feeling,  and  become  aware,  awake,  conscious  to  the  knowledge/knowing,  that
this/these  actions/doings in/on  the/your  #1,  malkuth  earth/hades  plane  IS/ARE!?!  The
‘SOUNDS’ (Vibrations/Emanations) of/for the/that/this = name. 

 

Another thing you can do with this imagination psychic-tactile-feeling-image of the name of
the ‘THING’ you want, is  to blend it  with your own  psychic-tactile-feeling-name/#3 ego-
image. Do this  on paper first,  of course.  Put  down the name of what you want,  then the
psychic-tactile-feeling-figure of your ‘own’ name, and then blend these two psychic-tactile-
feelings ‘together’.  Make  up  another  psychic-tactile-feeling-image  of  what  this  blended-
tactile-feeling-figure would psychic-tactilely-feel like, and ‘USE’ that, as you do further work
in getting what you want into your possession. See what word this new blended-  psychic-
tactile-feeling-image  makes,  and  ‘SOUND  THAT  NAME  TOO’.  (This  work  is  called
‘INVOKING’ (in-voice = psychic-tactile-feeling)) 

 

The/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades - psychic-tactile-feeling body = IS! IS! = THE/YOUR =
BELIEVING-BODY!?! = AS SOON AS!?! = THE/YOUR #3, EGO BODY = STOPS!?! =
ACTIVELY STARING!?!  =  NOT ME!  NOT MINE!  NOT THIS!  NOT HERE!  OVER
THERE!  ELSE!  OTHER!  SEPARATE!  APART!  DIFFERENT!?!  AND STARTS/IS
‘ABLE!?!’ = TO SIMPLY = OBSERVE!?! AND NOT JUDGE!?! THEN! THEN! = YOU! =
CONSCIOUS-NESS!?! =  CAN/WILL/SHALL =  BELIEVE!?! Remember!  Recall! = That
the/your #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality body = you? = PIGGY-BACKS!?!
IN/ON = Conscious-ness!?! Put this to the test! Try it! Use it! 

 

Here is how Ophiel finishes off his/this vignette: 

 

“‘Use’ the above instructions when you want some ‘THING’ but do remember the ‘LAWS’
characteristic of the ‘PHYSICAL PLANE’ the physical plane is stable and is subject to slow
changes only, not to fast changes. So ‘DO’ give ‘TIME’ for the effects of your ‘INVOKING’
work, to affect the physical plane and come into your possession. Another important thing to
remember about the physical plane is that the ‘WORKINGS’ OF YOUR INVOKING DO
NOT COME DOWN LIKE FIRE OUT OF HEAVEN BUT COME ACCORDING TO THE
‘WAYS’ THAT PHYSICAL THINGS COME ON THIS PHYSICAL PLANE. The physical
‘THINGS’ that you get through your invocations will ‘COME’ like accidents or coincidences
and in  a  ‘VERY NATURAL WAY’ your  friends  will  say that  there  was  no  ‘OCCULT
POWER’ involved, that these things would have come to you anyhow! ‘YOU WILL KNOW
BETTER!’”  End quote. 



 

In the ‘context’ of the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, we read thusly: 

 

Use, the above instructions when you want some ‘THING’, but do remember the ‘LAWS’
characteristic of the ‘PHYSICAL PLANE’, the physical plane is stable and is subject to slow
changes only, not to fast changes. So ‘DO’ give ‘TIME’ for the belief; believe; believing;
believed, of your ‘PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEELING-INVOKING’ work, to affect the/your #0,
outer,  outer  physically  physical  plane  and come  into  your  possession.  Another  important
thing to remember about the physical plane is that, the ‘WORKINGS’ OF YOUR PSYCHIC-
TACTILE-FEELING-INVOKING,  DO  NOT  COME  DOWN  LIKE  FIRE  OUT  OF
HEAVEN BUT COME ACCORDING TO THE ‘WAYS/PATTERNS’ THAT PHYSICAL
THINGS ‘COME’ ON THIS PHYSICAL PLANE. The physically physical ‘THINGS’, that
you  get  through  your  psychic-tactile-feeling-invoking’s will  ‘COME’,  like  accidents  or
coincidences, and in a ‘VERY NATURAL WAY/MANNER’ and your friends will say, that
there was no ‘OCCULT POWER’ involved, that these ‘things = meetings!’ would have come
to you anyhow! ‘YOU WILL KNOW BETTER!’

 

The  ‘truth?’  IS!?!  =  THAT  YOU,  THE  READER/OCCULTIST(?)  =  WILL/SHALL  =
KNOW-BETTER!?!  AND  IT/THIS  ‘PERSONAL-INDIVIDUAL-KNOWING-
EXPERIENCE!?!’, WILL BE/SHALL BE = OF THE ‘GNOSIS’ = TYPE/KIND!?! 

 

Thank you.


