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Here is a brief scan, of where we are ‘at’, etymologically, at the moment.

 

#0 = Idein/Eidenai = to see = physically physical = actions/doings.

#0 = Faith = to persuade; to convince = by with = physical actions/doings.

#3 = Judge = to reveal; to show; to display = not me; not mine; else; other.

#1 = Dark-ness; Black-ness; Blind-ness = Black-on-Black = psychological.

#1 = Psyche = psychological tactile-feeling = as if/as though blind.

#1 = Belief = to trust = what is, tactilely-fel  t  .

#1 = Fear = to test; to try.

#1 = Worship = to value; to honour; from - wert/worth = to bend back in/on.

#2 = Eidolon/Oeides/Eidos = form/shape/resemblance/like-ness = reflection.

#2 = Eros = desired object; circumstance; thing; it!

Conscious-ness = is = Duality!

Duality = is = Conscious-ness! 

Duality = all = In/on the same/one plane!

 

To,  change;  develop;  enhance;  increase  #1,  psychic-tactile-feeling;  define-ing;  three-dimensional-ising;  symbol-ising,
the/your two basic exercises of; cosmic egg exercise and/or chair exercises are/have been recommended, suggested, as a
‘possible’ method/approach, as they = egg/chair = incorporate/inculcate = all of the basic list above. Please do not just read
this, but put it to the immediate test, try, use; to see ‘if?’, these exercises is/are, for you, the reader/operator/occultist(?), at
this time in your ‘occult’ life/living.

 

The ‘objective’ of/for the/these ‘monologues’, is/are for those individuals who are having/experiencing ‘difficulty’, with
Ophiel’s materials, through no ‘fault of’ Ophiel’s materials, but simply one of ‘individual’ circumstance/situation, where
their ‘occult?’, is not ‘working/operating?’ = for them. These ‘reasons’ of/for ‘not working’ is/are as unique/individual, as is
the  operator/occultist  themselves.  So,  the  information/tuition,  can  only  ‘be’,  on  a  very,  varied  and  ‘common’,  set  of
‘norms?’.

 

#0, Outer, outer physically physical plane!

#1, Malkuth earth/hades psychological psychic-tactile-feeling plane!

#2, Etheric reflecting plane!

#3, Ego/Personality body/mass/construct!

 

#3, Ego Body = CANNOT/DOES NOT = JUDGE = Show/Reveal/Display = in/on the #1, plane/level!?!

#3, Ego Body = IS!?! = Attracted = in/on the #2, plane/level!?! = And so! = DOES NOT DELIVER!?!



#3, Ego Body = IS!?! = Reflected = in/on the #2, plane/level!?! = And so! = DOES NOT DELIVER!?!

#3, Ego Body = IS!?! = Narcissus = in/on the #2, plane/level!?! And so! = DOES NOT DELIVER!?!

 

TO ‘DELIVER!?!’  =  in/on  the/your  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane/Level,  you,  conscious-ness  =  MUST =
PSYCHICALLY-TACTILELY-FEEL!?!

 

#0 = Faith - to persuade; to convince = through/by/with - #0, outer physically physical actions/doings!

#1 = Belief – to trust; define; three-dimensional-ise; symbol-ise, through/by/with #1, psychic-tactile-feeling!

 

#1, Body = psychic-tactile-feeling, Moves; Animates; Motivates #0, Outer, outer physically physical = YOU!

#0, Body = psychic-actions/doings = Moves; Animates; Motivates = #1, Malkuth earth/hades = YOU!

 

If  you!  the  reader/occultist(?),  knew/understood(?),  that  to  ‘worship?’,  means/meant?  That whatever(?),  you!  =  THE
WORSHIPER/DEVOTEE/BELIEVER(?)  =  PSYCHOLOGICALLY  PSYCHICALLY-TACTILELY-FELT =
WOULD/WILL/SHALL!?! = BEND-BACK-IN/ON-YOU!?! = #0 &+ #3!?! = WOULD YOU = CONSCIOUS-NESS?? =
MODIFY? OR EXPAND!?! = THE/YOUR #0 &+ #3 = BEHAVIOUR!?! = ACTIONS/DOINGS!?! = SO THAT YOU –
CONSCIOUS-NESS = AGREE-WITH-YOU! = #1!?! 

 

WOULD YOU = #0 &+ #3 = WORSHIP!?! = DIFFERENTLY!?! 

 

For instance, example!?! The present writer = worships!?! = the/their basic cosmic egg exercise and basic chair exercise =
every-day! = more than once!?!

 

For instance, example!?! The present writer = worships!?! = the/their basic cosmic egg exercise and basic chair exercise =
every-day! = and looks back at!?! = their ‘self?’ = every-day!?!  (See/read ‘monologue’ 6 of 17 he chose me. 2021) 

 

Please note; the present writer doesn’t spend  all day!?! Doing this/these things!! (Otherwise, they would be walking into
walls or get run over crossing the road, or all the ‘other stupid’ things, that goes on in daily life/living?) but… there is/are
times in the day, when simply, turning inwards, and ‘observing’, the five elemental forces/symbols, within them, about them,
surrounding  them,  is/does/makes  =  them/these  =  forces/symbols =  AS  ‘REAL!?!’  AS!?!  =  The  present  writer  =  #0,
THEM/THEIR ‘SELVES!?!’. 

 

Please note; a  ‘little’  occult,  for  you, the reader; when the present writer;  looks-back;  looks-behind;  looks-down!?!  On
their/them ‘selves!?!’ #1 to #0 = the/their ‘conscious-ness’ = observes = THE ‘BACK!?!’ = OF THE/THEIR = HEAD &
BODY = AS THEY FACE-AWAY-FROM! = THE ‘VIEWER/OBSERVER’!?! This ‘process = looking back/behind’ is a
‘part’ of the, basic cosmic egg exercise. When an individual, has practiced enough with psychically-tactilely-feeling; define-
ing;  three-dimensional-ising  and  symbol-ising, the  five  basic  elemental  forces symbols,  within  them/about  them  and
surrounding them = #1 &+ #0, the ‘innate’ sensation, sense-feelings, of; this is ‘real?’, this is ‘me?’, this is ‘who/what I –
conscious-ness – am!?!’, etc, etc. 

 

As you ‘look back’, ‘look behind’, ‘look at’? The/your #1, malkuth earth/hades plane body, there is the ‘shape of’, the/your



#0, outer, outer physically physical body = in black!?! And as you = conscious-ness = observe ‘it’ = your #1, body. You =
conscious-ness = are to be ‘located’ = behind and above your ‘head’ = slightly over to/towards, the/your ‘left-side’, as you
‘observe’ the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades body. 

 

Egg = whole body.

Sphere = head.

Inverted Pyramid = torso.

Bowl = hips/pelvis/crotch.

Cube = thighs/legs/feet. 

 

You,  the  practitioner/operator/occultist(?),  should  be  able/capable  of,  psychically-tactilely-feeling,  all  of  the,  above
description/explanation, in/on the/your #0 &+ #1 bodies, very, very quickly, and should have(?), very little ‘difficulty?’ in
application!?! 

 

Everybody ‘knows?’ = what(?) = they like?

Everybody ‘knows?’ = what(?) = they would like?

Everybody ‘knows?’ = they think(?) = they ‘know’!?! 

But…? = not! everybody ‘knows?’ = what(?) = they believe in?

Even though? = everybody ‘thinks?’ they ‘know’!?! 

 

The above; everybody knows = is #3, ego body you!?! 

The above; believe in? = is #1, malkuth earth/hades!?!

 

As soon as the present writer = knew/understood? = that they =  couldn’t change/alter? = the/this/their =  very last plane
(See/read Ophiel’  for this ‘final/end plane!?!’) =  BUT COULD ONLY!  ONLY! =  USE IT =  THE ‘PRESSURE’  WAS
‘OFF!?!’ 

 

As soon as the present writer = knew/understood? = that they = couldn’t/can’t = change/alter? = the/this/their = very last
plane (See/read Ophiel’ for this ‘final/end plane!?!’) = BUT COULD ONLY!  ONLY! = USE IT = THE ‘PRESSURE’ =
WAS OFF!?! 

 

(See/read Ophiel’s book; Talismanic Magic, his chapter: Charging a Talisman.) 

In his book; Talismanic Magic; his chapter: Charging a Talisman, Ophiel writes:

 

“Regarding the methods of charging, begin to think of the process in somewhat modern terms of magnetizing. You are at
liberty to use any and all methods you fancy. If you feel you want to develop and use an elaborate ceremony, then do so by
all means. You can find a number of different books, some of which are listed at the end of this book. However, keep in the
secret recesses of your mind, the Understanding that what you are doing basically is connecting the (Christian-called “living
Water”) Astral Light to the Talisman object you have chosen. This is done, I expect, by almost any method AS LONG AS



YOU KNOW WHAT YOU ARE DOING. INTENTION IS THE MAGIC POWER THAT DOES IT.” End quote.

 

For context, we read thusly: Regarding the methods of charging, begin to think of the process in somewhat modern terms of
magnetizing. You are at liberty to use any and all methods you fancy; However, keep in the secret recesses of your mind, the
Understanding, that what you are doing basically is connecting the Black-on-Black = Black-Astral-Light to your, Talisman
object, which you have chosen. When this is done, by a ‘chosen’ method = THEN THE/THAT ‘METHOD’ = MUST BE
‘COMPATIBLE-WITH’ = WHATEVER PLANE/LEVEL = THAT YOU AS THE ‘OPERATOR’ HAVE ‘CHOSEN’!?!
BUT AS LONG AS YOU ‘KNOW’, WHAT YOU ARE DOING!?! PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEELING!!! = IS THE ‘MAGIC
POWER’ THAT DOES IT.

 

Psychic-Tactile-Feeling =  starts/begins  with  =  Akasha-of-Akasha!?!  Where akasha behaves  like  elemental  earth,  even
though there is no elemental earth there yet! Here it is from Ophiel, his book; Caballa Magic, chapter: Chapter 4 Workings: 

 

“Ophiel does not claim, again, to have the whole answer to IT ALL. I write what my pen puts down. I never know at the
beginning of a sentence what the end of a sentence will be. Ophiel’s material can be TESTED, and do test it. Don’t accept it
blindly. Test it. Learn to Etheric project. Learn to Creatively Visualize. Develop some clairvoyance. So, that is the test. Test
it. There was one factual point I overlooked in the previous presentation. Take a look at the Tree again: Fig. 1a. Note: Each
of the three (3) Sephiroth triangles has Air, Fire, and Water in it, but no apparent element of Earth, except you can see the
word Earth repeated three times. Please note: in this case the Element Earth is represented by the next three, lower down
Sephiroth!!!” End quote. 

 

So, for ‘context’ and ‘explanation’,  we take the above quote  above, from Ophiel,  and we slightly amend/adjust  it,  for
the/our/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, so that it reads thusly: 

 

The ‘materials of’ the/your #1, malkuth earth/hades,  black-on-black,  black-astral-light; can be/should be tested; tried and
used,  by  you,  the  reader.  All  of  the  #1,  malkuth  earth/hades  is  ‘based  on’,  the/a/an  ‘individuals’  personal/personally
developed; enhanced; increased = knowing/knowledge/understanding and practicing of = daily conscious contact/connection
=  to/with  the  individuals  ‘own’  =  psychological  tactile-feeling;  define-ing;  three-dimensional-ising;  symbol-ising  and
believing!?!  Of those objects; circumstances; things  and/or  ‘its’,  which = conscious-ness and the/their  #0,  Outer,  outer
physically physical body desires; wants; needs and broods on. Please do not just read the above; 

 

Learn to Psychically-Tactilely-Feel = Visualisations! = in/on the/your #2, Etheric Plane!

Learn to Psychically-Tactilely-Feel = Physical actions/doings! = in/on the/your #0, Outer physical plane!

Learn to Psychically-Tactilely-Feel = Psychologically = in/on the/your #1 Malkuth earth/hades plane!

Learn to understand = Psychological Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing = IS!! = The/your = Elemental Earth Force!

Learn to put it to the test! = do/practice the basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercises! 

 

Test it;  Try it;  Use it!  So that/this =  is! =  the test!?! =  FOR!!! = the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!?! Ophiel’s
materials are for the/your #2, Etheric Plane!?! And, if  you do/are able  to ‘succeed’ in Ophiel’s methods of  #2, Etheric
Projection, it should only take you a ‘few moments’, to find/discover and use, the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Psychic-
Tactile-Feel-ing Plane!?! (See/read Ophiel’s vignette: An Exercise in Preliminary Projection.)

 



The  ‘difficulty?’,  that  most  normal/average  person’s/individuals,  get/have,  is  that  they  are;  #3,  Ego  Body;  Present
Incarnation; Personality Body = Dominated!?! And, as already pointed out; #3 Ego Body You = PIGGY-BACKS!?! = in/on
Conscious-ness!?! Thus; if you are #0, Outer, outer physically physical body = Tactile-Dominated!?! Then, chances are, that
there  is  ‘no’  occult(?),  that  is  ever,  ever,  going  to  ‘work?’,  for  you!?!  Sometimes,  in  your  life/living,  you  will
have/meet/encounter = Lucky/Fortunate Circumstances; Un-lucky/Fortunate Circumstances = but… in either case/situation =
it will ‘be’ = JUST LUCK! = There will be/is/are, no ‘outside?’ influences/circumstances!?! 

 

There is/are many, many persons/individuals who are ‘drawn?’, to the ‘occult??’, and ‘believe?’, in = witches/warlocks;
demons/angels; candles/crystal balls/skulls; lotions/potions; spells/words of power/prayers; lucky charms/talismans; and all
manner of ‘shite!?!’ = just because they/their #3, Ego Body = wants to ‘be!?!’ = the ‘centre’ of/for = attraction!?! = me! me!
me! = just because #3 = me! me! me! = wants sex! money! power!?! = given to them!?! = for ‘nothing’!?!

 

The basic laws, rules & governances, of/for the lower planes, is/are(?) = there is = nothing!! for nothing!?! = there must!?!
must!?! = be!!! = a/an = exchange!?! = between planes!?! and! and! the laws; rules; governances of/for!?! each plane!?! =
must be!?! learned; practiced; tested; tried; used!?! = used!! plane-to-plane!?! 

 

So, in keeping with the above(?), do you = the reader/occultist(?) = BELIEVE!?! = #0? #1? #3?

 

#0 = physical = use; using; used; actions; doings!

#1 = belief = psychic-tactile-feeling; define-ing; three-dimensional-ising; symbol-ising!

#3 = feels nothing = no belief = observe; observed; observing! 

 

#3 = dominated = stare-ing; watch-ing; see-ing; look-ing = no belief/no psychic-tactile-feeling! 

 

Belief = From the German; galaub = dear; esteemed; to care; desire; love = from ga+leubh.

Belief = Meaning ‘conviction of truth’ without proposition/fact/knowledge is from the 1500’s.

Belief = Meaning ‘to trust’, became ‘extended from’ the ‘individual trust’ = to ‘trust’ in God.

Faith = Meant/means; Loyalty in a/an = action/doing = based on a promise!?!

 

As you can see/read above, most average person’s knowledge/knowing/understands/experience of the ‘difference?’, between
the ‘workings’ of/for = Faith; Belief = are woefully ‘inadequate’ for ‘occult’ work/working!?! 

 

Could you/can you? The reader/occultist, take the above information, and  apply it(?), to the/your basic cosmic egg/chair
work/practices!?!

 

Could  you/can  you?  The  reader/occultist,  take  the  above  information,  and  apply it(?),  to  the/your  talismans;  treasure
map/charts; little system of/for projection; ritual; tattva!?!  

 

Belief = to trust = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane = psychic-tactile-feel-ing!



Faith = loyalty; to persuade/convince = #0, Outer Physical Earth Plane = action-do-ing! 

 

Ing = was attached to verbs; meaning = whatever action; doing; product; material. From the Proto-Germanic word; unga/inga
= meaning a habitual/accepted ‘action/doing’ was/is ‘completed. When ‘ing’, was used in verbs or adjectives, derived from
the Old English ‘ende’, From the Proto-Indo-European Root ‘nt’; 

 

This ‘nt’ (aren’t/isn’t/won’t/don’t etc.) was weakened in late Old English, when the spelling with a/the ‘g’ began (13 th 14th

century) amongst the Anglo-Norman scribes, who mistook/confused it = nt; with = ing = aren’t; isn’t; won’t/don’t etc =
Stop/Halt! Ing = action/do-ing = work-ing; happen-ing; Test-ing; Try-ing; Use-ing = #1 = Now-Time! #0 = Real-Time!

 

Thank you.


