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Imagine(?), if you can, a/an object; circumstance; thing and/or it – as a psychic-tactile-feel-
ing! There is only(!) only(!), one plane(!), where you – Conscious, as a ‘ness,’ can have(!) a
psychic-tactile-feel-ing!  That/this  plane is = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane! THE/YOUR
#1,  MALKUTH  EARTH/HADES  PLANE  =  IS!  =  BETWEEN!?!  –  THE/YOUR  #2,
ETHERIC  PLANE AND THE/YOUR  #0,  OUTER,  OUTER  PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL
PLANE!?! WHAT IS IT??? ABOUT THIS???? = THAT YOU!! – THE ‘OCCULTIST??’,
READING THIS – DON’T GET/AREN’T GETTING?! (You can, only USE! the/your Outer
Physical Plane?!)

 

There is/are many, many persons/individuals, who just do not ‘realise?’, just how close; near;
simple  –  it  all  is?  Obviously(?),  there  is  much that  has  been lost  in  ‘translation,’  and in
‘understanding,’ but… when it is spelled out(?) (No ‘pun’ intended!), at the very ‘least?’, you
would  think/imagine(?),  that  even  the  ‘slowest,’  amongst  us,  would  be/should  be,
able/capable, of getting at ‘least?’, something(?) out of it!?! (The ‘information,’ parts.) 

 

Here, once again, is/are, the three planes/levels, with which, the reader; operator; practitioner;
occultist(?), is working/operating with; 

 

#0, Outer, outer physically physical plane = use; use-ing; uses; used.

#1, Malkuth earth/hades plane = psychic-tactile-feel-ing = define; three-dimensional; symbol-
ical. 

#2, Etheric plane = reflect; reflecting; reflected, (visualised.)

 

In any/all ‘occult,’ operations, the individual always, starts/begins, with the/their #0, Outer,
outer  physically  physical  body  actions/doing –  use;  use-ing;  uses;  used!  This/these
actions/doings =  IS/ARE!?!  –  the  ‘LANGUAGE OF/FOR’  the/your  #0,  Outer,  outer
physically physical plane,  in order to –  COMMUNICATE;  DIALOGUE;  SPEAK;  TALK;
CONVERSE; WITH? – the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane/Level!?! 

 

The ‘body = mass?’,  that  is  in/on the/your #1,  Malkuth Earth/Hades  Plane/Level  –  IS! –
the/your  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing body? The word ‘Psyche,’ is from the Greek, and means;
Animating Spirit –  that which ‘moves,’ the/your #0, Outer, outer physically physical body.
This/these  actions/doings =  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing  =  IS/ARE!?!  –  the  ‘LANGUAGE



OF/FOR’ of/for the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane,  in order to –  COMMUNICATE;
DIALOGUE; SPEAK; TALK; CONVERSE; WITH!?! – the/your #2, Etheric Plane/Level!?!
&+ WITH!?! – the/your #0, Outer, outer physically physical plane/level!?! 

 

From -  #0  –  language  –  action/doing!?!  –  Praying;  Ritual;  Talismans;  Tokens;  Treasure
Maps/Charts; Icons, etc, etc to #1. Here it is, from Ophiel, from his book; A & P of Occult;
his chapter: More Ritual Knowledge:

 

“All the magic, all the witchcraft, all the God stuff and all the Devil stuff and all the Witch
Doctor  stuff  you  have  heard  about,  is  nothing,  I  repeat,  nothing  but  the  effect  of  the
Elemental  Forces,  whether  automatic  or  consciously  worked.  These  Forces  work
automatically until they are taken over by some ‘strong-willed,’ person, (other things besides
will enter into it) AND THEY WORK FOR HIM.” End quote.    

 

 

Please note carefully,  as this  ‘distinction,’ is  very ‘subtle,’ and can be,  if  understood and
applied to the correct workings: this has already been presented, in previous ‘monologues.’

 

Element = essence; substance; foundation of:

Elemental = pertaining to the powers of; 

 

Element (noun.) From the Latin; Elementum – first principle; of ‘matter,’ in its basic form.
The word used for this, is; Greek; stoikheion, whose origin and original sense/meaning, is
unknown. The ‘idea,’ of the ‘simplest/easiest,’ part or component of a ‘complex substance,’ is

a/an ‘Element,’, from the late 14th century.

 

Elemental (adjective.) From the Latin; Elementus – meaning; pertaining to the powers of; is
from 1823. 

 

In the Occult literature from 1877, a/an ‘Elemental,’ was something/anything, which ‘partook
of  the  nature of?’,  a/an ‘Element.’  The  ‘subtlety/nuance,’  of  this,  was/is,  ‘lost?’,  on  the
average(?),  occult  student,  because  those  who  were/are  ‘supposed?’  to  ‘know?’,  of  these
things, and what they meant/mean(?) didn’t!?! 

 

Thus, there is much that, would/could work(?), if a person/individual, is given the opportunity



to ‘work,’ at it/with it: Here it is, from Ophiel, from his first book; Astral Projection, his first
chapter; Little System:

 

“And the Second thing is – You should know that no-thing in the physical-world-universe is
what it is supposed to be, or is, according to what people think it is . This is especially true
about the Inner Planes. Everything about the Inner Planes is different than what it is supposed
or  thought  to  be.  Different  from  what  the  churches  say  it  is  –  different  from  what  the
Spiritualists say it is. On the one hand, there are widely held ideas that are true and also, there
are certain fundamental things that are true. On the other hand, there are many widely held
ideas that are not true and many fundamental conceptions that are not true.  In many cases,
things do not work, because basic theory is wrong, but would work if a little knowledge was
introduced. Many times, a thing works, as I said; BUT NOT BECAUSE OF THE REASON
THAT IS GIVEN FOR IT WORKING, AND WITH THE RESULTS THAT YOU MIGHT
EXPECT.” End quote.

 

So, here is the/a ‘way?’, of ‘working?’, for each of the basic Tattva Planes;

 

Element of #0, Physical Earth = basic substance; essence; foundation of;

Elemental of #0, Physical Earth = pertaining to the powers; laws; rules & governance of;

 

Element of the Element #1, Malkuth Hades/Earth = basic substance; essence; foundation of;

Elemental of the Element #1, Malkuth Hades/Earth = pertaining to the powers; laws; rules &
governance of;

 

Element of the Element #2 Etheric = basic substance; essence; foundation of;

Elemental of the Element #2, Etheric= pertaining to the powers; laws; rules & governance of;

 

The/your #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality Body, is a ‘Construct of,’ the/your
#1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, and PARTAKES OF THE ‘NATURE OF!?!’ = The/your #1,
Malkuth Earth/Hades – ELEME  NT  !?! OF? = The/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!?!

 

The/your #3,  Ego Body,  Present  Incarnation,  Personality  Body,  as(?)  =  a ‘Construct  of,’
the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, and PARTAKING OF?) THE ‘NATURE OF!?!’ =
The/your  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  –  ELEME  NT  !?!  OF?  =  The/your  #1,  Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane!?! = IS WHAT ‘CAUSES?’, ‘CREATES?’, ‘MAKES?’ = ALL OF THE –



UPS &  DOWNS!?!  OF/IN/ON!?!  =  THE/YOUR  #0,  OUTER,  OUTER  PHYSICALLY
PHYSICAL EARTH PLANE!?! 

 

AND! THE ‘REASON?’, OF/FOR THIS/THESE THINGS!?! (UPS & DOWNS!?!) IS? IS! =
THE/YOUR #3, EGO BODY, PRESENT INCARNATION, PERSONALITY BODY = IS?
IS!  =  A/AN ‘ELEMENT  AL  !?!’  IN/ON  THE  PLANE/LEVEL  OF!?!  THE/YOUR  #1,
MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE ELEMENT!?!

 

Side note; the ‘enormity?’ of/for the above ‘occult!’, is an ‘example/demonstration,’ of what
is  ‘meant?’,  by/with  ‘wasted?’,  on  many  occult(?)  students?  So!  As  an,
example/demonstration(?), try this; 

 

The/your #3,  Ego Body,  Present Incarnation,  Personality body you =  IS NOT!  NOT! #0,
Outer, Outer Physically Physical You! 

 

The/your #3,  Ego Body,  Present Incarnation,  Personality body you =  IS NOT!  NOT! #2,
Etheric Plane You!

 

The/your  #3,  Ego  Body,  Present  Incarnation,  Personality  body  you  =  IS NOT!  NOT!
Conscious-ness You! 

 

The/your #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality body you = IS! IS! #1, MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES You!  =  A/AN =  ELEMENTAL?  =  OF/FOR/IN/ON!?!  =  THE/YOUR
ELEMENT OF  –  THE  ELEMENT EARTH!?!  =  MALKUTH  EARTH!?!  –  the  word
‘Malkuth,’ is/means; Kingdom; Dwelling Place; Home of!?!

 

Once a person/individual ‘grasps?’, the ‘significance?’, of/for the above, and Laws; Rules &
Governances,  of/for  the/their  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane,  then  ‘things?’
can/do/will/shall(?), happen(?), occur(?), take place(?).

 

You = #0,  Outer,  outer  physically  physical you – Conscious,  as a  ‘ness,’ –  where  ‘born
without?’,  a #1,  Malkuth Earth/Hades #3,  Ego Body! IT - #3,  Ego Body,  came along(?),
several months (18/24) later, and then began to ‘eat the #0, outer, outer physically physical
world, with its/your #0, eyes!?!’ = I want! Give me that! This is mine! Leave it! Go away!
Leave me! I want that! Me! Me! Me! = #3, has entered the building!?! #3, Ego body, present



incarnation,  personality  body  you  =  NOW!?!  =  PIGGY-BACKS!?!  –  IN/ON YOU –
CONSCIOUS!?! = AT! AT! – THE/YOUR #0, Outer, outer physically physical you!?! 

 

The present writer, has never made any ‘secret?’, of the fact(?), that everyone/all, no matter
who(?),  or  how  developed(?)  occult(??),  that  they  are/happen  to  ‘be?’,  the  fact is(?),
everyone/all,  no matter who(?) =  PROJECTS FROM!?! = THE/THEIR - #1,  MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES  PLANE!?!  =  UP OR DOWN!?!  –  IT MATTERS NOT!  ONE JOT!?!
CONSCIOUSLY(?),  UN-CONSCIOUSLY(?)  =  IT MATTERS NOT!  ONE JOT!?!  =
BECAUSE IT IS!?! – WHAT!?! IT IS!?! 

 

The ‘juicy?’, part of it is? = even if, you, the reader, do not agree(?), with this, it is because
of(?), the/this – very same(?), #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality Body = THAT
IS SAYING(?)  THIS = I,  DON’T  AGREE, WITH THIS!?!  (letter  of  Saint  Augustine  of
Hippo!) 

 

ONCE  MORE!  FOR  ‘EMPHASIS!?!’,  ONCE  MORE!  FOR  ‘IN YOUR FACE!?!’  =
THE/YOUR  #3,  EGO  BODY,  PRESENT  INCARNATION,  PERSONALITY  BODY
YOU!?!  =  IS!  IS!  =  A/AN –  ELEMENTAL –  OF!?!  =  THE/YOUR  #1,  MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES PLANE!?! – ELEMENT OF EARTH!?!

 

Here is how Ophiel describes, writes this, from his book; Creative Visualisation, his chapter;
Law of the Barrier:

 

“Thus, this human speech of ours, due to its recent invention, does not pertain to the depth of
our being, our inner subconscious mind, but rather, speech pertains to our outer conscious
mind only. (You should know from your Occult studies, that you have two minds, an inner
one and an outer one; the outer one called the conscious mind and the inner one, called the
subconscious mind.) 

The existence of these two minds in you,  is what makes all the trouble in the world. Or,
maybe I should say; the separation, of these two minds makes all the trouble for you, in the
world. For those of you, who are ‘ready,’ for ‘higher things,’ I will drop a big fat juicy hint,
as to what illumination really is  – becoming a Master,  becoming an Adept,  BECOMING
LIKE A GOD, means the two minds fuse into one! Enough said!” End quote. (Capitols are
Ophiel’s.) (Underlines are the present writers.) 

 

The basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercises, is/are/for,  the ‘reduction/reducing?’,  of



the, ‘SEPARATION!?!’ of, the/these = TWO MINDS? (TWO ‘PARTS?’ OF THE ‘ONE?’ –
MIND!?!)

 

Having been ‘introduced?’,  to the information/knowledge/knowing(?),  of the ‘difference?’,
‘distinction?’,  of/for  the/your – Element(?),  from the/your –  Elemental(?),  and the  fact!?!
That  the/your  #3,  Ego  Body,  Present  Incarnation,  Personality  Body  =  YOU!  –  reading
this/these things(?)  IS!  IS! =  A/AN #1,  MALKUTH EARTH/HADES = ELEMENTAL =
IN/ON THE/YOUR #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES ELEMENT OF EARTH!?! What are
YOU? – CONSCIOUS!?! = NOW GOING TO ‘DO?’ ABOUT IT!?! 

 

Drum roll please! Once more, from the top! 

 

The/your #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality Body = YOU! –IS! IS! = A/AN #1,
MALKUTH  EARTH/HADES  =  ELEMENTAL =  IN/ON THE/YOUR #1,  MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES ELEMENT OF EARTH!?! = SO!?! What are YOU? – CONSCIOUS!?! =
GOING TO ‘DO?’ ABOUT IT!?! NOW!?!

 

The/your #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Construct Body = has one essential/natural(?)
working(?) function(?) and that is to = Judge; Judge-ing; Judges; Judged; Judgement, and the
word ‘Judge,’ comes from the Proto-Indo-European Root word; deik – to show; to reveal; to
observe; (Via, Psychically-Tactilely-Feel-ing.) 

 

Judge  =  Sanskrit;  dic  –  point  out/show.  Greek;  deiknynai  –  show/prove;  dike  –
usage/custom/habit. Latin; dicere – tell; show; say. German; zeigon/zeigen – to show. Old
English; teon – to accuse; taecan – to teach.

 

Observe, from the Latin; observare – watch over; note; heed; look to; attend to; guard; re-
guard; comply with. From; ob – in front of; ahead of; before of + servare – watch; keep safe.
From the PIE Root word; ser – protect.

 

The present writer has always; fell  about laughing(?), when they learned/discovered/found
out!?! That the/their #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality Body(?) – WAS/IS!?! =
LOCATED!?! –  IN/ON THE/THEIR = #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!?! What
does that/this ‘say?’, about the/your #0, Outer, Outer Physically Physical Plane/Body!?! Well,
let us not ‘fart’ about, and go straight to Ophiel, from his lesson one, in his; Correspondence
Course in Astral Projection: 



 

“There is another terrific concept that I must introduce to you, sooner or later, so I will now.
Also, this concept is so large, so big, so startling, that I don't know just how I can put it over,
as it is even too much for me to fully grasp in all its aspects. I will do the best I can but will
probably have to introduce this subject a piece at a time and come back to it  repeatedly,
which process I hope will not bore you too much.  So here goes. (The following is the most
profound concept I have ever come across in my years of Occult work, and it is so big that I
have  refrained  from  looking  at  it  too  much  because  I  felt  a  complete  incapability  of
comprehending it  ever to even its  simplest extent.  However,  we must all  face it  someday,
sometime,  so  here  is  a  start!)  IT  APPEARS THAT THE  PHYSICAL  PLANE  WORLD
DOES NOT, ‘EXIST,’ ‘AS SUCH,’ that is, as it appears to be. (Enough for now) One curious
outstanding  fact  regarding  the  above  statement  is  that,  ‘THIS  NEWLY  DISCOVERED
FACT,  THAT THE PHYSICAL PLANE DOES NOT EXIST AS SUCH,  CANNOT BE
COGNISED  BY YOU,  OR  BY ANY  MAN OR  WOMAN,  UNTIL  YOU  LEARN  TO
‘ENTER’ THE ‘INNER PLANES’ YOURSELF AND ‘LOOK BACK!!!’

I am no expert psychologist on dreams, or a psychologist at all, but I do suggest that the
action-appearance of dreams, being what they are, has all the ‘appearance’ – ‘actions’ one
would  expect,  IF  THE  ‘OUTER  PLANE  WORLD’  WAS  OUR  OWN  SELF-MAGIC-
CREATED-CREATION.  (I  don't  see  how it  could be  any different  in  any  great  respect
otherwise.) ‘The kind of stuff that dreams are made of.’ I am sorry to introduce this kind of
material here in a Course on Astral Projection, but all material evidence points the way it
does and the possible end results are too big to be overlooked. Besides, once this unexpected
new development is understood in some of even its minor aspects, great possibilities open up
- again too big for our casual comprehension - I don't know if I can handle it in my lifetime,
but you should know about it, and make a start on understanding it and using it. Would it be
asking too much of you to accept the above hypothesis for the time being and ACT - FEEL -
in the following lessons - as if it   were       true and see where this acceptance leads us  ?” End quote.
(Underlines are the present writers.)

 

ALL  THE  ‘TATTVA?’  THAT  YOU,  THE  READER/OCCULTIST(?),  WILL/SHALL
EVER USE!?! ‘IN’ YOUR #0, OUTER, OUTER PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL LIFE TIME!?!
= IS/ARE = IN/ON = THE/YOUR = #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!?!

 

The present writer  doesn't  know if  you,  the  reader/occultist(?),  can handle  it/this,  in your
lifetime/lifestyle,  but you should know about it, and make a start on understanding it  and
using it. 

Would it be asking too much of you, the reader/occultist(?), to accept the above hypothesis



for  the  time  being  and  ACT/ACTION  –  PSYCHICALLY-TACTILELY-FEEL -  in  the
prior/following  ‘monologues,’  -  AS  IF/AS THOUGH!  It  Were   True,  and  see  where  this
acceptance leads you!?!

 

There is/are several other folders to be posted as yet, so you will/shall just have to wait for
them, as they are presented in ‘sequence,’ The present writer is over 70 years old, and has
little ‘interest/inclination,’ in trying to ‘convince?’, ‘persuade?’, anyone of anything(?), when
you(?),  get  there(?),  there  is  nothing  to  be/needs  to  be  ‘said?’  –  you  can  only  ‘tell’  the
‘secret?’, to those who, know it already!?!

 

Whether  you  like  it  or  not(?)  (and  no  one  is  asking?),  the/your  #3,  Ego  Body,  Present
Incarnation, Personality Body, is! – in/on the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane; Element
of Earth! As a/an Elemental – pertaining to the powers of!?! and (#3), is(!), firmly ‘locked
in?’,  to  the/your  #0,  Conscious,  when  it,  your  Conscious,  is  in  a  ‘ness  –  protrusion;
projection; promontory; jutting forth; standing out,’ state/condition. When the/your  Psychic
body,  which  is  in/on  the  Element/Plane  of  the/your  Element of  Earth  =  WHERE IT!  –
the/your  PSYCHIC plane  body  =  TACTILELY-FEELS-BELIEVES!?!  AND!  IT IS
THE/YOUR/THIS -  #3,  EGO  BODY  WHO  =  Judge;  Judge-ing;  Judges;  Judged;
Judgement!?! (Shows/Reveals/Displays?) AND MAKES A ‘MESS!’ OF IT!?!

 

See/read Ophiel’s book; Clairvoyance, his chapter; The Two Minds, and see if(?), you can
‘tie in,’ Ophiel’s chapter, with the above information. As has already been pointed out!?! The
‘language?’, of/for the #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality Body = IS!?! – not me;
not  mine;  not  this;  not  that;  not  here;  not  now; over  there;  separate;  apart;  else; other!?!
(Hence, Saint Augustine of Hippo = #3 - Agree-With-Thine - #1!?!) 

 

What is it? About the/your #3, Ego Body, being a part/piece(?) of!?! – the/your #1, Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane(?), AND THEREFORE, A/AN INFLUENCE IN/OF/FOR? = THE FLOW
–  OF  THE/YOUR,  TATTVA-FORCES –  WITHIN YOU?  ABOUT YOU?  AND
SURROUNDING YOU? THAT YOU DON’T(?) GET??

 

As you(?),  if you(?),  are able to get the basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercises, to
‘WORK  FOR  YOU!’?  Then  the/your  #3,  Ego  Body,  will/shall  –  BE?  BECOME?  –
ACCUSTOMED?  –  TO STANDING ASIDE!?!  –  AND SIMPLY –  OBSERVE!?!  =
THUS(?)  –  ALLOWING YOU –  CONSCIOUS  &+  THE/YOUR  #1,  MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES PLANE!?! = TO BELIEVE!?! = TRUST!?! Here it is, from Ophiel’s book;
Clairvoyance, his chapter; Semi-Physical Types of Clairvoyance.



 

“As you let your perceptions roam out, you should come into contact with all kinds of layers
of though-waves and/or vibrations. These should register with you and make an impression
on you, somewhat the way, as if, you were a radio receiver! I cannot give you more detailed
instructions as to how to work this  process, but, if you will place yourself in the physical
positions of thought-wave receptions,  something will  happen,  and you will know when it
does.” End quote. (Underlines are the present writers.)  

 

The present writer has ‘presented,’ more detailed instructions as to how to work this process ,
via,  the/your #1,  Malkuth Earth/Hades –  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing Plane and  how(?) to go
about developing; enhancing, the/your latent/dormant – Psychic powers/abilities via the/your,
basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercises, allied to, many of the previous and to come,
‘monologues.’ 

 

It is ‘suggested?’, that much, of your confusion, is/comes/stems(?) from(?), the/your #3, un-
willing ‘ness,’ to ‘accept?’ that not everything ‘occult?’, lives and dies, on the ‘premiss,’ that
everything/all is = #2, Etheric, and that there is ‘no?’ malkuth earth/hades plane?? that there
is ‘no?’ – black-astral-light; black-on-black astra light, ‘no?’ Dark-ness; Black-ness; BLIND-
ness, and, above all,  that the/your #3, Ego Body, Present  Incarnation, Personality Body =
ISN’T!?! – IN/ON THE/YOUR #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!?! (Where  IT -
#3, SITS IN  JUDGEMENT!?! And so,  influences(?) - #0, Outer, outer physically physical
you!?! 

 

When/if,  you  –  Conscious,  as  a  ‘ness,’  gets  to  #2/#4,  the/your  #3,  will  be/shall  be;
absorbed(?), dissolved(?) merged? fused? (See/read Ophiel quote above.) For many years, the
present writer couldn’t/didn’t understand why(?), the #3, Ego Body(?), held such ‘sway,’ and
‘dominance?’  over  the/their  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane  –  Belief;  Believe;  Believed;
Believe-ing!?!  Nor,  did  the present writer,  understand(?),  who(?),  was the ‘Judge?’,  in/on
the/their,  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane(?),  but…  when  the  ‘penny  dropped?’,  things
were/are made better!?! made easier!?! (Consciously/Un-Consciously – wont’/don’t matter
one jot!! – still works/happens!?!) 

 

In the letter of Saint Augustine of Hippo, he advocates, that the individual, should;  Agree-
With? the Adversary; Opposer; Obstacle; but… in the present writers, experience(?), the #3,
Ego  Body,  unless  trained,  does  not,  for  an  instant(?),  Agree-With the/their  #1,  malkuth
earth/hades plane body, and the ‘more?’, that the #3, Ego Body, tries to ‘Dominate?’, then the
‘more?’, the #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane = is Resistant; is Inert; is Immobile; is Reflexed;



is  Opposed;  Adverse:  Obstinate;  IS!  doing(?), what comes =  NATURALLY!?! –  TO IT!?!
All of which, negative action, can be summed up, in a single word; DISBELIEF!?! 

 

Here  is  a  wonderful  occult,  for  you,  the  reader;  Be  still,  (Do  not  ‘judge?  =
show/reveal/display), and know(?), that I am - what? 

 

Thank you. 


