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This is what Ophiel writes, in his book; Clairvoyance, his chapter; The Two Minds:

“Now in your experimental sub-mind work you will have to evolve your own types of exercises, like the examples given, 
and carry them out successfully. You have to release all conscious-mind control and practice allowing the sub-mind to take 
over, and this gives rise to a very queer feeling, as if you seem to be losing control over your objective world. Practice this 
until you note a degree of entry of the sub-mind into the objective world, which is all you want, a degree of entry, and a 
degree is all you need to greatly improve and sharpen up your life.” End quote. (Underlines are the present writers.) 

When the present writer gave the, playing card, example/exercise, red/black; they (the present writer,) stopped writing the 
monologue, and went and got their playing card deck, and did the exercise; shuffled the cards and then, with the cards face 
down, without counting, placed each individual card, into the respective stack = Red or Black, until the whole deck was 
played out. 

With sometimes putting placing three cards, into one stack or two cards into one stack, in the way? that the present writer 
felt? = red/black. The present writer picked up one stack (Red), and counted face down, 26?? Which of course wasn’t 
planned/tried for? Of the twenty-six cards, in the, Red, stack, there were only three black cards. Because(!), there were 26 
cards, in the, Red, stack, the present writer didn’t need to count the 26, Black, stack, as there would only be, the three 
missing red cards, in it.

Now in your experimental sub-mind work you will have to evolve your own types of exercises, like the examples given, and 
carry them out successfully. You have to release all conscious-mind control and practice allowing the sub-mind to take over, 
and this gives rise to a very queer feeling, as if you seem to be losing control over your objective world. Practice this until 
you note a degree of entry of the sub-mind into the objective world, which is all you want, a degree of entry, and a degree is 
all you need to greatly improve and sharpen up your life. The present writer didn’t visualise!? the/these cards or their colour?
The present writer. psychically-tactilely-felt!? for their colour!?

You have to release all conscious-mind #3, EGO BODY!?! Control and practice allowing YOUR(!) sub-mind to take over, 
and this gives rise to a very queer feeling, as if you #0, Conscious, as a ‘Ness,’ seem to be losing control over your objective 
world!? 

Your basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercises, is/are precisely!? for this purpose of learning how? you, conscious, as a 
#3, ego body, let go!? stand aside!? and observe = do not judge!? (showing; revealing; displaying!? what your #0, it is? 
(object; circumstance; thing!?) that you, conscious, as a #0, ness!? have now!? 

Do you, the reader, understand? the above? if you do, then you, should have a marked? increase(?), in your egg/chair 
exercises, as you, conscious, as a ness, now have(?) a/an elemental earth/hades plane objective!? which is(?), now, symbol-
ised-ised, psychic-tactile-feel-ing, as, #3, ego body you, let go/stop, judge-ing!? show-ing; display-ing; reveal-ing; what you 
#0 = have!?!?! now!?! = #0, outer, outer physically physical!?

When the individual has done enough, daily Egg/Chair work, they no sooner think basic symbol, and they can Psychically-
Tactilely-Feel IT!? in/on the/their 1 &+ #0 bodies, and(?), there is a curious? weight/heaviness!? reality, to them, the five 
basic element forces symbols; Egg; Sphere; Inverted Pyramid; Bowl and Cube!? which is derived, from!? the/your, #0, outer,
outer physically physical body? not, the/your #3 ego body!? even though, the/your #3, ego body, will/shall!? take all the 
credit!? for it!? = this is me! I did this! = #3!?!  

In order to reduce? this situation/circumstance, the making, the/your #3, Ego Body to simply observe? in/on the/your #1, 
Malkuth Earth/Hades, plane, thru/by/with; Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing, is the secret key!? Which is/was, lost? and can only be 
discovered/found, by the individual, themselves!? through/by/with, technique! 

The ‘association/connection,’ is/should be = as soon as! – you, Conscious, as a #1, ness, turn ‘inwards,’ and Psychically-
Tactilely-Feel/Sense, the/your Basic Cosmic Egg – within you; about you and surrounding you = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades 
Self. There should be a definite sense/feel-ing of reality = belief! as in defined; three-dimensional; symbol-ical!? And, it 
should sense/feel as if!? as though!? it is, #0, outer, outer physically physical ‘real?’. Do you the reader/occultist(?) 
understand? this!?



Do you? the reader; operator; practitioner; occultist(?) understand(?), that the above is also for and applies to, each of 
the/other four symbols = a definite sense/feel-ing of, reality, as in defined; three-dimensional; symbol-ical!? and it should 
sense/feel!? as if!? as though it is = #0, outer, outer physically physical real!? Also, followingOophiel closely;

The Akashic Egg Symbol = IS FOR CHANGE!?

The Sphere Symbol = IS FOR FOUNDATION!?

The Inverted Pyramid Symbol = IS FOR DIRECTION!?

The Bowl Symbol = IS FOR REFLECTION!?

The Cube Symbol = IS FOR FINISHED/ENDED/OVER/COMPLETE!?

The Outer Physical = IS FOR – USE; USES; USE-ING; USED!? 

Take the/your Desire/Want/Need/Brood-ing, through each of the above five steps/process!? and observe!? how it! the/your 
object; circumstance; thing, changes!? Take the/your desire/want/need/brood-ing, through each of the above five 
steps/process!? and observe!? how? = it! feels!? in/on the symbol? and! in/on your, #0, outer, outer physically physical 
body!? but… make especially sure!? that you, #3, ego body, present incarnation, personality body you, does not judge!? = 
show; reveal; display!? what! you, conscious, as a ‘ness?’ have(?), right now! #0, outer, outer physically, physically right 
now!? (do you! the reader/occultist(?), understand this??) 

Try this, it is from Ophiel’s book; Creative Visualisation, his chapter; The Barrier:

“Thus, this human speech of ours, due to its recent invention, does not pertain to the depth of our being, our inner 
subconscious mind, but rather speech pertains to our outer conscious mind only. (You should know from your Occult studies
that you have two minds, an inner one and an outer one; the outer one called the conscious mind and the inner one called the 
subconscious mind) 

The existence of these two minds in you is what makes all the trouble in the world. Or maybe I should say the separation of 
these two minds makes all the trouble for you in the world. 

(For those of you who are “ready” for “higher things” I will drop a big fat juicy hint as to what Illumination really is – 
becoming a Master, becoming an Adept, BECOMING LIKE A GOD, means the two minds fuse into one! Enough said! 
Some further information is available - contact me thru address in book.)

Attend to the following knowledge carefully. WORDS-SPEECH ARE THE “LANGUAGE” OF THE CONSCIOUS MIND 
WHEREAS FEELINGS ARE THE “LANGUAGE” OF THE SUBCONSCIOUS MIND. So, I repeat again – All the trouble 
we have in the world, in living this material life successfully and fully comes from the differences in COMMUNICATIONS 
BETWEEN THE TWO MINDS. 

The inability of these two minds to talk to each other. To get ideas and commands over to each other! Conscious-you to talk 
to unconscious-you! Hardly in your whole life have you been able to tell yourself what you really mean!” End quote.

In the/your Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic Chair Exercises, you, the Operator, are doing(!), the above from Ophiel, but… 
IN/ON THE/YOUR #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!? And, it is vitally important, to your work/workings, that 
you, Conscious, as a ness, #0; #1 and #3, understand this!? (Through/by/with, personal/individual effort/practice/training, 
experiencing/experiences of!? A personal, individual = Gnosis!?) So, for ‘context,’ we take the above Ophiel quote, and we 
read it thusly;

Thus, this human speech of ours, due to its recent invention, does not pertain to the depth of our being, our inner 
subconscious, psychic-tactile-feel-ing, mind, but rather speech pertains to our outer conscious mind only. You should know 
from your Occult studies that you have two minds, an inner one and an outer one; the outer one called the conscious mind 
and the inner one called the subconscious mind)

The existence of these two minds in you is what makes all the trouble in the world. 

Or maybe I should say the separation of these two minds makes all the trouble for you in the world. 

(For those of you who are “ready” for “higher things” I will drop a big fat juicy hint as to what Illumination really is – 



becoming a Master, becoming an Adept, BECOMING LIKE A GOD, means the two minds fuse into one!) Attend to the 
following knowledge carefully.

WORDS-SPEECH ARE NOT!! THE LANGUAGE OF THE/YOUR #0, OUTER, OUTER PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL 
CONSCIOUS MIND THE LANGUAGE OF THE/YOUR #0, OUTER, OUTER PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL MIND IS!?! = 
PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL = ACTION/DOING!?!                 

WHEREAS PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEELING-BELIEVE-ING IS! THE LANGUAGE OF/FOR THE/YOUR #1, 
MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE SUB-CONSCIOUS-NESS MIND!

So, I repeat again;

All the trouble we have in the #0, outer world, in living this, #0, material life successfully and fully comes from the 
DIFFERENCES/ IN COMMUNICATIONS/ BETWEEN THE TWO MINDS?

The inability of these two minds to talk to each other. To get ideas and commands over to each other! 

#0, Outer, Outer Physically Physical Conscious-Ness you, to talk/communicate to #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades, ness, un-
conscious-you! Hardly, in your whole life(!), have you #0, been able to tell yourself #1, what you really mean! because of!? 
(yes!? you guessed it?) because of, the/your, #3, ego body, present incarnation, personality self!? who judges!? = shows; 
reveals; displays!? what you!?! #0, conscious-ness = have now!?! 

No car? no job? No income? No home? No opportunity? No skill? No art? No ability? No talent? The/your #3, ego body, 
piggy-backs!? piggy-backs!? yes! your read it here!? the/your #3, ego body, piggy-backs!? piggy-backs!? = in/on your 
conscious!? when conscious, is/in a/any/all ness, states/conditions, right up to the #4, lower part, Astral plane. (Upper/high 
Astral part, is where it, #3, merges, is absorbed? see/read Ophiel for this.)

Knowing this! know of this!? the above, languages, is where the letter of Saint Augustine of Hippo, comes into play!?! 
(Who? is this, Adversary? Opposer? Surely not the Devil? For we have been delivered(?), of him already?) The/your #3, Ego
body; JUDGES = DISPLAYS! SHOWS! REVEALS!? Judge; from the Proto-Indo-European Root word; deik = to show; to 
reveal; to display!? 

If you, Conscious, as a #0, ness, says; I am going to get drunk? Then you, Conscious, as a #1, ness, says; Do it not! And you,
#3, Ego Body, dominate!? = Judge – Show; Reveal; Display!? – SOBER!?

Then you, Conscious, as a #1, ness, = REFLEX!? and Show; Reveal; Display!? = DRUNK!?!      

Then you, Conscious, as a #0, ness, say; I am going to get drunk?

Here is what Dion Fortune and Ophiel write; Each plane above, controls(?), the plane below!? So, if the #3, Ego Body 
Judges? shows/reveals/displays, what is/on #0, Conscious-ness(?) = sober? The/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane; 
WILL/SHALL? AUTOMATICALLY!? REFLEX/REFLECT!? ITS OPPOSITE!? 

Remember; Neville Goddard; To be conscious of being poor, whilst praying for riches, is to be rewarded with that which you
are conscious of being, namely poverty!

To be conscious of being drunk, whilst praying for sober, is to be rewarded with that which you are conscious of being, 
namely drunk? (See/read Ophiel’s book; Contacting the Demiurge; for his; ‘drunk, in the gutter!?’

Remember; The/your #3, Ego Body, piggy-backs, in/on Conscious, when it, Conscious, is in a/its ness, state/condition! 
the/your, #3, Ego Body = Judges – shows; reveals; displays, what you #0, are now?  

When the present writer prays, the (the present writer,) psychically-tactilely-feels!? Define; Three-Dimensional-ise; Symbol-
ises!? And then, #0, works-off-of/from (Agrees-with! this/their #1!) It is what you, the reader; operator; practitioner; 
occultist? is/are, supposedly? doing(?), likewise??

Now in your experimental sub-mind work you will have to evolve your own types of exercises, like the examples given, and 
carry them out successfully. You have to release all conscious-mind control and practice allowing your #1, Malkuth 
Earth/Hades Plane = Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing-Mind to take over, and this gives rise to a very queer feeling, as if you seem to
be losing control over your objective world. 



To practice this, until you note a degree of entry of your sub-mind(!) into/onto, the/your(?) objective world, which is all you 
want, a degree of entry, and a degree of psychic-tactile-feel-ing, it is recommended, suggested, that you test, try, use, 
the/your, basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercise, as this may be, all you ‘need,’ to greatly improve and sharpen up your
life?

Which of you, watermelons is/are, Ripe? How much milk should I pour? How much pressure should I apply to the gas-
pedal? How far should I strike the golf ball? How much should I bet? Which one should I pick? Which one will win? Do I 
turn right or left? PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING!? = stop! halt! adverse! oppose! obstacle! inert! defined! three-
dimensional-ised! symbol-ised! 

Adverse, from; ad = to + verter = to turn; turn back; be turned; convert; transform; changed. From the Proto-Indo-European 

Root word; wer = to turn; to bend. From the adjective = Averse (Middle 15th century) Old French ‘avers = hostile; 
antagonistic. Directly from the Latin; aversus = turned away; turned back. Past participle of; avertere = to turn away. From; 
ab = off; away from + vertere = to turn. It was/is, originally, in English, meant as/seen as = IN THE 
MENTAL/EMOTIONAL SENSE? Whilst ‘Adverse,’ was usually seen, in its/a, #0, Outer, outer physically physical sense? 
A ‘distinction?’, which is/has been ‘forgotten/lost?’, in the present-day language/use, of today.

Adverse, from; Ad+Vertere = to turn; to turn behind; to be turned towards; to convert; to transform; to translate; to be 
changed = from the Proto-Indo-European Root word; Wer = to turn; to bend (back upon!?!)

Oppose(verb), late14th century; to speak/act against; accuse/question/interrogate. From Old French; oposer = rival; resist; 
contradict; opposing (point/place of a ‘view = psychic-tactile-feel-ing!?!) From; ob = in the direction of; in front of + poser =
to place; to put; to fix; to set. From the Latin; opponere = oppose; resist; set-against; object to.

Obstacle (noun) From the Latin; obstaculum = stand before; stand opposite to; block; hinder; thwart. From ob – in front 
of/before; against + stare = to stand. From the Proto-Indo-European Root word; sta – stand; make/be firm; set; fixed.

Inert; Inert/Inertia (noun). The property/inherent ability, of inner plane, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades, Element Force, which, 
by/with its own ‘virtue,’, remains/retains, its state of rest/inactivity/passive receptive-ness, so long as there is/are, no outside 
Force/Forces, acting upon it, which will/shall cause/causes, it, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades, Element Force, to change its 

state/condition. It was the 17th Century German astronomer, Johan Kepler; 1751-1630, as a special sense, from the Latin, 
word; inertia = un-skilful-ness; ignorance; idle-ness; inactivity. From, the Latin word; iners/inertis = unskilled/inactive - 
inactivity; who introduced this idea, as a term/explanation, and it/this, was used by Sir Isaac Newton, in 1687, as the ‘force 
of inertia,’ to explain it, in modern Latin. It was in 1822, in English, that the/this classical Latin term/sense, was seen as; 
passive-ness, apathy, hence inactivity, hence ‘not,’ engaged/attached to/with, the/a/any other force being used/exerted?

Inert (adjective.) is; without its own ‘inherent,’ force. Having no ‘self-power,’ to act/respond? (See/read Ophiel, for this, in 
his book; Contacting the Demiurge.) (See/read 1 of 1 What next? 2022.) 

Inert, from the Latin; inertem/iners = unskilled; incompetent; inactive; helpless; weak; sluggish; passive; impotent. 
Compound word, of/from; in = without, not, opposite of? + ars = skill; art; expression; neutral.

How does? Your!? #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, Adversary; Opposer; Obstacle? Look, psychically-tactilely-feel(?) to 
you, Conscious, now? Now, it is in the way, that you conscious, as a ness, control; train; exercise and discipline!? the/your 
#3, ego body, present incarnation, personality body!? So that it? #3, does not, judge = show; reveal; display = what you, 
conscious, as a #0, ness? Have now? Ophiel explains this, in his book; Creative Visualisation, his chapter; The Law of 
Emotion and his quote, from the ole crazy book, Bible, so called/described, because it drives everyone/everybody crazy, with
its now dead/shit information, only, and no/none, of the necessary/essential background/practical techniques/methods!? 
(See/Read Ophiel for this.)

As your progress/work/experience, of/for the/your, basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair exercises, come to the ‘fore,’ you – 
Conscious, should begin/start to, sense/feel, psychically? that you #0, are working-off-of/from? the/your #1, Malkuth 
Earth/Hades Plane/Body! CAUTION! If you, #3, Ego Body ‘LOOK FOR?’ or ‘TRY TO TEST?’ the/your #1, Malkuth 
Earth/Hades Plane Body, then this is ‘sure sign?’ that it is(!) not! the/your #l, Malkuth Earth/Hades doing it! But… the/your 
#3! (Ophiel warns about this, in his book; Clairvoyance.) 

Thank you.


