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Gradually,  over time and practice,  the  Ego Body,  realises its  place/source, #1,  Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane,  and,  stops
transferring/projecting, to the/your, #0, Outer, Outer Physically Physical Plane. Here it is, from Ophiel, from second book;
Creative Visualisation, his chapter; Law of the Barrier:

“For those of you who are “ready” for “higher things” I will drop a big fat juicy hint as to what Illumination really is –
becoming a Master, becoming an Adept, BECOMING LIKE A GOD, means the two minds fuse into one! Attend to the
following knowledge carefully. WORDS-SPEECH ARE THE “LANGUAGE” OF THE CONSCIOUS MIND, WHEREAS
FEELINGS ARE THE “LANGUAGE” OF THE SUBCONSCIOUS MIND. So, I repeat again – All the trouble we have in
the world, in living this material life successfully and fully comes from the differences in COMMUNICATIONS BETWEEN
THE TWO MINDS. The inability of these two minds to talk to each other. To get ideas and commands over to each other!
Conscious-you to talk to unconscious-you! Hardly in your whole life have you been able to tell yourself what you really
mean!” End quote.

The language, of/for the/your, #2, etheric plane body, is = reflect; repeat; reverse; visualise.

The language, of/for the/your, #1, malkuth earth body, is = psychic-tactile-feel-ing.

The language, of/for the/your, #0, outer physical body, is = use; uses; use-ing; used.

Conscious, you? as a ness, must learn each, language, in turn and with, each other. This is where, the basic cosmic egg
and/or basic chair exercise, come in. Notice, in the above, three languages, that there is/are, NO #0, OUTER PHYSICAL
VERBALISATIONS!

Select an #0, object, = plate; spoon; cup; shoe; toot-brush; key; tin of something; etc, etc. Now look at, your chosen object, in
each  of  the,  modes,  separately/individually.  Each  mode/method,  will/shall  have!  a  distinctive/qualitative/quantitative,
psychic-tactile-feel-ing, in/on each of the planes. Do the same, to/with, Ophiel’s, Little System, of Astral Projection. Do the
same, to/with Ophiel’s Dream Method, of Astral Projection. 

Each language, is, simply a part, of Conscious, as it, Conscious, is in a ness, state/condition.

Each language, is, OBSERVED BY/WITH THE/YOUR, #3, EGO BODY AND MUST NOT BE = JUDGED.

In the beginning, there is nothing, empty, void dark-ness/black-ness/blind-ness, and you Conscious, say/speak, Psychically-
Tactilely-Feel, Let there be!? 

Call/name, the present writer, old fashioned if you like to/want to, BUT….! Isn’t the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane,
JUST LIKE THIS, DARK-NESS BLACK-NESS BLIND-NESS? Do any of you, current readers/occultists? ever heard of,
read  of,  the  up-side-down  tree.  Remember/recall,  from  previous  monologues,  that  the  worthy  ancients,  taught the
Macrocosm, FIRST, AND THEN, EXPLAINED THE MACROCOSM, IN THE MICROCOSM SECOND, AS OCCULT
TECHNIQUES?

What are you, the occultist going to do now, that you know of; The LANGUAGE, of the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades
Plane Body? Here is what it says, in the Ole Crazy Book; Genesis, first chapter: 

And the Earth, was without form, and void.

And dark-ness, was upon the face, (surface, conscious-ness) of the Deep. 

And, the Spirit of God, moved upon the face, (surface, conscious-ness) of the Waters (Plural)

And God said; Let there be Light: and there was Light.

And God saw the Light. That it, (The Light,) was good. (Good in/of its self)

And God divided the Light from the Dark-ness.

Please study, this Deep occult; The Dark-ness WAS THERE FIRST!



Please study, this Deep occult; The/Your TREE/MAP IS UPSIDE-DOWN REVERSED? 

So,  the/our/your,  starting  point  IS,  MICROCOSMIC DARK-NESS;  BLACK-NESS;  BLIND-NESS  So,  the/our/your  –
starting point IS, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing. 

Please take a sheet of A4, paper, and write out/explain, for yourself, what you think/feel, is happening, taking place, during
your; Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic Chair Exercises, and what the/these exercises, is/are for.

Basically, they/these two exercises, Egg/Chair, are for, the  re-education, of the/your, #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation,
Personality Body, SPECIFICALLY, NOT! NOT! TO JUDGE!? which word, is from the, Proto-Indo-European Root word;
deik = to reveal;  to show; to  display,  ME! ME! ME! THIS  IS, WHO/WHAT I  #3, AM? Y.H.V.H. (How’s that for  a
technique,) is this, Y.H.V.H. GOD’S EGO, TALK-ING? (See/read Ophiel’s vignette; The Power of the Lost Word.)

And God saw the Light. That it, (The Light,) was good. Good in and of its self! Thus God, did not, have to, need to, Judge
IT. It, the Light, could just simply be, in and of, its self, in a non-judgemental, state/condition. (Get this, and you’ve, Got it
made!)  

As you, the practicing, occultist, each day, twice a day and perform, the/your, basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair, exercises,
Chair in the morning, start of day! Cosmic Egg, in the evening, before bed! You, Conscious, as a ness, are trying to, bring
your, #3, Ego Body, back into  accepting, its basic role/function, of  observation/observing = without Judge-ing? Simply
Observe-ing?

From the Latin; observare = watch over; note; heed; look to; attend to; guard; regard; comply with.

From; ob = in front of; before of + servare = to watch; to keep safe.

From the PIE Root word = *ser-, to protect.

The idea/sense of, externally watch; perceive; notice, is from/about, 1560s, via the Elizabethan, popularist occult books, of
the day. It was/is, to see and note, omens? (Dr Dee and Mr Kelly,) then later, 1600s, it became; to observe -  by way of
remark/comment.

Back to Neville Goddard; to pray for riches, whilst conscious, of being poor, is, to be rewarded, with what you are conscious
of being, namely, more, poor

Who do you, the reader/occultist, think, IS = conscious? of being poor. 

Where do you, the reader/occultist, think, IS = conscious, of being poor.

Why do you, would you, the reader/occultist, think, IT IS BECAUSE OF? the/your, #6, Akashic #5, Archetypal #4, Astral
#3, Ego #2, Etheric, #0, Physical? (Where is? the/your = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades?) 

There is only one part of you, the reader, that can/does,  OBSERVE. And Over five thousand years ago = SOMEBODY,
SOMEWHERE INSTINCTIVELY,  CONSCIOUSLY,  KNEW OF THIS?  (See/read  Ophiel’s  book;  Contacting  the
Demiurge, and read what he writes, about the villagers, staying quiet, whilst their men folk, where out, Hunting/Searching.
See/read Ophiel’s vignette; Witchcraft.)

The present writer, is and always has been, astounded/amazed, at the opening chapter, of the ole crazy book (Bible,) as it is
amongst the most succinct of, descriptions/instructions for, all the later techniques, that is/are/were, to follow. Everyone, of
them/these/their, techniques, come back to, Genesis, chapter one, verse one. 

At the start/beginning, of your work!

Enter, the/your; Void, empty-ness; gap; space = Egg! 

Begin, with the; Dark-ness; Black-ness! Conscious-ness! 

The Spirit-of-God, IS, the/your #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades = Moved Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing!

Moving? upon the face/surface, your, Conscious, as a Ness!

And said, Let There Be Light! (Coming up from below! = LET THERE BE! #2, Etheric Light!?)



And there, was/is, Light from #1, TO, #2 (See/read Ophiel’s first book!) 

And God ‘Saw,’ That the Light Was GOOD, FOR HIM! (YOU?)

And God Divided (SHARED) The Light, (WITH) the Dark-ness! 

So much, for that. Imagine now, that you are in a position/place, to know/understand, the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades
Plane, and its  Laws;  Rules;  Governances AND! the/your, #2, Etheric Plane? Wouldn’t the first, Chapter, and first verse,
make sense, to you, the reader/occultist,  NOW? Could you, can you, are you? the reader/occultist, now in a place, where
you, sense/feel, that you just might/could, start to get something out of the/your Occult, now that you, Conscious, as a ness,
now understand, a possible, avenue/method of practice, which will/shall have, actual; factual; literal, psychic-tactile-feel-ing,
feedback, which you can, use, in/on the/your, Now-Time, #1, Malkuth Earth and, Real-Time, #0, outer physical earth.

Ophiel’s first book; Astral Projection, is all about the/your, #2, Etheric Plane, which is, Clairvoyance.

Everything/All, from the/your, #2, Etheric Plane, upwards/inwards, IS! Clairvoyance.

Everything/All, from the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, upwards/downwards, IS! Psychic.

Everything/All, in/on the/your, #0, Physically Physical Plane, IS! Use; uses; use-ing; used. 

Standing between, the/your #0, Outer, outer physically physical earth and the/your, #2, Etheric Plane,  IS, The/your, #1,
Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane. Even just reading this, shapes your inner world, understanding?

Example; For all this, is delivered unto me. And, to whomsoever, I will, will I give it. 

And what does this nice, kind, Force, deliver unto us, #0 = POWER & GLORY – OF THEM!?

Father = he who begets; creates; makes; brings = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades.

Hallowed = PIE Roo word; *kailo- = whole; of good omen; un-injured.

Heaven = PIE Root word; *kem- = to cover. to keep secret; hidden/un-seen.

Power = PIE Root word; poti- = to be able; power to act or to do = Use?

Glory = From the Greek word; Kleos – repute; report; renown; reputation = Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing!

The above, is a/an occult, process procedure, formula, method, technique? 

Our Father who art in secret.

Hallowed be thy name.

For thine, is their Power.

And, their, Glory.

Amen!  (From the Semitic Root word; a-m-n = To Be Trustworthy; To Support; To Confirm; Truth!)

When a person, is Conscious, of the above, process/procedure/formula, as a method, leading to a technique, it is then, a
matter  of,  re-training;  re-educating;  re-structuring,  the  place/location  of/for,  the/their,  #3,  Ego  Body,  and  its,
actions/functions, in/on the/their, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane. 

Two of the  most basic, of exercises, recommended of/for this, is,  of course, the Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic Chair
Exercises. Outer, outer physically physical Conscious, as a ness, you = Knows/Understands? What ‘ it,’  is, that these two
exercises, are for!? 

#1, Malkuth Earth/Hades you, will/shall always,  automatically/reflexively, take the adverse, opposite, opposing, obstacle,
inert and immobile, position, to you #0, Outer, outer physically physical you. #0, you, conscious, as a, ness, will/shall now,
consciously; knowingly; deliberately, work-off-of/from = The/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, self, following the laws;
rules & governances of/for, the/your, #0, outer, outer physically physical plane. (See/read Ophiel vignette: Acceptance, and
his; I found lack, to be degrading, which he (Ophiel,) Agreed-with? And used, to, #0, WORK-OFF-OF/FROM!) 

The most important law of/for, the/your #0, outer, physical plane, is, the law of common sense, for every #0, action, there is



a/an equal #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane,  re-action (see/read letter, of Saint Augustine, of Hippo.) and the/your, #3, ego
body, present incarnation, personality body, feels nothing.

Conscious, through each of its centres/bodies,  Feels Everything! And distributes Discharges, these  Feel-ings, at its, Base
Level, #1, who then proceeds, to transfer/project, them, into/onto, the, #0, Level.  

Knowing  this,  knowing  of  this,  means  that  you,  Conscious,  as  a  ness,  Can/Do  Get  Ahead,  of  the  FLOW,  and  are
able/capable, of mitigating, these Flows (Forces,) to your, Conscious-ness, #0, advantage. 

There is no, Astral Light Luminosity, in/on the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!? 

The Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, is the lowest point/place, of the astral-light, as astral-light!?

The Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, is, dark-ness; black-ness; blind-ness and therefor can only be cognised as/by, with/through,
the/your  personal/individual,  psychic-tactile-feel-ing-believe-ing ability,  natural or  developed. The Malkuth  Earth/Hades
Plane, is, adverse; opposed; obstacle; inert; inertia; immobile; fixed; set from which, you, #0, work-off-of/from!? 

Do you the reader/occultist. understand the above? 

A long time ago, many years,  the  present writer would,  in their  travels/projections,  would  go to  the  sea, and in their
projection, would experience, what it was like, for whales and dolphins, in the vast empty-ness,  expanse, of featureless,
formless, water. No Landmarks; No features; No Contours; Nothing but water. The only way, that Whales; Dolphins and
others, could tell/distinguish, where the others in their group/pod, was/is located, is by constant/continuous sound, which
carries, very far, in water. 

Elephants, also use this sound technique, in the large expanse of the African Planes. Elephants emit,  low level frequency
sound, outside the hearing of humans, which travels for miles, to let other groups know where they are. But, unlike whales
and dolphins etc, their environment, is one that we, would understand. In the deep waters, there is/are nothing like this, and
‘sound/’ is the only means of location, Where are you? I am here?

One of the things, that the present writer does know, is that without a brain, there is/are no, #0, Outer, outer physically
physical Conscious, as a ness. See/read Ophiel’s vignette; More Ideas about God.

“The man spoke of, A/The Vast Countenance, and then spoke of a, Lesser Countenance. the Vast Countenance does nothing,
but Observe. The Lesser Countenance, DREAMS, the WORLD, and YOU, into CONTINUAL EXISTENCE. The man said:
You (And I) EXIST ONLY FOR NOW AND ALWAYS DID EXIST ONLY NOW. Never a real Past or a real Future, these
are also only a Present DREAM, of  this Lesser Countenance. There was more,  but  I  will  go on now and connect the
preceding up, with the material Ophiel discovered himself through, Hints, from Gnostic literature, combined with his own
explorations into the Inner Planes.” End quote.

The/your tree/map, Springs up/out of/from, the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, and does not! come down/out, from
above. Conscious, as a ness, comes up/out,  from = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, into/onto, the/your, #2, Etheric Plane,
hence the expression, a second birth!?

Hence, the explanation/presentation, that we are born from #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades, TO, #2, Etheric, and that we bring with
us, Conscious-ness, our present, #3, Ego Body, Present Incarnation, Personality Body Which, HAS/HAD ITS #3, BIRTH
IN/ON THE/YOUR = #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE? Here it  is,  from Ophiel, in his first lesson, from his;
Correspondence Course in Astral Projection: 

“So here goes. (The following is the most profound concept I have ever come across in my years of Occult work, and it is so
big that I have refrained from looking at it too much, because I felt a complete incapability of comprehending it ever, to even
its  simplest  extent.  However,  we must  all  face it  someday,  sometime,  so  here  is  a  start!)  IT APPEARS THAT THE
PHYSICAL PLANE WORLD DOES NOT, EXIST, AS SUCH, that is, as it appears to be. (Enough for now.) One curious
outstanding fact regarding the above statement is that; THIS NEWLY DISCOVERED FACT, THAT THE PHYSICAL
PLANE DOES NOT EXIST AS SUCH, CANNOT BE COGNISED BY YOU, OR BY ANY MAN OR WOMAN, UNTIL
YOU LEARN TO ENTER THE INNER PLANES YOURSELF AND LOOK BACK!!!” End quote. (Capitols, are Ophiel’s.)

In order to look back, look down upon, look behind. You, Conscious, as a ness, must be, somewhere? else? other? From the
Light, I, Conscious, as a, ness,  entered the Dark-ness; Black-ness and I, was  BLIND! And had to fight/contend, with the



Demons, Devils, Monsters, Adversaries, Opposers, Obstacles? All, in the Dark-ness; Black-ness; Blind-ness, where I, could
only, Psychically-Tactilely-Feel!?

The worst of them, who came to me, Conscious, who tried to; Trap Ensnare Hold/Bind ME, Conscious, as a ness. Was the
one called/named; #3, Ego Body, Who Dominated Me, Conscious, as a #0, ness But…! After many battles, I threw him, #3,
Ego Body down! and Triumphed! Would you like to read it, from Ophiel Well, of course you would! Who wouldn’t, being
in/on a/an, Ophiel Magic Group, site. Here it is, from Ophiel’s second book; Creative Visualisation, his chapter; Law of the
Barrier:

“For those of you who are “ready” for “higher things” I will drop a big fat juicy hint as to what Illumination really is –
becoming a Master, becoming an Adept,  BECOMING LIKE A GOD, means the two minds fuse into one! Enough said!”
End quote.

The above, happens takes place, when the/your, #3, ego body, present incarnation, personality body, learns/masters, the art &
practice, of observation, without judge-ing, Bang! right from the word go! Verse one, chapter one; the ole crazy book. 

And God saw the Light.

That it was Good.

And God divided, the Light from the Dark-ness.

Saw, Observe, without Judge-ing, the Light, #2, Etheric.

That it, #2, Etheric, was Good, in its, Self.

Dark-ness, #1, Malkuth Earth!

Divided, Separate, #3, Ego Body Judgement?

Make things, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING!?

The rest is just commentary/variations, on a theme. And saw? Ophiel, explains this, in his above quote, from his first lesson,
in his; Correspondence Course in Astral Projection. When he writes; Enter, and about face/turn, and look back = BEHIND
Now! Arik Anpin = Vast Face Macrocosm is all right-sided = looking back! looking down! looking  Behind Now! Zoar
Anpin = Small Fact Microcosmic is all left-sided = looking up! looking in! looking Inwards. (See/read, last page, of Ophiel’s
book; Contacting the Demiurge.)

So,  this,  Entering and  then(?)  Looking  Behind or,  Outside  and  Looking  Inward.  Seems  to  be,  IT!  And  you,  the
reader/occultist; must learn to do this action, OBSERVING, from both points of view, Hence, you, the reader/occultist, must
learn to do, this/these actions, Consciously; Knowingly; Deliberately. Well, it just so happens, that one of the better, starting
points, for those. who are  not, as  yet, able, to, #2, Etheric Plane Project/Transfer, is to, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane,
Project/Transfer, via the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing, which IS, RESISTANCE?

This technique, was/is, the one taught, in Egypt, five thousand years ago, or thereabouts, in their; Book of the Dead, and the
weighing/measuring, of the heart, Conscious, of the individual, in their; Denial Technique, of; I-HAVE-NOT! Which, the
Hebrews took with them, when they left; THOU SHALT NOT! Which Saint Augustine of Hippo, put out there, for all to
see/read, in his letter; Thine Adversary says to Thee - Conscious = DO IT NOT! = AGREE-WITH-HIM? It just so, happens,
that the present writer, when they, encountered met the/their;

Dark Destroyer; The Enemy Within; The Demon of the Lie; The Dark-ness; The Black-ness; The Blind-ness; The Other;
The Prince, of this (#0,) world; The Bogy Man; He’s Behind You! 

So, instead of Ancient Egypt’s = I-HAVE-NOT (Denial to the God/Gods.)

So, instead of Crazy Book Talk = THOU-SHALT-NOT (Commands, from the/their God.)

So, instead of Saint Augustine’s = AGREE-WITH-HIM (Instruction from the experienced.)

The present writer says = BE IT NOT (Experiences of, their, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades.)

AND THE PRESENT WRITER; WORKS-OFF-OF/FROM-THIS! = BE IT NOT! 



If  you  would  like  to  read  Ophiel’s  statement  about  this,  AGREE-WITH-HIM,  BE IT NOT,  then  read  his  vignette;
Acceptance, and read what he (Ophiel,) writes about lack. (his lack!?)

“I give them directions and show them how to set up the pattern, and then I find that they do not follow up, but just act
lackadaisical and frivolous about it, meanwhile being on the, edge of lack of goodies, to live a nice life style.

I was not that way at all. I found lack to be very degrading, and I worked like hell to get around and over the obstacles that
held me up. I am now on Easy Street; I can still do better and I am working on it all the time.” End quote. (Underlines are the
present writers.)

AGREE-WITH-HIM!  BE IT NOT! WORK-OFF-OF/FROM-THIS! = YOU’VE GOT IT MADE!? 

https://ophiel.art

Thank you.


