
THE ART AND PRACTICE
OF

OPHIEL

A Collection Of Monologues On Working
With His Materials

In particular, techniques and practices for working alongside,
and with, the Malkuth Earth/Hades body

Written by max.height
https://  ophiel.art  

Originally posted on Google Groups:
https://groups.google.com/g/ophiel-magic9-20/

(Previous works also posted as “Sender” on the “Ophiel Magick” group, from the
defunct YahooGroups)



14 of 17 Malkuth Earth Hades. 2024

Where do you, the reader/occultist(?) go now? now, that you know of, the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!?

What? do you, the reader/occultist(?) do now, now, that you know of, the/your, 3, Ego Body, and its ‘way?’ of working?
when it = you! #3, cannot/do not, simply – Observe? but, Judge = show; reveal; display; tell!?

Try this, it is from Ophiel, form his book; Clairvoyance, his chapter; The Two Minds. 

“The training of the sub-mind is a very subtle matter. There is no danger involved, the worst that can happen is just no
good results in a  hurry,  and some confusion of ideas. The training of your sub-mind, is like  your training of your
physical, self to go under water for periods of increasing time. You are inducing your “hidden” mind to come “out,” and
function in the Physical Plane World;  whereas its true plane existence is in the Inner Plane World. There are many
benefits to be gained from the functioning of your sub-mind in the outer plane world, if and when it can be trained
properly.
The sub-mind, possessing as it does,  unlimited access to Inner Plane play of Forces can predict and calculate instantly
the sum total effect of these Force’s interplay upon each other, and upon your Being. And this outer plane function can
be, as I said, of great benefit to you. 
I might say here that any difficulties that might arise, come not, from the impact of the information upon you, but from
the difficult job, of getting the information “through” to your outer plane, in a form that you can understand and use
“work on.”” End quote.

Well,  the members,  in/on this particular  Ophiel  Magic  Group, have ‘several  forms?’  that  you, #3,  Ego Body, can
understand, and ‘use,’ and ‘work-on?’ 

Ophiel writes, farther on, this part; 

“I might stop here a bit and call your attention to another phenomenon that you should notice in this work, as I did. As an
example, you might say that the outer Physical Plane is the domain of the conscious mind, and the Inner Plane the
domain of the sub-conscious mind. IT IS QUEER, BUT THE CONSCIOUS MIND, DESPERATELY RESENTS, THE
INTRUSION OF THE SUB-MIND INTO ITS DOMAIN, AND WILL RESIST IT, TOOTH AND NAIL. I will point
this out to you later as it comes up, (if I don’t forget it!)” End quote. (Capitols are, Ophiel’s.)

Then, this, part: 

“Now in your experimental sub-mind work you will have to evolve your own types of exercises, like the examples given,
and carry them out successfully.

You have to release all conscious-mind control and practice allowing the sub-mind to take over, and this gives rise to a
very queer feeling, as if you seem to be losing control over your objective world.

Practice this, until you note a degree of entry of the sub-mind, into the objective world, which is all you want, a degree of
entry, and a degree, is all you need, to greatly improve and sharpen up your life.” End quote.

The present  writer,  has always been ‘amazed?’  at the  occult ‘donkeys?’  who do not,  cannot,  recognise/realise,  the
relevance/importance,  of  the/their,  basic  cosmic  egg  exercise,  and/or/nor,  their  basic  chair  exercise.  Both  these
‘exercises,’ are for(?) the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades ‘Plane!?’ The actual; factual; literal – PLANE!? – FORCE!? =
OF ADVERSE-NESS; OPPOSED-NESS; OBSTACLE-NESS!? 

The present writer, has always be ‘amazed?’ at the occult ‘donkeys?’ who do not, cannot, recognise/realise, that Ophiel’s
‘techniques,’ is/are, for the/your, #2, Ehteric Plane? = AND THEREFORE!? – NOT! NOT! – for the/your, #1, Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane!? Both, #0 and #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane are both used!? to #2, Etheric Plane, transfer/project.
(The term/expression ‘donkey,’ is ‘descriptive,’ not a/an ‘insult/slur!?’) 

The ‘stubborn-ness,’  of  these types/kinds  of  persons,  is  their  ‘own!’  undoing, and until  and unless,  the  individual,
‘chooses,’  to  do  differently,  by  their  own  efforts,  then,  nothing  happens,  for  them,  but…!  many  ‘other  things?’
can/do/does/will/shall(?) happen  to them!? No matter how many, of these types/kinds of persons, the present writer,
encounters/meets, the present writer, will always present, the two ‘carrots?’ = egg and chair!? Ophiel, presents it/this,
from his book; Creative Visualisation, his chapter; Law of Emotion. But…! it is, not quite, what it seems?



Before we go any farther on, please remember, Ophiel’s vignette; The Power of Speaking Things and Conditions, into
Existence and his; man, and his dog!? (Duality, all! in/on the same/one plane! = all! with, Equal? Power?) The present
writer, is now about to ‘re-write,’ the whole of Ophiel’s chapter; Law of Emotion, in the ‘context of,’ The Law of
PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING!? If you are un-able? to make ‘head-way,’ on this, then please, be content, with your
now present ‘burden?’ and move on.

“The word, Emotion, comes from the same root as the word, MOVING, AND E-MOTION IS ALIVE. The truth is that
there seems to be evidence that an, EMOTION, is actually a part of your BEING. The real you.

We can’t go too far into psychology here, and I never did fully understand the psychological connection myself, but it
does appear that a strong Emotion is really a deeply connected part of your ego in some way. For example, if you should
have a, strong Emotion, that is repellent to you, for some reason, and you reject it, split it off from your personality, you
have a real demon in the background of your mind, that is raising cain, with you, to get back into-with you.

Years ago, when I was first studying the Occult, there was much glib talk, in Occult circles, about a thing called, The
Dweller on the Threshold. No one knew what it was exactly, but all spoke of it with bated breath and with great fear. I
was never able to find out exactly, what it is and as time passed, I forgot about it and heard no more about it,  until I
started practicing Occult works.

When I had completed the preliminary work, that led up to the writing of the book; The Art and Practice of Astral
Projection, I had, by that time, settled many of the “conflicts,” that is, I had welcomed back into me, most of the things,
that I had formerly rejected; and therefore, when I started to project, by the different systems, I encountered no, dweller,
on my Threshold. Oh, there were a few things as described in the book; those noises and various images came to me, but
I recognised them for dream projected images, and as soon as I started to work with them, they disappeared, (which was,
when I took them back, into me,) although, I will admit that I did not recognise them at the time, as projections of me,
which I had formerly rejected, and I am just now connecting these, different things, up, so I understand them, and their
relation to Occult work.” End quote.

Context; The word, Emotion, comes from the same root as the word, MOVING, AND E-MOTION IS ALIVE. The truth
is,  That in/on the/your,  #1,  Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane,  when the/these ‘MOVE-ING EMOTIONS?’ ARRIVE? AT
THE/YOUR,  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane!  That  the/these/your  =  E-MOTIONS!?  BECOME  ‘FIXED!?’  IN
THE/YOUR  ELEMENT EARTH  PLANE!?  AS!  =  PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-INGS!?   that  there  seems  to  be
evidence, that an, EMOTION, has actually become? a part of your BEING. The real you = #1, Malkuth Earth!? We can’t
go too far into psychology here, and as Ophiel writes; I never did, fully understand the psychological connection myself,
but it  does appear, that a strong Emotion is really a deeply connected part of your,  #3, ego in some way , And, for
whatever reason(?) you, Conscious, as a #1, ness = CANNOT! WILL NOT? LOOK-AWAY? EVEN! EVEN? IF!? IT IS
‘NOT!’ GOOD! FOR YOU! #0!? For, example, if you should have a, strong  Emotion, as a,  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing,
that is repellent to you, for some reason, and you reject it, split it off, from your personality, you have a real demon in the
background of your mind, that is raising cain, with you, to get back into-with you.

Next from Ophiel; “I cannot give a course in psychology, as I am not qualified to do that; nor could I do it, long distance,
in this little book. But in considering this Occult Law of E-motions, I am getting close to this Threshold Business. This
Threshold Business, is where the EMOTIONS come in. Of course, in referring to Creative Visualization work, I am
referring to ‘New Emotions,’ and not to old ones, such as your projected-rejected projections would be. I am concerned
here, least the ‘OLD EMOTIONS,’ should interfere with the NEW EMOTIONS.

Now for heaven’s sake don’t be suggestible, and yield to any suggestions, from what I have said so far, and be afraid of
this work. We probably all have these rejected projections, to some degree, in our lives. WILL YOU DO THIS? IF YOU
FEEL  ANY  DEEP-SEATED  EMOTIONAL  UPHEAVAL  WHEN  YOU  START  TO  DO  THIS  WORK,  OR
ENCOUNTER AN UPHEAVAL LATER ON, YOU FEEL THAT YOU CANNOT HANDLE –  THEN YOU HAD
BETTER STOP OCCULT WORK AND GO TO A PSYCHOLOGIST AND ASK FOR ASSISTANCE AS YOU
MIGHT HAVE SERIOUS REPRESSIONS THAT YOU ARE CONTACTING. This does not happen very often and, in
fact, I cannot think of a single case that I know of personally, but since there are so many screw-balls in the world always
hollering about the dangers of the Occult I would rather warn you this way, than say nothing.” End quote.

Context; I cannot give a course in psychology, as I am not qualified to do that; nor could I do it, long distance, in this
little book. But in considering this, Occult Law of E-motions, I am getting close to this = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane
=  Threshold Business. This, Threshold Business, is where the EMOTIONS come in and  APPEAR!? AS =  Psychic-
Tactile-Feel-ings, Of course, in referring to Creative Visualization work, I am referring to ‘New Emotions,’ and not to
old ones, such as your projected-rejected projections, as Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ings would be. I am concerned here, least
the ‘OLD Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ings,’ should interfere with the NEW Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ings.



Now for heaven’s sake don’t be suggestible, and yield to any suggestions, from what I have said so far, and be afraid of
this work. The/your,  #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane =  WILL/SHALL!?  GIVE YOU! Conscious,  as a  #1, Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane, ness = FEAR!? We, probably, all have these rejected projections, to some degree, in our lives. WILL
YOU DO THIS? IF YOU FEEL ANY DEEP-SEATED EMOTIONAL, Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing, UPHEAVAL, WHEN
YOU START TO DO THIS WORK, OR ENCOUNTER AN UPHEAVAL, LATER ON, YOU FEEL THAT YOU
CANNOT HANDLE –  THEN YOU HAD BETTER STOP #1,  MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE,  OCCULT
WORK AND GO TO A PSYCHOLOGIST, AND ASK FOR ASSISTANCE, AS YOU MIGHT HAVE SERIOUS
REPRESSIONS, THAT YOU ARE CONTACTING. This does not happen very often and, in fact, I cannot think of a
single case that I know of personally, but since there are so many screw-balls in the world always hollering about the
dangers of the Occult I would rather warn you this way, than say nothing.

The present writer, knows/understands, the = BLIND-PANIC!? The = WAVES OF PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING,
THAT ‘FLOODS?’ THE #0, OUTER PHYSICAL BODY!? IRRATIONALLY!? (Called the ‘Fear of the Lord!?’) in the
‘Ole  Crazy  Book.’  and  which,  you,  the  reader/occultist(?)  must  ‘pass-through!?’  ‘overcome!?’  =  #1,  Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane = Adversary/Opposer/Obstacle!? This #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane = LINE-TO-BE-CROSSED =
Liminality!? Was well understood, by those who ‘knew?’ and those who,  understood(?) the  first necessary steps!? to
‘initiation?’ into/onto, the ‘individuals own!?’ inner-plane/planes. 

Ophiel,  next writes; “The whole  idea of doing Occult  work, is to clear  up, or  resolve,  your rejected parts of  your
personality and get them back into yourself and then go ahead to greater things. (As I said before, I don’t understand, the
rejection idea, and neither does anyone else, but the main idea, is to get cleared up and, no matter how many different
ways they say it, that is it.) Conversely, if you feel only a mild upheaval then proceed to try and handle it yourself and go
on with your work. So, to proceed – One method of using E-motions, often advocated by former Creative Visualization
teachers of the natural type, was to instruct the student to “FEEL,” (without telling him “how” to “feel”) that he already
had the thing desired, and was using it, AND, he would get it in due time.” End quote.

“As I said before,  I don’t understand, the rejection idea,  and neither does anyone else.” The present writer,  is at  a
‘complete loss?’ over this statement, from Ophiel? The present writer, not only ‘understands?’ but presents about it, in
every ‘file/folder,’ that they, the present writer, ever presents, and this file/folder, is no different!? The Present Writer =
does understand, the rejection idea, and so did, the worthy ancients!? It is, basically, all to ‘do with?’ the/your = #3, Ego
Body!? who is/has been, poorly trained!? And a ‘complete lack?’  of understanding/knowledge, of/for,  the/your,  #1,
Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane? But…! we shall read shortly = THE WORTHY ANCIENTS!? NOT ONLY ‘KNEW?’
‘UNDERSTOOD?’ THEY ALSO ‘WROTE ABOUT IT!?’  It  was the later  ‘donkeys!?’ who made it,  #1,  Evil!?  =
Rejection = Adverse; Opposed; Obstacle = Element Earth = FORCE!? – FROM WHICH!? = YOU!? #0, WORK-OFF-
OF-FROM!?

Context; So, to proceed – One method of using, your, E-motions is =  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ings, often advocated, by,
former Creative Visualization teachers, of the natural type, was to instruct the student to “FEEL,” (without telling him
“how/where?” what plane/level to “feel on?”) that he  already had the thing desired, and was, #0, using it,  AND, he
would get it, in due time. Which, was/is, of course = ABSOLUTELY USELESS!? IF,  YOU, THE READER, ARE
NOT! OF THE ‘NATURAL TYPE!? 

Ophiel then writes; “This idea seems to have originally been based upon one of the few genuine portions of the “new
testament.” The purported Jesus is supposed to have said – “Whatever things you want believe that you have them
already and you will have them.” (Therefore, I say unto you what things so ever ye desire, when ye pray, believe ye have
received them and ye shall have them. MARK 11:23 ERV.)” End quote.

Context; Therefore, I say, unto you, Conscious, as a ness; that whatsoever, things, Ye, #0, desire, when Ye = Conscious,
as a, ness = Pray (to ask earnestly, as if/as though, in a ‘Court of Law,’) in/on the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane,
believe = psychically-tactilely-feel, that Ye, Conscious, as a, #1, ness, have received them and Ye = #0, shall have them.

Why persons, especially, those who confess, to being ‘occult?’ type, persons,  do not understand? that the above, ole
crazy book, quote,  is talking about; TWO ENTIRELY SEPARATE/DIFFERENT PLANES? is beyond, the present
writer, but…! they ‘accept it,’ because that is/this is, just the ‘way,’ that it is. 

Ophiel continues; “Of course, the above directions are greatly simplified, and are directed to those, who are able to work
the Creative Visualization Laws naturally. You now know, from your reading study of this book, that there are many
other factors-laws to be taken into consideration to make Creative Visualizations work than the use of just one single
Law.  However,  these other  Factor-Laws you now already know and knowing them you can use them all  together
properly and get the best reinforced use out of all of them.” End quote.



Context;  The  above  directions,  were  for  those  who were/are  ‘initiated?’  and  are  able  to  ‘work/operate,’  the/their,
Creative Visualisation Laws, naturally? Which pre-supposes? Why? would anyone, who can ‘work,’ ‘operate,’ these
laws, then ‘need?’ these ‘directions?’ You are now aware/awake, to the various ‘individuality,’ of/for each plane, and
that ‘each plane = works/operates, differently? From each of the ‘other,’ planes!? 

You, however, in/on this particular, Ophiel Magic Group, are now aware/awake, to the, running order, of the planes; #0;
#1; #2; #4; #5 and #6!? And some, of the/their ‘ways,’ of operate-ing/work-ing/behave-ing. But, for many, of you, this is
just ‘information?’ like a, world atlas!? Like a guide book!? Like another one of those ‘endless?’ occult books? Which,
has  no  ‘depth,’  for  you,  the  reader/occultist(?)  because  of  un-known/un-conscious/un-aware  and  un-awake,
circumstances, which is/are, detracting you, Conscious, as a ‘ness,’ from achieve-ing, your goals/aims.

Try this;

#6, Akasha = Change.

#5, Archetypal = Foundation.

#4, Astral = Emote.

#2, Etheric = Reflect.

#1, Malkuth = Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing.

What  is  missing? from the above? Well,  there  you go!  Why? because  it,  piggy-backs? in/on  Conscious,  when it,
Conscious, is in, a ‘ness,’ state/condition!? What does it do? when it, piggy-backs? in/on Conscious, when it, Conscious,
is  in,  a  ‘ness,’  state/condition!?  It  ‘tells,  on  you!  Conscious?  #1,  Until,  Conscious,  as  a  ‘ness,’  reaches,  the
‘upper/higher,’ Astral Plane, where it, merges? With Conscious? Here it is, from Ophiel, from the same book; Creative
Visualisation, his chapter; Law of The Barrier;

“For those of you who are “ready” for “higher things” I will drop a big fat juicy hint as to what Illumination really is –
becoming a Master, becoming an Adept, BECOMING LIKE A GOD, means the two minds fuse into one! Enough said!
Some further information is available - contact me thru address in book.” End quote.

When Ophiel, writes = two-minds fuse, he is refer-ing, to Conscious, being the ‘one-ness?’ there is/are, no ‘sub-ness,’ of
Conscious,  work-ing/operate-ing/happen-ing,  without  Conscious,  know-ing!  But…!  the  ‘average?’  occultist(?)
can’t/doesn’t/won’t, be able to ‘pick-up?’ that Ophiel,  does-not! refer, to his, #3, Ego, Present Incarnation, Personality
Body!? (Which is ‘not!’ a ‘body?’ but a ‘Construct?’ Which ‘feels nothing!?’ It = #3, only, Observes or Judges!?)
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Thank you.


