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1 of 1 The Malkuth Tree. 2024

It was pointed out, a long time ago, that each ‘sphere?’ in/on, our tree/map, are ‘all,’ #1, Malkuth, spheres? The reason,
of for this, is that we – Conscious, as a ‘ness,’ are? Element Earth, ‘beings?’ thus, we have: 

Malkuth of, Kether.

Malkuth of, Chokmah.

Malkuth of, Binah.

Malkuth of, Geburah.

Malkuth of, Chesed.

Malkuth of, Tiphareth.

Malkuth of, Hod.

Malkuth of, Netzach.

Malkuth of, Yesod.

Malkuth of, Malkuth.

In the Tree of Malkuth, above, Kether is expressed, as; Yod = the ‘closed-hand-symbol?’ for the; Elemental-Earth-of-
Kether.

In the Tree of Malkuth, below, Yesod is, expressed, as; Kaph = the ‘open-hand-symbol?’ for the Earth-of-Yesod. 

The ‘idea?’ being = You – Conscious, as a ‘ness,’ = Grasp! Grip! Grab! Clasp! Hold? – that, which you desire/visualise,
want-ing, need-ing, brood-ing on!? 

Here it is, from Ophiel, his book; Caballa Magic, his chapter; 

“(Hah! you ask where is Earth, the elemental force of Earth? In the case of this diagram, the elements change-pass from
one element to another, and as a rule, the element below can be considered “earth,” to the element above . The line of
change can also be considered the element Akasha, which is not shown here. When you make your diagrams, you can
insert the Akasha symbol on the line if you wish and colour it Indigo.)” End quote.

So, Physical Earth, is the ‘Earth Element,’ to the ‘Element of Earth,’ above, over, higher, before and in-front-of, the
Physical Earth, we use, in the form of = use; use-ing; uses; used!? below, under, lower, after, and behind.

Kaph – is used, in the expression, of = pre-position of, in things = as like; as though; as if; similar to; as in, ex-press-on
of = the visualised image of? the visualised picture of? The Visualisation of = Yesod!

He  – with the ‘dot,’ underneath, at the end, is used, in the expression of = position of, things = that are inert; immobile;h̩
immobile; fixed; set; put; placed, simply by/with, placing a ‘dot,’ underneath, to indicate ‘final/end/finish/all,’ Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane!? Malkuth Earth, the invisible, secret, silent, hidden, un-seen, plane? IS! A/AN = INNER-PLANE!?

The ‘first plane!?’ up/in!? = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane! 

The ‘last plane!?’ down/out!? = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!

Both, egg, and chair ‘exercises,’ show, reveal this, the above, to you, #0 &+ #3!? = Conscious, as a #1, ness!? 

Instead of all the = Kether/Crown shite!? Top to Bottom!? Try seeing/look-ing, at the/your, Tree/Map = SPRING-ING,
UP/OUT!? = FROM!? THE/YOUR = #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!? AND WHEN YOU – CONSCIOUS,
AS A ‘NESS?’ ARE FINALLY, THERE = #1, MALKUTH!? DO AS OPHIEL, WRITES, IN HIS FIRST LESSON, OF
HIS,  CORRESPONDENCE  COURSE,  IN  ASTRAL  PROJECTION  =  ABOUT-TURN!  ABOUT-FACE?  =  AND
LOOK BACK!? LOOK DOWN/OUT!? – TO YOU! = #0!? = Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic Chair, exercises. (Capitols
are for ‘emphasis,’ only.) 

ONCE YOU ‘MAKE-IT?’ ‘MANAGE IT?’ #0, TO #1!? = YOU CAN THEN! THEN? TRANSFER? PROJECT? = TO
THE/YOUR = #2, ETHERIC PLANE!? = Kaph – open-hand/palm –  assume = in things = as like; as though; as if;
similar to; as in, ex-press-on of = the image of? the picture of? = Visualise-ation = Yesod! = Yod-Heh-Vav-He . Theh̩



reason ‘why?’ this can come about, is  because? there is  NO!? Yod-Heh-Vav-He  =  h̩ IN/ON!? The/your = #0, Outer,
outer, physically, physical plane!?

You – Conscious, as #0, ness, can only, only = use; use-ing; uses; used? In/on the/your, #0, Outer, outer, physically
physical Plane!? – THIS IS MOMENTOUS, NEWS!? THIS IS – GOOD NEWS!? 

This means, that you, Conscious, as a, #0, ness – are free!? – YOU, #0. ONLY HAVE TO = USE!? Big Occult? there!?
Once you/if you? are able to grasp, the meaning, of the/this, your – freedom? Then it will be, because? you, Conscious,
have ‘control?’ of the/your, #3, Ego Body!?

The Outer Plane to/for the, Pleroma = IS! THE PLANE OF AKASHA!?

The Outer Plane to/for the, Akasha = IS! THE PLANE OF AIR!?

The Outer Plane to/for the, Air = IS! THE PLANE OF FIRE!?

The Outer Plane to/for the, Fire = IS! THE PLANE OF WATER!?

The Outer Plane to/for the, Water = IS! THE PLANE OF EARTH!?

The Outer Plane to/for the, Earth = IS! THE PLANE OF PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL!?

One of the many ‘ways,’ that the present writer, explains these things, to themselves, as they meditate, on them, and to
‘have conversations?’ with the/their, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane Self, was/is, to put/place a ‘Sphere,’ above; over;
higher; before and in front of = Kether? And, to put/place a ‘Sphere,’ below of = Malkuth? 

Thus, the ‘Tree?’ was now, suspended? Between?

HEAVEN = PLEROMA (Gnostic ‘Full-ness,’ of Light!?)

EARTH = PHYSICAL (Gnostic ‘Hell,’ of Light!?)

Thus, you would have; Kether = the Malkuth of another Tree!?

Thus, you would have; Malkuth = the Kether of another Tree!?

Thus, you would have; Demiurge = the Half-God!? of a Tree!?

Thus, you would have? a/an – entire tree, of = ELEMENT!? EARTH? AS?? A/AN ELEMENTAL TREE!?

Element = essence of; principle of; substance of;

Elemental = pertaining to, the ‘powers of?’ ‘abilities of?’

One of  the ‘ways?’  to fall-off?  disappear? From a ‘conscious?’ as a  ‘ness?’  it  to ‘enter,’  the Light? and to  know?
understand? that the ‘Light!?’ is – Reflective? And Goes From/Comes From!? = Source!? to Infinity!? Thus! we have;

FROM!? = DARK-NESS? BLACK-NESS? BLIND-NESS? = Let there be!?

TO!?  = DARK-NESS? BLACK-NESS? BLIND-NESS? = And there was!?

As already pointed out, someone? somewhere? not only knew this, several tens of thousands, of years ago, but…!? they
also,  taught it?  This must have been  done, at  a  very early time,  in the development  of  the human species,  as the
‘nucleus,’ state/stage, of the human species, as evidenced, in the commonality of the ‘Mythos,’ as presented by, the
indigenous, Myths in Common, through symbolic; ritual, in all human cultures, everywhere, on the planet. One of the,
seminal books, of/for this ‘commonality,’ is that of; Arnold van Gennep = THE RITES OF PASSAGE!? Which is highly
recommended, for the understanding, of/for = LIMINALITY!? = Lines, to be ‘crossed?’ Boundaries, to be ‘traversed?’
Limits, to be ‘dared?’ = The ‘Hero?’ ‘Saviour?’ theme? = THE CULT? OF THE ‘INDIVIDUAL?’ 

Your parents, aren’t your ‘real?’ parents?

You have a ‘Destiny?’ Luke?

You are a ‘Wizard?’ Harry?

You are a ‘Hero?’ my Child? 

You are a ‘Son/Daughter?’ of the King?



But…! First! You must ‘kill?’ the ‘Dark-one?’ the ‘Hidden-one?’ the ‘Secret-one!?’ the ‘Silent-one!?’ the ‘Invisible-
one!?’ the ‘Adverse-one!?’ the ‘Opposed-one!?’ the ‘Obstacle-one!?’ 

WHAT!? ARE YOU KIDDING ME!? ARE YOU SHITTING ME!? I NEVER ASKED!? FOR THIS!? 

Sorry, mate! But…! (the great ‘But…! of Magic!?) = ITS YOUR ‘DESTINY!?’

How? am I? supposed to do that? How? do I? Slay the Dark-ness? 

Its easy? but first? you must find this ‘weapon?’ 

What weapon? What’s it called? Where do I find it? 

You use!? the Magic Formula!?

Oh, aye? What’s that?

It called/named = LET THERE BE!? 

God! you talk shite!? = LET THERE BE WHAT!? 

Well, folks, the present writer thinks(?) that’s history(?) for you!? 35,000 years of it!? (or there abouts?) from cave
paintings, to the big bang!? To your front door!? 

If you read the ‘myth,’ of Psyche and Eros, you will see/read, that immediately, when Eros (the beloved?) flees the
‘scene,’ Psyche, immediately begins her ‘search?’ and through the ‘different?’ Gods (Levels,) achieves her ‘goal?’ finds,
her ‘true?’ love? and is made ‘one?’ with her in-laws = Gods!?

So! we? start out, discovering/finding,  our =  Psyche? by/with, following the = Laws; Rules; Governances, of/for her
Plane!? = Dark-ness; Black-ness; Blind-ness? = Tactile-Feel-ing = define-ing; three-dimensional-ise-ing; symbol-ise-ing.

The simplicity and ease, of these things, is/are, its undoing? This is because, they, these things(?) ‘carry no weight = are
not ‘HEAVY = K-B-D = Element Earth Principle!?’ One of the things, occult(?) things, used, when translating, Hebrew,
into Greek (Septuagint = of the seventy – 72, scribes, who translated the Hebrew book, in the Greek, language.) was
also; K-V-D – heavy with, expectancy, anticipation!?

In the Hebrew, K-B-D = is/becomes, in Arabic כ-ב-ד   = K-B-T ك-ب-د  =both mean ‘BE HEAVY!?’ thus,  in both
languages, we have = To Be Heavy = IS!? – To = Be Important; To have Honour; To have Majesty; To have Power; To
have Glory! (K-B-D = POWER – To be able! Glory – Greek = Kleos – Repute; Renown; Reputation; Fame, etc, etc.)
But, the basic noun itself, was from the ‘root word = liver, which meant/means, esoterically – INTERIOR OF? And/or =
SOUL OF? And was used(?) to ‘ex-press,’ the – Soul; Will; Emotions; of the Human Being. (In Akkadian, it is; kabtu. In

the Ugartic, it is; kbd.)

The above information, shows how wide and far, its usage was is, in Semitic Languages, if you would like read the
‘technique,’ of this/for this, as it ‘applies?’ to ‘Interior?’ then please read Ophiel’s book; The Oracle of Fortuna, and read
what he writes about, livers? For instance, In Akkadian, the word; kabattu, is used, to denote, the realm/reaction, of/for =
Violent/Sudden Emotions, and those of; Blind Passions.

In Ugaritic  text;  k-b-d,  itself,  is often paired/matched, with ‘Ib,’  as the seat/place,  of  the individuals,  feel-ings and
emotions. As in; Her liver swells with laughter; Her heart is filled with joy; Anat’s liver is with victory. In the Ugaritic
verb; k-b-d, means = to honour (Worship! – to value!) figuratively, this was to express ‘heavy?’ in its, positive aspect,
and well-being, of the individual. 

In Ugaritic text, the verb (do-ing/action,) was; kbd – heavy-ness = as in, important/more meaning = as in ‘ITS,’ object;
circumstance; things ‘value?’ – qualities; uses; advantages; applications, etc, etc – in contrast, to the ‘heavy-ness?’ to
other/comparable/similar(?) ‘ITS,’ object; circumstance; things ‘value?’ – qualities; uses; advantages; applications, etc,
etc

So, the ‘heavier?’ circumstance; object; thing = IS THE ONE(?) WITH THE = POWER? GLORY? = K-V-D!? And
‘Heavy-er?’ things, are always ‘Lower?’ are always ‘Earth?’ are always = BEHIND!?

So! We? In the west, via the Hebrew (Bible text,) via the Greek translation? Thereof? Now have, the situation, where,
the Lunatics(?) (And ‘God?’ if he(?) ever = existed!?) where the Lunatics, have taken over the Asylum, and filled(?) the
whole(?) of the/our/your = #0, Outer, outer, physically, physical, Earth Plane!? With the/their ‘masochistic,’ Patriarchal,
Shite! Dung! Crap! Excrement! So much so, that there is ‘Nothing There!?’ that is = REAL!?

For instance, In the Ole Crazy Book (Bible,) so called, because it ‘drives?’ everybody Crazy? Because they only have –
Information? Without – Technique? And is now ‘used?’ by the clever-dudes, who know how to ‘shear?’ the Flock!? Out



of the ‘faithful?’ who scream out = Let Me Kiss Your Ring? Eh? No! Don’t think so! Not today! (Or any other day! For
that matter!?)

In Hebrew, the word;  

In the ole crazy book (Bible,) The word; k-v-d( כ-ב-ך )appears 376 times, but…! unfortunately(?) for the world and the
West, in particular, it was/is, not only the ‘negative aspect,’ of this, which was/is disseminated, throughout, the world,
but…! from the early, Christian Gnostics? = IT THE/THIS ‘HEAVY-NESS!?’ = WAS MADE THE EMBODIMENT!?

OF = EVIL ?!
The ‘negativity?’ is seen, in the Ole Crazy Book, in three types/kinds of ways/expressions, of/for – k-v-d.

When not ‘functioning,’ properly, the ‘weight/heavy-ness,’ appears, in the human body, as a/an insensitivity or dull-ness
(Gnostic ‘sarkic,’ = material persons.) first type.

This, the above, leads to a person/individual, who is a ‘slave?’ to the/their ‘materially-heavy,’ passions – k-v-d = second
type.

This, has severity/consequences warfare; slavery; plague; famine; and this leads to = Burden; Impede; Weigh Down!? =
third type. 

And this, in a round-about way? leads us, back to = ADVERSE! OPPOSE! OBSTACLE!? = DEVIL SHITE!? = #1,
Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane = DARK-ness; BLACK-ness; BLIND-ness!? EVIL CRAP!?

In all of the above!? = THE/YOUR = #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE = DARK-ness; BLACK-ness; BLIND-
ness; Heavy-ness =  IS!? = The/your – Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic Chair Exercises!? And this ‘information?’ =
applied/adapted, to the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, should help/assist, you, the reader/occultist(?) in ‘ways?’
yet to show themselves, to you = #0 &+ #3.

Also,  it/this,  information, is  try  to  present,  the  idea/notion? of  just  how,  long  ago, all  this ‘stuff?’  was  going  on,
happening, taking place!? 

For instance, In the Ole Crazy Book (Bible,) so called, because it ‘drives?’ everybody Crazy? Because they only have –
Information? Without – Technique? And is now ‘used?’ by the clever-dudes, who know how to ‘shear?’ the Flock!? Out
of the ‘faithful?’ who scream out = Let Me Kiss Your Ring? Eh? No! Don’t think so! Not today! (Or any other day! For
that matter!?)

In Hebrew, the word; In the ole crazy book (Bible,) The word; k-v-d( כ-ב-ך )appears 376 times, but…! unfortunately(?)
for the world and the West, in particular, it was/is, not only the ‘negative aspect,’ of this, which was/is disseminated,
throughout, the world, but…! from the early, Christian Gnostics? = IT THE/THIS ‘HEAVY-NESS!?’ = WAS MADE

THE EMBODIMENT!? OF = EVIL ?!
The ‘negativity?’ is seen, in the Ole Crazy Book, in three types/kinds of ways/expressions, of/for – k-v-d.

When not ‘functioning,’ properly, the ‘weight/heavy-ness,’ appears, in the human body, as a/an insensitivity or dull-ness
(Gnostic ‘sarkic,’ = material persons.) first type.

This, the above, leads to a person/individual, who is a ‘slave?’ to the/their ‘materially-heavy,’ passions – k-v-d = second
type.

This, has severity/consequences warfare; slavery; plague; famine; and this leads to = Burden; Impede; Weigh Down!? =
third type. 

And this, in a round-about way? leads us, back to = ADVERSE! OPPOSE! OBSTACLE!? = DEVIL SHITE!? = #1,
Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane = DARK-ness; BLACK-ness; BLIND-ness!? EVIL CRAP!?

In all of the above!? = THE/YOUR = #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE = DARK-ness; BLACK-ness; BLIND-
ness; Heavy-ness = IS!? = The/your – Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic Chair Exercises!? 

K-b-d, is also used, in reference to God’s – heavy-ness? And, this – heavy-ness, was/is = God ‘glory?’ = kabhodh. In the
Septuagint – it, kabhodhd - is translated, as ‘doxa – Gods ‘visible?’ Light!? = #2, Etheric, and was referenced/used, for
the ‘Soul?’ ‘Spirit?’ of Man = #2, Etheric.

Now, interesting? Or not? as it may be? none of this type/kind of, history information, will make any ‘difference?’ to
your  actual,  factual,  literal  =  practice/doing?  of  the/your,  Basic  Cosmic  Egg  and/or  Basic  Chair,  exercises,  in
themselves? But…! it is, to be hoped? that it gives you, the reader, the sense of ‘Time?’ and how the ‘original?’ ideas,
based  on  practice/experience  and  application,  of  these,  things,  became  ‘corrupted?’  ‘distorted?’  ‘deformed?’  and
‘debased?’ by those who did not have ‘access?’ to any actual, factual, literal = techniques/applications?



This, situation, of ‘lost?’ was all down to the, #3, Ego Body, and  its(?) Self-Observation? Wit-ness, our present day,
ego’s? Political; Financial;  Industrial; Commercial, and the ‘cumulative consequences?’ of the bio-degradation, from
which, there is ‘no!?’ come-back/take-back!? No computer Geek, is ever, ever, going to bring back, a/any ‘extinct,’
species!? 

So! Do what you can do? and let the rest, go!? try not to ‘live?’ in the/a ‘future?’ but keep a ‘close eye?’ on the now-
present, and change things, from there. Dreaming of a Bright Future, is wonderful!? Trying to, Live? A Bright Future, is
bloody hard work!? (See/read Ophiel, for this, his vignette; Acceptance = I was not that way, at all, I worked like hell, to
get out, from under it!?) 

The present writer could do; Egyptian; Hindu; Hebrew; Greek; Norse; Polynesian; Australian, etc, etc, but it would all
be, the ‘same-thing?’ = PLANES!? Only the ‘Symbols Change!?’ Every time, a different singer? But…! Every time, the
same ole song!? Eventually, you get to a point/place(?) where you can, see past/see through, the words, to the meaning?

Here it is, from Ophiel, from his book; The Occult, his chapter; The Four Winds.

“To digress a moment – When I was writing these lines, I was in Los Angeles and, as is my custom, I dropped in at the
Manly Hall Institute on Los Feliz Boulevard. My purpose was to give them a copy of; THE ART AND PRACTICE OF
GETTING MATERIAL THINGS THROUGH CREATIVE VISUALIZATION, for their library.

They also usually have some, more or less, select second hand books for sale there. I found a little book called Aesch
Mezareph (purifying fire) by Sapere Aude which name was, as I understand it, the Latin motto name of Wynn Westcott,
an early well-known Occultist. And as I was glancing over the book I noted, on page 10, the following words – Job
chapter 37 verse 22. – TELL US THAT GOLD COMETH FROM THE NORTH!!!!

Now here is a perfect example of Occult trickery that has been used so much before.

Job  says  Gold  comes  from  the  North  –  and  as  this  statement  stands  now  that  way  the  statement  is  absolutely
meaningless, to the ordinary average person, and is maddeningly meaningless, to the beginning sincere student of the
Occult. Well, this statement will always be meaningless to the average person and also to the Occult student UNTIL HE
PICKS UP MORE OCCULT KNOWLEDGE THROUGH MEDITATION, CONTEMPLATION, AND INTUITIVE
INSPIRATION (inspiration-breath-in-breathing-air-movement and so on.) When, through the passage of time and study,
the sincere Occult student becomes more knowledgeable, he will “pick up” the missing Occult “shorthand” necessary, to
“fill out” Job’s statement, and Job’s statement will then become, “Gold” (value) comes from the Elemental Quarter of
the Elemental North!!!! (there is also a note that this Gold in Job is translated “fair weather,” the nutty translators!)” End
quote. (Capitols are, Ophiel’s.)

This, intuitive knowledge, is based on ‘Planes,’ and not!? on the ‘things?’ in/on those planes!? And one, of the ‘ways,’ is
that,  of  the/your  –  basic  cosmic  egg  and/or,  basic  chair,  exercises,  which  are,  both,  Eleme nt Earth/Hades  Plane,
exercises, thus, giving you, Conscious, as a #1, ness – access? to its = Force!?

Please note.  You don’t just,  #0, ‘do?’  the Egg/Chair  exercises,  #0 &+ #3!? You – Conscious,  also do them, in/on
the/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane!? = BUT…! IN A ‘DIFFERENT?’ DIRECTION!? 

The present writer, will forward this, reply to you, for the other members, who are in/on the list, as we are, all, in this
together and you may not be the only individual, at this place, in their occult/work.

https://ophiel.art

Thank you.


