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Here is what Ophiel, writes next, in his vignette; More Ideas About God, under review:

“A ‘method here, suggests,’ itself to me, as to how to ‘operate this DREAM CHANGE?’ but I have no more now than an
‘Idea!’ I do not think it will be ‘dangerous,’ for you, but let me ‘TEST’ it out, for the ‘Time’ being, until I have more
data, and can prepare a relatively ‘fool proof method of DOING,’ this DREAM  -  CHANGING  !!

Regarding the ‘changing of  This Dream?’ whether, as aforesaid, the ‘Dream of Life/Existence,’ is being ‘done by the
Gnostic Astral Light concept,’ or by the ‘Lesser Countenance’ or ‘both,’ I now Understand? that the ‘Changing? of the
DREAM of LIFE?’ ‘Should/must??’ be ‘done? Carefully!!!’ For the following reasons? Which please study and ‘absorb
and follow’ as I ‘feel the absence of attention to the changing of the ‘DREAM,’ or the ‘influencing,’ of the DREAM, has
made much of the ‘TROUBLE,’ regarding ‘GOD/RELIGION,’ and their ‘roles’ in our ‘Daily-lives.’” End quote.

The  present  writers,  presentation,  of/for  ‘Changing  The  Dream!?’  is  by  learning,  about  the/your,  #1,  Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane, and its: LAWS; RULES; GOVERNANCES, through the/your daily practicing/doing, of the/your,
basic cosmic egg and/or basic chair ‘exercises,’ and then, once proficient, #0, you = work-ing-off-of/from!? the/your, #1,
Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, to, the/your, #0, Outer, Physical Plane!?

Ophiel next writes; 

“I was told that, ‘WE?’ (To ‘try and make’ this complex subject as simple as I can) - Are considered …SHELLS…
(Special name; don’t let it ‘throw’ you) viz. One ‘shell’ the ‘Physical Body;’ another ‘Shell,’ the ‘Etheric Body;’ another
‘Shell’ the ‘Astral Body’; another ‘Shell’ etc, etc. ‘UP to the Top’ again. Naturally, the ‘Shell we identify’ with, is
mainly the ‘Physical Body Shell’ Also, most ‘naturally the Physical Body Shell’ is the ‘One’ which ‘bears the brunt?’ of
our ‘daily-living’ the ‘Blows of Fate.’” End quote.

Context reads, for us; 

We are told, in various ways, that we are the product(?) of the ‘various?’ layers/levels!? Through which, Conscious, as a
‘ness,’ in/on, each of the layers/levels, as a ‘ness,’ is/are; #0, body; #1, malkuth body; #2, etheric body; #4, astral body;
#5, archetypal body and #6, akashic body.

So, naturally, the  layer/level!? which we, #0, as a Conscious-ness, have to  deal-with!  is? the/our, #0, Outer,  Outer,
Physically, Physical Plane!? 

So, naturally, our #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane =  IS!? THE MOST  IMPORTANT!? PLANE; LAYER; LEVEL!?
To/of/for = US!? = #0!?

You may? And many of you do? #2, Etheric Plane = Dream!? of all the wonderful stuff, you like!? 

BUT…! UNTIL AND UNLESS!? THE/YOUR, #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE YOU!? =  BELIEVES!?
THE/YOUR, #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!? ISN’T GOING TO BE ‘CHANGE-ING!? ANY THING!?

The ‘proposed?’ way/method/technique? of/for = CHANGE-ING THE DREAM!? = IS!? – THAT OF #1, MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES PLANE = PSYCHIC-TACTILE-FEEL-ING!? 

Here now, is how Ophiel, finishes of, his vignette; More Ideas About God.

“A little far-fetched?! I ‘agree?’ - BUT! PLEASE! - Let’s take no ‘chances?’ ‘Change/Influence’ the ‘Life-Dream (er) …
‘SLOWLY’ … and… ‘CAREFULLY’… ONE ‘CHANGE? AT A TIME!’ – ‘SLOWLY AND CAREFULLY.’ Don’t
‘rock the boat’ change your ‘Life quietly?’ and ‘slowly?’ Give the ‘changes TIME??’ to ‘get? to the Physical Plane’ and
for ‘YOU! to GROW INTO THE CHANGES?’ the ‘NEW? Changes’ you ‘WANT? To ‘BRING ABOUT? in YOUR
LIFE?’” End quote. (Underlines, are Ophiel’s.)

Like any(?) normal(?) person, you, the reader/occultist(?)  already have? =  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ings!? Which, many,
many,  muppets!?  Assume/Think!?  That  they/these  =  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ings!?  =  ARE EMOTIONS!?  =  WHICH
THEY ARE NOT!? = they are? if anything!? = habits!? set-patterns!? fixed-points-to = work-off-of/from!? as you, #0,
allow/let, the/your #3, ego body!? = sleep-walk you!? conscious, as a #0, ness? through your life!? (See/read Ophie’s
vignette; Acceptance, for this ‘cocoon-ing?’)



The ‘God?’ you should be trying to ‘Contact?’ ‘Communicate?’ to/with? IS!? The/your, #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane
= Black-on-Black! Black-Astral-Light! Astral-Light AS!? Astral-Light? = AT ITS!? LOWEST POINT/PLACE/PLANE!
IS!? HADES/PERSEPHONE!? 

Psyche! = IS YOU! = IS YOU? = READING THIS MONOLOGUE!? RIGHT NOW!? 

YOU! Psyche = ARE NOT! = HADES/PERSEPHONE!? = THE, #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!?

YOU! Psyche = ARE = IN/ON!? = THE, #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE!?

Here now, is what Ophiel, writes, in his vignette; Getting Material Things; 

“To return to the conception of getting ‘material things’ through mental magic: Yes, it can be done, but the process is not
like that of waving a ‘magic wand.’ There are people who are naturally successful without inner plane help, but if you
were to examine their lives, you would find that there existed a definite pattern, both a physical pattern and a mental
pattern, that did it.

And this same type of thing is what you must embody into your life, too. In other words, - change you’re thinking! -
AND, - how many people really change their thinking? WELL! You can but try! Even changing your thinking for short
periods can have some effect for beneficial changes.

Now, how much must you change your thinking and what kind of change exactly is required? Your ‘change in thinking,’
has to be of the nature of a ‘complete reversal’ of the ‘worldly,’ and accepted manner of ‘world,’ thinking. What does
this change really mean? First, - you must stop regarding the physical plane as ‘real’ in the sense that ‘solid’ means
‘real.’ 

You must start to think of the ‘solid,’ plane, as an ‘illusion,’ something ‘counter,’ to the world’s accepted, image/idea, of
it all. Second, - you must begin to ‘think and act’ just the ‘opposite,’ of the way the world thinks and acts.” End quote.
(Underlines, are the present writers.)

Context, of where we should be, in; The Art of Contacting.

To return to the conception of getting ‘material things,’ through mental magic: Yes, it can be done, but the process is not
like that of waving a ‘magic wand.’ There are people who are naturally successful, without inner plane help, but if you
were to examine their lives, you would find that there existed a definite pattern, both a physical pattern, and a mental
pattern, that did it. And this same type of thing, a pattern, or a technique, is what you, must embody, into your life, too.

In other words, -  CHANGE!? HOW YOU! – CONSCIOUS, AS A ‘NESS,’  FEEL!? about you! - AND, - how many
people,  really  CHANGE their  FEEL-ing? WELL! You can  but  try!  Even  CHANGE-ing your  FEEL-ing,  for  short
periods, can have, some effect, for beneficial CHANGES!?

Now,  how much?  must  you  CHANGE your  FEEL-ing  and  what  kind  of  CHANGE,  exactly?  is  required?  Your
‘CHANGE in  FEEL-ing,’ has to be of the nature of a ‘complete reversal’ of the ‘worldly,’ and accepted manner, of
‘world,’ thinking. What does this, CHANGE, really mean? First, - you must, stop regarding the physical plane as ‘real’
in the sense that ‘solid’ means ‘real.’ You must start to think of the ‘solid,’ plane, as an ‘illusion,’ something ‘counter,’
to the world’s accepted, image/idea, of it all. Second, - you must begin to ‘Feel-think and act,’ just the ‘OPPOSITE,’ of
the way the world thinks and acts.

Both the Egg and Chair, exercises, are very good, exercises, for both, reversal, and opposite,  Feel-ing/Think-ing and
CHANGE-ing!? Ophiel then writes; 

“These changes require that you also strengthen your ‘inner convictions’ to match the changes and this is certainly no
easy thing to ‘Do.’ And I can offer you no real personal help to make it easier. No one but YOU can strengthen your
Inner Self. This strengthening is a process of growing and growing in spite of all setbacks and results of cycles, of ‘hopes
deferred’ and all  the screwball  tactics that make up ‘living life,’ this physical life.  I certainly don’t mean to sound
gloomy, by no means.

Actually, to understand the construction of ‘ALL’ and to master your own ‘Life LIVING’ is the greatest achievement in
the  entire  universe,  and  should  thrill  you  to  the  core  of  your  being.  And  this  achievement  is  done  through
KNOWLEDGE; KNOWLEDGE of your - Self, - KNOWLEDGE - of the ‘Machinery of the Universe,’ - And, - your
acquired Knowledge of how to ‘RUN THE MACHINERY OF THE UNIVERSE’ in regard to your own personal self.”
End quote. 

Context for us is now;



These changes require, that you, the reader/occultist(?) also strengthen your ‘inner-convictions’ to, match the changes,
you  desire,  and  this,  is  certainly  an  easy  thing  to  ‘Do.’  And  you  can/could,  make  it  easier,  by/with,  your  daily
participation, of the/your, Basic Cosmic Egg and/or, Basic Chair Exercises!? No one, but YOU! can strengthen/develop,
your Inner Self.

This strengthening, is a process of growing, and growing, in spite of all your setbacks and results of cycles, of ‘hopes
deferred,’ and all the screwball tactics, that go into, make-ing up ‘living life,’ this/your physical life. I certainly don’t
mean to sound gloomy, by no means.

Actually, to understand the construction of ‘ALL,’ and to master your own ‘Life LIVING,’ is the greatest achievement in
the  entire  universe,  and  should  thrill  you  to  the  core  of  your  being.  And  this  achievement,  is  done  through
KNOWLEDGE; KNOWLEDGE of your - Self, - KNOWLEDGE - of the ‘Machinery of the Universe,’ - And, - your
acquired Knowledge, of how to, ‘RUN THE MACHINERY OF THE UNIVERSE,’ in regard to your own personal self.

And  this,  the  above, is  precisely,  what  you  are  attempting,  in the  ‘development/enhancement,’  of  the/your,  latent;
dormant;  atrophied,  Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing!?  Beginning  with,  your  egg/chair,  exercises,  in  the  prescribed,
manner/method/way!? 

Ophiel, next writes; 

“In these few pages I cannot give, ‘ALL KNOWLEDGE.’ I aim to give out something in each writing and in time, to get
a great deal of it out. (And I am not doing this to extend the bulk of my writing, but because the scope of this material is
very large.) Please study the following basic-basic and  assimilate this knowledge into your ‘BEING.’ A great deal of
‘TRUTH’ is here given. The next Inner Plane is full of Light. This Light is the ‘SUBSTANCE,’ of the Secondary God. I
call this ‘LIGHT SUBSTANCE,’ the ‘Astral Light’ (Star Light,) (My, pet name.)” End quote.

The present writer certainly knows about the ‘bulk-writing?’ but…! all, is in/on the one/same plane = #1, Malkuth
Earth/Hades Plane, and the/your = Psychic-Tactile-Feel-ing, therein and thereof!? Please note carefully!? = THE/YOUR,
#1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane =  IS!?  STILL!? – THE SAME ASTRAL LIGHT!?  AS IS!? IN KETHER!? JUST A
‘DIFFERENT?’  INTENSITY/DENSITY!?  WHICH  MAKES  IT,  #1,  MALKUTH  EARTH,  A  LITTLE  MORE
‘TRICKY?’ TO WORK-WITH!?

DARK-LIGHT;  BLACK-LIGHT;  BLIND-LIGHT;  ADVERSE-LIGHT;  OPPOSED-LIGHT;  OBSTACLE-LIGHT!?
WITH WHICH, TO = #0, WORK-OFF-OF/FROM!? 

During your daily, practicing, of the/your, basic cosmic egg and/or, basic chair exercises = you, conscious, as a #0/#1,
ness;  ARE  COMPLEMENTING!?  EACH  OTHER!?  WORK-ING  WITH!?  EACH  OTHER!?  WORK-ING  OFF-
OF/FROM!?  EACH  OTHER!?  PARTNER-ING  EACH  OTHER!?  SHARE-ING  WITH,  EACH-OTHER!?
HARMONISE-ING WITH,  EACH OTHER!? You =  Conscious,  as  a  ‘ness,’  =  ARE LEARN-ING!?  HOW!?  TO,
PSYCHICALLY-TACTILELY-FEEL!? 

THE/YOUR = #1, MALKUTH EARTH/HADES PLANE =  IS NOT!  NOT! THE/YOUR = #0, OUTER, OUTER,
PHYSICALLY PHYSICAL PLANE!? Please start to think/feel, this way!? 

Ophiel, next writes; 

“EVERYTHING in our physical existence, is connected to, related to, concerned with, the Astral Light. For the rest of
this Vignette, I will list the names, other names, by which the Astral Light has been ‘DISCOVERED,’ and ‘NAMED,’
by occultists and metaphysicians, through and over the centuries. As each came upon this ‘Light Substance,’ in turn,
used it, and then named it, the name they gave,  depending somewhat upon the ‘QUALITY’ of the ‘Light’ used. The
following are names for the Great Agent: Prana; Holy Ghost; Elemental Forces; Cosmic Magnetism; Magnetic Fluid,
(Mesmer.) Keys of the Kingdom; Living Water; Vril; Hidden Agent; Logos, (Gnostic.) Chameleon; Flor Salis Albi,
(Flower of White Salt.) Philosopher’s Stone; Elixir of Life; Demiurge, (Greek.) Half-God; Animal Magnetism, (Mrs
Eddy = Christian Science.) Para Brahman; Absolute Substance.” End quote. (Underlines are the present writers.)

The Light, which the present writer ‘uses,’ is that of the Gnostic/Greek, ‘Demiurge/Hades, which is ‘equivalent/equated,’
to/with, the Cabalistic, Malkuth Earth.

Please take some time, to decide, for yourself, if you wish to develop/enhance, whatever, latent, dormant, atrophied =
psychic-tactile-feel-ing, abilities/powers, that you/which you, may ‘have?’  now!? (or not?)  When you have amassed
enough, practice time, with the/your, basic chair exercise, to the ‘point?’ where you, Conscious, as a ‘ness,’ are able to =
sense/feel? – THE SUBTLE = PUSH-BACK!? RESISTANCE!? ADVERSE!? OPPOSED!? = IN OTHER THINGS!? –
IN RELATION TO YOU!? = CONSCIOUS!? (See/read Ophiel’s book; Clairvoyance, his chapter; The Two Minds, for



this; PUSH-BACK!?) Ophiel finishes his vignette, under review; Getting Material Things, with this; 

“The ‘Core Knowledge’ of this Vignette is that you, ‘Learn’ about the, ‘Existence’ of the Astral Light and then, from
then on, you, take the ‘Existence’ of this Great Agent, into all your calculations. Generally speaking, you can learn how
to manipulate the Agent, so that it will not harm you and can benefit you. Learn and Work. As I have said before and
will say again and again, this life, is a very ‘queer’ thing? It is said that we ‘came’ from a free ‘space,’ and here, we are
‘confined.’ Some kind of lesson, is to be ‘Learned,’ a way of ‘escape,’ is to be found? The above is a start.” End quote. 

Context, for us, reads; The Core Knowledge, of these ‘monologues,’ is that you, the reader/occultist(?) Learn about the,
Existence, of the/your, Astral Light = AT THE/YOUR!? - #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades Plane, and then, from then on, you,
take the, Existence, of the, IMMEDIACY!? INSTANT-ACCESS!? INSTANT CONTACT!? To/with, this Great Agent,
into all your OCCULT!? calculations.

Generally  speaking,  you  can  learn  how to  manipulate  the  Agent  =  THROUGH/BY/WITH!?  THE/YOUR DAILY
PRACTICE, IN THE PRESCRIBED MANNOR/METHOD/WAY, OF THE/YOUR = Basic Cosmic Egg and/or Basic
Chair ‘exercises,’ so that it = The Demiurge/Force, will not harm you and can benefit you. Learn and Work. As I have
said before, and will say again and again, this life, is a very ‘queer’ thing? It is said that we ‘came’ from a free ‘space,’
and here, we are ‘confined.’ Some kind of lesson, is to be ‘Learned,’ a way of ‘escape,’ is to be found? Both Egg and
Chair, is/are, a start.

The  immediacy?  instant?  ACCESS!?  To  the/your,  #1,  Malkuth  Earth/Hades  Plane,  is,  for  many,  #3,  Ego  Body,
dominated persons can be, quite a ‘shock?’ to them/for them!? For many, the ‘simplicity?’ ‘ease?’ with which, they can,
begin/start, isn’t what they expect/expected? 

Imagine, finding out/discovering? That they, #0, Conscious, are a ‘projection of?’ the/their = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades
Plane = SELF!?

Imagine, finding out/discovering? That they, #0, Conscious, are a ‘projection of?’ the/their = #1, Malkuth Earth/Hades
Plane = SELF!? AND NOT!? a ‘projection of?’ the/their = #2, Etheric Plane = SELF!?

When the present writer,  pointed this out,  the above, to many, many, many!? = Would be ‘Occultists?’ they were
immediately/instantly, up in ‘arms?’ (Torches and Pitchforks, at the ready!?) for such a, heresy/sacrilege!?

The question was = if  you are  not!?  a ‘projection?’  of  the/your,  #1,  malkuth earth/hades plane!?  and  you  are!?  a
‘projection?’ of the/your, #2, etheric plane? then how come? you aren’t ‘successful?’ = financially secure? with all the
regular trappings = big house; quality cars (plural!?) multiple partners, of your taste/preference!?

The question was = if  you are  not!?  a ‘projection?’  of  the/your,  #1,  malkuth earth/hades plane!?  and  you  are!?  a
‘projection?’ of the/your, #2, etheric plane? then how come? you can’t/don’t/aren’t!? able to project/transfer, to or from?
the/your = #2, etheric plane!? 

The question was = if  you are  not!?  a ‘projection?’  of  the/your,  #1,  malkuth earth/hades plane!?  and  you  are!?  a
‘projection?’  of  the/your,  #2,  etheric  plane?  then  how come?  you  only  have!?  failed  treasure  maps/charts?  failed
talismans? Failed rituals!? how come you still work, six days a week = just to get bye!? Even if!? You were/are? the
greatest,  #2,  Etheric  Plane Projector/Projection-ist?  It  wouldn’t matter!? Even if!?  You were/are? = THE SON OF
GOD!? IT WOULDN’T MATTER!? = FOR ALL THIS! = #2,  IS! DELIVERED UNTO  ME!!!! = #1, MALKUTH
EARTH/HADES!?

CAPITOLS ARE FOR ‘EMPHASIS,’ ONLY.
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Thank you.


